Competitive Bid #WG23-18 Provision of Rental Equipment - Bid Tabulation for | Rental
5 " BIDDERS
Picked-Up Period
EQUAEMENT Coastal ¥ Coblentz Equip and Parts Inc Cowin Equipment Company Inc Sunbelt Rentalsinc | Equipment Inc Thompson Tractor Company H&E Equipment Services | Pittman Tracter Company Inc | Kastel Enterprises | Kingline Equipment | Hydra Services Inc
6" Diesel Hydraulic Pump Dail No Bid No Bid $360.00 $000.00 No Bid $380.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $470.00
wi100ft.suction hose&200ft. Weekly No Bid No Bid $960.00 $2,100.00 No Bid $1,100.00| No Bid No Bid No Bid §1,410.00
discharge hose Monthly No Bid Mo Bid $2,400.00 $7,500.00 No Bid $2,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid’ $4,230.00
2 in. Electric Submerge Pump No Bid No Bid $85.00 No Bid $85.00 $130.00 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid $115.00
wi200 ft. hose Weekly No Bid No Bid $165.00] No Bid $140.00 $385.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $345.00
Monthly No Bid No Bid $375.00 No Bid $205.00 $855.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.035.00
Mud Pump Daily Mo Bid No Bid $1 A_D.OE No Bid $60.00 $140.00 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00]
Weekly No Bid No Bid $305.00/ No Bid $150.00 $410.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid $150.00
Monthly Mo Bid No Bid No Bid $675.00! No Bid $1,215.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $450.00
12 ft. Wood Grinder w/ Operator Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid
Powered by Diesel, Minimum Reach 27" Week No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
w/Capabilities of lifting 5000 Ibs. Monthly Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Tub Grinder No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No mj Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
Tub Grinder No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid i No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tub Grinder No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o g_ No Bid
Bandit Model 1880 Wood Chipper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $485.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ar equal Nao Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| $1,211.00 No Bid No Bid No mﬂ No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,880.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Curtain Bumner 30ft. No Bid No Bid $680.00 $600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $685.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid $1,800.00 $1,400.00| No Bid No Bid| No Bid $1,585.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid $4,500.00 §3,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,405.00 No B No Bid No Bid
CP3200HD
3500 Watl Honda Generalor Nao Bid No Bid No Bid $100.00 No Bid $40.00 $90.00 Mo Bid Mo Bid Nao Bid
ar equal Nao Bid No Bid No Bid $130.00{ No Bid $115.00 $270.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Na Bid No Bid No Bid $330.00] No Bid $335.00 §575.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAT XQ230 Emergency Standby Generatar No Bid No Bid $1,365.00 No Bid No Bid $1,085.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid $3,420.00 No Bid No Bid $2,725.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid $8,538.00 No Bid No Bid $6,795.00 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid
Diesel Powered Light Plants Daily No Bid $0.00 $120.00 100.00| $150.00 $150.00 No Bid $80.00 No Bid
wifour 1000 walt Metal Halide Weekly No Bid $0.00] $255.00 300.00 $280.00 $300.00 No Bid $230.00 No Bid
Flood Lights Monthly No Bid $0.00 $515.00 700.00] $560.00 $625.00 No Bid $600.00 No Bid No Bid
Magnum
285 CFM Diesel Powered Air | Daity No Bid No Bid $315.00 No Bid $248.00 $270.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Compressor w/100 ft. of 1 in. air Weekly No Bid No Bid $645.00 No Bid $545.00 $770.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
hoses or equal Monthly Nao Bid No Bid $1,410.00 No Bid $1,430.00 $1,665.00) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sullalr
Gas Powered Portable Welding No Bid No Bid No Bid $160.00 No Bid No Bid $130.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Machine - Medium Duty No Bid No Bid| No Bid $325.00] No Bid No Bid $315.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $725.00 No Bid No Bid $625.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Miller Bobeat 250
40 fi. Towable Bucket Lift Dail §200.00 No Bid No Bid 5300.00 No Bid $220.00 $420.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Weekly $500.00 No Bid No Bid $825.00' No Bid $520.00 $1,035.00 No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly $1,445.00 No Bid No Bid $1,700.00 No g_ $1,470.00 $2,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Genls TZ-50|
Toyota Model 7FGU25 Farklift $200.00 No Bid No Bid $215.00 $185.00 $330.00 $250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weskly $500.00 No Bid No Bid $425.00 $530.00 $780.00 $615.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manthly $1,300.00 No Bid No Bid §1,265.00 $1,325.00 $1,890.00 $1,225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Doosan G25|
LP Gas Power Forklift Daily $200.00 No Bid No Bid $215.00 $185.00 No Bid $250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly $500.00 No Bid No Bid $425.00 $530.00 No Bid $615.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
Monthly $1,300.00 No Bid No Bid $1,265.00 §1,325.00 No Bid §1,225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Doosan G25|
32" Scissor Lift Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $210.00' $165.00 $173.00 $250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $425.00 $335.00 $315.00 $475.00 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid §775.00 $1,500.00 $941.00 $B850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Genle G53246|
Trencher Daily No Bid Ne Bid No Bid $170.00 No Bid §103.00 $235.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available wiprice Weekl No Bid No Bid No Bid $515.00 No Bid $446.00 $650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manthly No Bid Ne Bid No Bid $1,225.00 No Bid $1,049.00 $1,450.00 No .mlz_— No Bid No Bid
Siza 24 ‘Walk-Bohind DitohWitch C18X] |
Trencher No Bid No Bid No Bid §205.00 No Bid $500.00 $300.00! No g_ No Bid No Bid No Bid




List varfous skzas avallable wipriee

Ne Bid] Bl $616.00 No Bid] $756.00 $1,800.00 Ne Bid Ne Bld No Bid No Bkl
No E_ o Bid §1,375.00 He Bid $1,830,00 $2,200.00 No Bid Ne Bld No Bid No Bid
Slzo 36 Rido-On DitchWiteh R4
Trencher No Bid No Bl $375.00 No Bld No 8d No Bid No Bid No Bid! Na Bid No Bl
List varous sizes avallable wiprice No Bid No Bld $525.00 o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bd $1,376,00 No Bid No Bl Ne Bld No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bl
Sizo 43
Florizontal Diresticnal Bering Machine o Bld o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Rid No Bld No Bid Mo Bld No Bid
LIst various sizes available wiprice o Bld o Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No B No Bid No BIid Na Bid No Bid
o Bk lo Bld HNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bl No Bid No B No Bld Mo 8id
Horizontal Diresticnal Bering Machine No Bid lo Bld Ne Bid No Bid No Bkl o Bid No Bd No Bld o Bid No Bid Mo Bid
Llst varlous sizes available wiprice No Bid o Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid o BRI No Bid No BId o Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid o Bld Ne Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bld o Bid No Bid No Bid
Horizonlal Directicnal Boring Machine No Bid No Bid No B No Bid No Bld o Bid No Bid Ne Bld No Bid No Bid
Llst varlous sizes avafiable wiprica No Bid No Bd Ne Bl NoBid o Bl o Bid No Bld No Bld No @_ o Bkl
No Bid No Bid Ne BK o Bl o B 5 B No B Ne Bl No B o Bid
Diess| Powsred Knuckla Boom, Truck-8' No Bid No Bid o Bl No Bld No Bid o Bld Ne Bid No Bld
Long 24 CU Yard with Bam Dcor Tailgale No Bld No Bid o Bkl No Bld No Bld o Bk No Bid No Bd
HBoom Rotatlon 280 dg by Hydraulic Malor No Bid Mo Bid o Bl No Bld No Bid o Bid No BId No Bld
Mack Tri-Axda 21 Yard Dump Tk Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bld Na Bld No Bld
or mn_ri_ No B No Bl No Bid No Bld No Bld No Bid No Bid
No Bl Mo Big No Bid No Bld No Bld Mo Bid Na Bid
Freightfiner Single Axle 8 Yard Dump o Bk No Bl No Bid o Bid N Bid| No Bid No Bld Ma Sid
Truck or equal o Bld Mo Bk No Bld No Bid Ne Eid No Bid HNo Bld No Bid
o B No Bl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Rid Ne Bid
Mack Tandum Axle 14 Yard Dump o Bl No Bl No Bld No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bld o Bid
Truck or equal o Bid No Bk Mo %_ No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bd c Bld
o Bl No Bld No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid o Sid
Volva A250- 26 lon 6x8 Articulated No Bl No Bl 1,460.00 $2,500.00 No Bid $1,810.00 No Bid $1,205,00]
Off Read Truck or equal o Bid Na Bl § $8,200,00 Mo Bid $4.762.00 No Bid $3,605.00
No B Ne B $8,500.00 $13,950.00 $11,532.00] Na Bid $6,695.00
Doosan DAZD| GAT725128 Ton 828
Frakihlliner M2 108 with 10t Dump Body No Bid Ne Bid Ma B No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid o Bld o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
or equal No B Ne Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid Mo Bld No Bid No Bld a Bid No Bid No Bid
Na Bld Ne Bi No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid Mo Bid
Canga Truck 26ft. Extended Lengih Box Truck No Bl Ne Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bld o Bid o Bid Mo Bid
r equal No Bid o BId] No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bld o Bid No Bid No Bid
Ne Bld o Bld| No Bid Mo Bid No _Bid No Bid o Bld No Bid No Bid
Water Truck - 2000 Gallon Capacity Datly o Bid o Bld $540.00/ $400.00 o Bid $500.00 $475.00 $495.00 o Bl o Bl No Bid
or equal Weelly Ne Bid e Bld $4,440,00 $1.000.00 $1,5610.00 $1,600,60 $985.00 lo Bld lo Bld No Bid
Menthiy Ne Bid Ne Bld $3,600,00 $2,250.00] $3.650.00 $3,650,00 $2,806.00] o Bid [0 Bid o Bi
Water Wagon - 600 Galon Capacity | Daily No Bid o Bkl Ne Bl 150,00 No Bld o Bld o Bld o Bl
or equal Weekly Ne Bid o Biel No Bid 410,00 No Bid jo Bld o Bid o Bid
Monih| Ne Bid o Bld No 84 Ne Bid 060.00 No Bld o Bld Mo Bld o Bid
MuitlGalp WISC
938K Rubber Tire Loader w/4 way Buckat Daily | $780,00 $600.00 $700.00 $700.00 $1,130.00 o Bid $655.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
wi2,5 ou, yd, mulipurpose Bucket Weekly $2,195.00] $2,400.00 $2400.00 $2,000.00 $2,840.00 o Bld $1,395.00 No Bl No Bid Ne Bid
or egual Monithly $5,060,00] $6,000,00/ $7,000.00 §5,000.00 57,380.60 o Bld 54,268.00 No Bl No Bid No Bid
Doosan DL20% Loodan OL250 Hitachl Zyf18a
Cat 868K Front End Loader or equal Dally o Bid $1,430.00| $1,500.00 $850,00 $1,740,00 No Bid 1,085.00 No Bid No ﬁ Nao Bld
Weekly o BK $3,800.00] $4,000.C0 $2,600.00 $4,340.00 No Bld 2,045,00 Ne Bid No Bl Mo Bid
Monthiy o BK $6,500,00) $11,500.0 $6,500,00 $10,510.00) Ne Bid 7,895.00 Ne Bid No mﬁ_ Ne Bid
Doosan DL3&0 Hitachl ZWaie
Caterpillar 8630 Track Loader wilh Dally s Bid o Bl $1,130.00) No Bid No Bi No Bid No Bl No Bid No Bid .Na Bid No B
multipuiposs bucket or equal Waekly & Bld o Bld! $3,000.00 $4,000.00 Mo Bid No 8id Ne Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bl No Bid |
Monlhiy s Bid o Bld $7,500,00 $42,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bl No Bid
Bobeat T870 Track Loader wihigh capacily Dafly $480.00] No Bid $440,00 $500,00 No Bid No Pid $500,00 o Bld No Bld $660.00 No Bid
Hydraulle Pump with attachments or equal Weekly $1,520.00 No Bid $1,180.00 $1,000.001 Mo Bid Ne Bid 51,400.00 jo Bld la Bid $1,100.00 No Bid
Monthiy $3,020.00) No Bid $2,850,00 $3,000,00] No B Ne Pid $3,200,00] o Bld o Bid $2.750.00 Na Bid
Kuhola S8ULA7| Kubota Haw Kolland G345 High Flaw| _
I
Cat 336GC Excavalor wiThumb and AIC | Dafly $1.015.00 No Bid 1,430.00 $676.00 $1,180.00 1,880.00 1,700.00 1,496.00 No Bl No Bid o E
or equal Weekly No Bid 3,800.00 $4,000.00 $3.440.00 4,680.00 $4,500.00 9,465.00 No Bid N Bid No Bid|
Monthiy No Bid 9,600.00 $10,000.00 $8,580,00 $11,348.00 §10,600.00 8,765.00 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
Doosan DX360 John Dosra 260
Cat 320E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C Daily No Bid +,160.00] $1,230.00 $050.00 1,580.00 o Bid $095.00 We Bld No Bid No Bld
or equal Weakly $2,626.00) No Bid 2,060.00/ $3,100.00 $3,000,00 3,960.60 No Bld $2,005,00 No Bld No Bid Mo Bld
Wonthiy $8,440.00| No Bid 7,700.00] $8,00C.00 $3,000,00 6,579.00 Ne Bid $7,405,00 No Bid No Bid No Bld
Doosan 0X300 Docsan DX300
Cat 324E Excavator w/Thumb and AC Dally $730.00 No BK $1,040.00 $1,230,00 $624,00 $1,450,00 No Bld $795.00 No Bid Na @_ No Bkt
or squal Weekly $2,220.00| No Bl $2,760.00 $3,100.00 $2,640.00 $2,610,00] No Bl $1,805,00] No Bid No B No Bid|




Monthiy $5,625.00 No Bld $6,000.00 $8,000.00 $6,600.00 $5,742.00 No BId $5,495.00] No Bid Na Bid
Coosan DX225 Donsan DX25E
Cal 322 Rubber Tire Excavater or equal Daily. No Bl No Bld No 8id No Bid No Bid e Bld Ne Bld No Bld MNa Bid
Weekl No Bid Ne Bl No Bld No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid
Menthly No Bid No Bld No Bl No Bid No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bld No B1d No Bid
XL4100 Gradall or eqqual Daily No Bid No Bid Ne Bld No Bid| Ne Bid Mo B Na Bld o Bid No Bld
Weekl No B Mo Bid MNe Bk No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid Na Bld
Menthly No Bid Ne B o Bld No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid o Bld Nao Bl
Cat 320 Long Reach Excavalor with AJC | Daily No Bid o Bkl 1,200.00 $1,100.00 $2,200.00| No Bld o Sid lo Bid
or equa) €0 ft, reach Wee No Bl o Bidd $3,600.00 $3,200.00 $6,720.00 No Bld o Bid No Bid
Monthiy No B o Bid $.500,00 $5.500.00 $13,857.0 $41,370.00 Mo Bid o Bl No Bid
Doczan DX265US-30 Samy SY235CLR
Cat 249 Excavalor Loader with multipurpose Daly o Bid $1,580,00 $2,500.00 o Bld $2,760.00 la Bid Ne Bld No Bid
buckst or equal Weekly o Bid $4,200,00 §4,600.00 o Bid ,870.00 o B Ne Bid No Bid
Monthiy o Bid o Bl $10,500,00 $12.500.00/ o Bid $16 Eacc_ o Bk No Bid Ne Bid
Ditch Cleaning Buckel {for Excavator) Mo Bid No BId o Bid $55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No B
No Bid Mo Bld o Bil $200.00/ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid
No Bld No Bld o Bki $410.00 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No BId No Blld
Cat 12M Malor Grader or equal No Bid Nao Bld No Bi No Bid $1,680.00 1,250.00 No Bid Na Bld Mo Bld
No Bl No Bid No Bid No Bl $4,180,00 3,150,001 No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bld No Bid Ne Bid Ne wﬁ_ $10,157.00 5,750.00 No Bl Neo Bid Na Bld
Sany il .
Cat 120 Mator Grader with Front No Bid No Bld Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid lo Bld Mo B
Blade or egual No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid o Bl Ho Bid No Bld No Bid
No Bl No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bl No Rid No B¢ ko BM
CAT 140M Moter Grader or squal No B $1,500.00 Neo Bid $1,680.00 $1,850.00 No Bld o Bkl No Bid No Bid
No Pid $3,600,00) Mo Bid $4,180.00| $5,100,00 No Bid o Bidl No Bid No Bid
No B No Bld| $8,000.00 No Bid $10,157.00 No Bld lo Bid Mo Bid No Bid
CAT 140M Moter Grader with Front No Bl No Bfd No B i No Bkl No Big o Bid o Bld Mo Bid No BK
Blade or egual No Bid No Bi| No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bld o Bld Nao Bid No Bl
No Bki No mi_ No Bid No Bid Mo Bld o Bld lo Bid No Bid o Bld
Cat DBK LGP Dozt or equal with Straighl Blade No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,200.60 No Bid No 81d o Bld No Bl o Bid
No Blg No Bid No B No Bid 3,160,00 No Bid No Bld o Bld o Bld No Bid
No Sk No Bid No 8id Mo Bid 7,790.00] No Bid No Bid 2 Bid o Bid Ma Bld
Cat DBK LGP Dozar or aqual with Titt Blade Mo Bid No Bid $1,000,00 No B $1,260.00 Ne Bl $065.00 5 Bld No Bld No Bld
Ne Bid §2,100,00 No Bid 50,00 No Bld $2,045.00 o Bld No Bid Ne Bld
No Bid §5,700.00 No Bid| $7,700.00 e Bid $7,266.00 No Bl No Bid No Bid
Cat D8 LGP Dozeror &qual with Stright Rlade, Mo fild No Bid $1,000.00 No Bid $2,080.00 o Bid No B Ne Bld No Bid No Bid
and A/C, Auto Reversing Fan No Bid ho Bid $2,100,00 No Bid $5,220,00 o Bid Na Bd No Bld No Bid o Bid
No Bl Mo Bid $5,200.00 No Eid $412,020.00 o Bid ha Bid o Bid No Bid o Bid
Cat D4 LGP Dozer with 6-way Angle Blade or No Bld Me Bid §1,000,00 $1.260,00] 1,400.00 §645,00 No Bld No Bid No Bid
equal with Cab and AIC No Bl No B $2,600,00 $3.150.00 3,000.00 $1,485.00] No Bld No Bid No @_
Ne Bid No Bl $5,800.00 §7,790.00 7,685.00 $4,395.00] Ho Bl No Bl No Bid
Jehn Casra 450 LOP
Cat 4165 Back Hoe or equal No Bid No Bid $650.00 $285.00; 342 $345.00 No B No @_ Na Bid
Ne Bl No Bid $1,000.00] $720.00 $1,026 $695.00| No B No Bid No Bid
Ne Bid No Bid $2,176.00] $1,615.00 52,00 Al_ 51,595.00 No B No Bid No Bid
Lasa EHONEP
Gat 623H - 1810 23 cu. yd. capacky No Bld o Bid No Bid No Bid o BId No B No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal No Bid o Bid No Bld No Bld o Bld No Bld Na Bid No Bid No Bld Mo Bid
No Bl No Bid No Bd o Bld No B zn_MI_ No Bid No Bld No BId
Puli behind Tractor Scraper No Bid iNo Bld No Bid NoBld No Bld o Bid Mo Bld Mo Bld
B au. yd. capacily or equal No Bid No Bld| No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bld No Bld No Bid
No Bid Ne Bid Mo Bid No Bid Ne Bld o Bid No B No Bl
4 - § Ton Steel Whesl Roller wicompaclion $420.00 No Bid $510.00 §420,00] No Bd $625,00] §345.00 No Bid No Bid| No Bld
width of 66 in. of equal $1,350.00 Mo Bid $1,360.00 $1,200.00 No Bk $1,500.00 $0845.00 No Bld o Bid No Bid
$3,940.00 Mo Bl $2,400,00 5261500 No Bid $3,500.00 $2,845.00] Ho m|_ No Bid Na Bid
Bekel SV400 BOMAG BW177D| Oynapaa GG 4200¥1
8-10 Tan Steel Wheel Rollar wicempaction No B $630,00 $505,00 No Pild $725.00 $495.00 No Bid] No Bid o mm_
width of B4 in. or equal No Bl $1,680.00 $4,390.00 Ne Bid $1,960.00 $1,195.00] No Bk No Bid o Bid
No Bid $4,200,00 $2,975.00 No Pl $4,700.00 $3,495.00] No Bk No Bid o E_
Dynapac GCB200Y4
12 Tan Rubker Tire Reller No Bid $627.00] o Bld $665,00 No B Na Bid No Bid
Na Bid $1437.00 o Bld $1,085,00 No Bld No Bld No Bid!
MNo Bid $4872.00 o Bidt No Bd §4,45 Nao Bld No Bld No Bid
Dynepac GP 1200
Cal GP 44 Sheepfoal Reller Da] No Bid $440.00/ $505.00 $510.00 $625.00 $490,00/ No Bid o Bid No Bid
wiblade or equal Weekl No Bid $1,180.00 §1,390.00 $1,450.00 $1,600.00 $1,145.00 No Bid o Bid No Bid
HMonthl No Bid $2,850.00 $2,675.00 $3,530.00 $4,150.00 $3,205.00 No Bid o Bid No Bid
BOMAG BW{77PCH-6 ynapac BA1600PD




Cal GF 74 Sheeplool Roller or equal No Bid No B $510.00 $650,00 No Bid Mo Bid §725,00 $795.00 o Bid] No Bld No Bid|
Mo Bid No Bid $1,360.00i $1,840.00 Ne Bld No Bid $2,000.00 $1,485.00 o Bid o Bld No Bid
No Bid No Bld $3,400,00 $4,850,00 No Bld No Bid $4,975,00 $3,005.00 o Bid lo Bld No Bid
BOMAG BW2{1PDH-B| Dynapac GAZST0PD
One Ton Small Steel Whesl Roller No Bid Ne Bid No Bid o Bld No Bid $270,00/ $205.00 {o Bld o Bld o Bid
ho Bld o Bl No Bid o Bld No Bld $650.00] $895.00 No Bld o Bld o Bld
ho Bid Ne Bk No Bid lo Bid No Bld $1,585.00] $1,759.00 Mo Bld 0 Bld Mo Bid
BOMAQ BWS0E-50| Dynapac £CBOCO)
Minimum 114 HP Kubata Farm Type Tracter No Bid $200.00 No Bid §675.00 No Bid © Bkl No Bld Mo Bld $500.00 No Bid!
or squal No Bld $750.00 Mo Bid $2,200.00 Mo Bl © Bid o Bl Na Bd Ne Bld $825.00 No Bld
No Bld $2100.00] No Bid $6,760.00! No B o Bld o Bld Na Bid No Bld $2,170.00 Mo Bld
130HP Massey Modal: 6713 Haw Holland 120
4 Wheel Drive Boom Mower w/Tractor Mo Bid o Bk Mo Bid $850.00 No Bid ‘o Bld No Bld o Bld Ne Bid No Bid No Bid
wi6ft, Mowar Deck 23 ft, boom reach No Bid ' Bld No Bid $2.520.00 No Bld o Ble No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No BM
Mo Bid o Bl Mo Bid $6,300.00 No Bid o Bld No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid:
Cat 20003 S5kid Steer Loader (HI-Flo) $480.00 360.00/ $375.00 Mo Bid $525.00! $500.00 o Bld No Bld §550.00( Mo Bid
T3hp or equal, Rubber Tracks §1,520.00 $1,000.00 $000,00 No Bid $1,530.00 $1,460.00 o Bld No Bid $1,100.00 No %_
$3,320.00 $2,600.00] $1,775.00 No Bid $3,600,00 $3,200.00 o Bld No B $2,750.00 No %‘
Kubota SULY? Kuhota 8YLSS Hew Hulland 34|
Cat 2288 Skki Steer Loader 50 hy No Bid $315.00] $a75.00 No Bid $230.00 $415.00 o Bid No Bld Na Bid
or equal No Bl $840.00] $895,00 No Pid $520,00 $1,100,00 o Bid No Bld Na Bid
No Bid $2,100.00 $1,775,00 Ne Bid $1,320.00 $2,200.00 o Bid No Bid Mo Bid
Kubols 8] 88,
Auger 8" - 367 bils for Skid Sleer No Bl No B $135.00 Ne Big $30.00| $50.00] o Bld $50.00] No Bid
Loader Na Bld! Mo Bid $285,00 Ne Bid $60,00] $100,00] o Bld $125.00 No Bid|
No Bld No Bid $505.00 Ne Bid $120.00 $150.00] o Bld $200.00 Mo Bid
Angle Broom for Skid Sleer o Bld No Bld Mo Bkl $90.00 $140.00/ No Bld No Bld Mo Bid
Loadsr o Bld Mo Bld No Big $180.00 $355,00 No Bld Ne Bld o Bid
o Bld Mo B No Bid $635.00 $844.00 No Bld No Bld No g_
Cold Pianner for Skki Steer Loader o BId No Bld No Bid $200.00 $260.00 No Bld Na Bld Na g_ No Bkt
o Bld No Bld No &id $400.00 $655.00/ Ne Bld No Bld No Bid No Bid
. o Bld No Bld Mo Bld §600.00) $1,630.001 No Bld No Bid Na mﬁ_ No Bid
Fotks for Skid Stesr Loader o Bld o Bld No Bld $100.00) o B $65.00 $40.00 No Bid No Bl $65.00 No B
o BId{ o Bld No Bld $200.00] o Bld $90.00 $1C0.00 No Bid No B §$160,00| ho Bid
o Bld lo Bld $400.00) o B $205.00 $300.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00 o B
Hydraulic Hammer for Skid Steer Loader $220.00 o Bid $200.00| No Bld $1568.00 $376.00 No Bld No Bld Mo Bid lo BK
$545.00 o Bld $400.00! No Bld $473.00 $760.00 No Bid No Bld Mo Bid lo Bld
$1,480.00 la Bid §600.00 No Bld §$1.010.00 $1,600.00 Ho E_ We Bid No Bid No B
Tracks for Skid Steer Loader | Daity o BId o Bid $300.00 No Bid No Bld o Bid No Bid e Bid No Bid No Bid
Weekly o Bl o Bld $800.00 No Bld No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bld
Monthly o Bld o Bld §1,150.0C No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Eﬁ No Bld
Bush Guiter for Skid Sleer Loader o Bk No 8K 145 .00 No Bid $216.00] 0 Bid Na Bid No Bid| $80.060 No Bid
3 Bid| No Bid 345.00 No Bid' $645.00] o Bld Mo Bid Mo Bld $200.00, No Bid
o Bk HNo Bid 845.00 Ne Bl $1,885.00/ o Bld No Bid Mo Bid $350.00] No Bid
Maw Holland 727
Rolary Gutter for Skid Steer Loader o Bld No Bid $500.00 No Bid No Bi No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid
o Bid No Bid $1,000.00| No Bid No Bld No Bld o Bidd No Bld No Bid
o Bld Na Bid $2,000.00 No Bid e Bid No Bld lo Bid No Bid No Bid
Portable Screening Plant Dail Nao Bid Mo Bid Na Bid No Bid Ne Bld iNe Bid No Bld Mo Bld
Model 271 or equal Weskly No Bid| No Bid Ne Bid No Bid Mo wE Ne Bid No Bld Na Bid
Morithly No Bid Mo Bid Ne Bl No Bid Ne Bld No Bid Mo Bld Ma Bld
Milling Machine | Dally Mo Bl o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid
Writgen 2000 or equivalent with cperators Weskl No Bld Mo Bid No Bl No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No B _hNoBid|
Monthly Mo Bld Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bd No B
Malddin 1750-C Asphat Spreader Daily lo Bl No Bid Ne Bid Mo Bid o Bld Mo Bid No Bid 1,950,006 No Bid
o edual Waeokly o Bld! No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid Mo Bid Na Bid 4,950.00 No Bid
Monthly b Bld No Bid Ne Big No Bid o Bl No Bid No Bl $8,850,00
Dynepas FEA7006
Cat APE5B5F Asphalt Spreader | Daily HoBld Na BM Ne Bid No Bld » Bld No Bid o Bl Mo Bid
or equsl Weakiy No Bid ha Bld No Bid No Bld o Bid No Bid o Bld No Bid
Monthly No Bid ho BK Mo Bld No Bld o Bld Mo Bid o Bl No Bid
Cat AP1055F Asphalt Spreader | Daily No Bl Na Bld Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bld Ne Bid
arequal Weekl No Bld Ne Bld No Bld Na Bid o Bid
Monthly Mo Bl No Bld Mo Bid Ne Bid No Bid
85" Trailer Mounted Hydra Platform or aqjual Daily No Bld No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
for Urder Bridga Inspection Weakly No Bid Mo Bld No Bid Ne Bid No Bld No Bid
Monthly No Bid Ho Bid Na Bid Ne Bid No Bid o Bid
AWO sefl-prapeled 24' Boom mower with |Caty o Bld Ne Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
Mulching head or equal Waeokly HNo Bld Ne Bid No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid




Monthly Mo Bl No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bld Ne Bid Mo Bld No Bid No Bld
Trimble Grade Control System GC590C 2D for Dalty o Bd o Bid o Bid N Bid o Bild o Bid No Bid o Bld
Dozets and Spectra Preclsion GL622N/GLB221R Weekly o Bl o Bl lo Bid No Bk o Bld o Bid No Bid o Bld
{dual grds) Automatlc Grade Lasers or equal Monthly o Bld o B lo Bld No Bld 2 Bid o Bid Na Bld o Bt
25 Cubk Yard Rear Loadsr Garbage Truck Daily o Bid o Bki o Bld No Bid No Bld No Bld o Bld o Bicl No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly o Bid 'o Bid No Bld Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld o Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly o Bk o Bl Mo Bld Ne Bidi No Bid Na mll_ No Bld o Bid No Bid No Bid
13 Cublc Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck DPaily No Bif o Bid No Bl No Bld No Bld o Bid No Bid Na Bld o Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid o Bid No B No Bld No Bld o Bid No Bid No BId o Bl No Bid
Monthly No Bif o Bld No Bl Mo Bld No Bl o Bid No Bid No Bld o Bld No mE_
25-32 Cuble Yand Automatic Sida Loader Daily No Bl No Bld Mo Bid No Bl o Bld No Bid NoBK No Bid o E_
Garbage Truck or equal Week No Bki No Bk No Bid] Ne Bid o Bld No Bid No Bl Mo Bid o Bid
Monthly Ne Bt No Bid NoBId No Bid o Bid No %_ No 8K No Bl o Bid

EXCEPTIONS:

Sunbelt Rentals, Ine. has reviewed the documants provided, howaver noted that no tarms and eorditians ware Incluced for review. If awarded, Sunbelt reservas the right to negotfata any temms,

Purchasing netes [efms and condiions are siated in the invliaiion to Bld end Specifications - Competive Bid #WG23-18 - Proviston of Rental Equipment.

HE&E Egulprment Servkees, Inc. lstad delivary and plck-up chargas are gach way. One-tima chérge, reducing rantal rates per rental perled.

NOTES:

Coastal Machinery Equipmant cptlons are Doosan, Kubota & Sakal for varlous eglipment.

Coblantz Equipmant & Parta Co,, Inc., are only bidding on Farm Tracters; Tractors shall ba 4-Wheel Drive, Cab, A/C, Power Shuttle Transmisslon 8 Whaals \Widenad for Right of Way Mowing,

Thompson Tractor Company listed Volva A250-25 Ton 66 Articulated OFF Road Truck option as CAT 725 25 Tan 6x5.

Pittman Tracter Campany Eguigment aptions are Hitach! & Dynapac for varlous aquipmant,

Kingline Equipment listed Bobcal T870 Track Loader w/high-capacity Hydraulic pump w/attachmants or equal & CAT 29903 Skid Stear Loader (Hi-Flow)73hp ar aqual, rubber tracks optiens a5 tew Helland €345 Cab Compact Track Loader, High-Flow, Whucket and
Minfmum 114 HF Kubola Farm Type Tracter or aguivalant option as Now Holland Workmaster 120 Cab; New Holland brand for Auger 8'-36" bits for Skid Steer, New Holland Forks and Naw Halland 72" Extreme Cuty High-Flow Brush Cutter,



Competitive Bid #WG23-18 Provision of Rental Equipment - Bid Tabulation| Rental

for Delivered Period BIDDERS
EQUIPMENT ‘Coastal Machinery | CoblentzEquipment and Parts Inc Cowin Equipment Company Inc | Sunbelt Rentals Inc | Equipmentinc | Thompson Fractor Company | H&E Equipment Services | Pittman Tractor Company Inc | Kastel Enterprises | Kingline Equipment | Hydra Services Ine

6" Diesel Hydraulic Pump [Daily No Bid No Bid $460.00 $000.00 No Bid No Bid $780.00° No Bid No Bid No Bid §620.00
wil100ft suction hose&200ft Weekly No No Bid §1,160.00 $2,100.00 No Bid No Bid §1.500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,560.00
discharge hose Monthly No Bid No Bid §2,500.00 $7,500.00 No Bid $2,720.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,380.00

Delivared $250 sach way DellvaryiPickup $200 each way
2 in. Electric Submerge Pump Daily No Bid No Bid $85.00 No Bid $295.00 $280.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $265.00
wi200 ft. hose Weekly No Bid No Bid $165.00 Nao Bid $350.00 $545.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $405.00
Monthly No Bid No Bid $375.00 No Bid $415.00 $1,005.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,185.00

Dallvered $125 sach way| DalivaryiPlckup 575 aach way
Mud Pump Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $110.00 No Bid §110.00 $280.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $200.00
Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $305.00 No Bid $200.00 §560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $300.00
Manthly No No Bid No Bid $675.00] No 5460.00 §1,365.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $600.00

rod §125 oach way Dalivery/Pickup 575 sach way
12 ft. Wood Grinder w/ Operator Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Nc Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Powered by Diesel, Minimum Reach 27 Week| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
wiCapabilities of lifting 5000 Ibs. Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid
Tub Grinder Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available wiprice Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tub Grinder | Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available wiprice Weekly No Bid Nao Bid Nao Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid! No Bid No Bid
Tub Grinder [Dally No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bandit Model 1890 Wood Chipper Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid §700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Curtain Burner 30ft Dail No Bid $980.00 $600.00 Na Bid No Bid $995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $2,100.00 $1,400.00 No Bid No Bid $1,805.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly Ne Bid $4,800.00 $3,600.00 No Bid No Bid $4,795.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

rered $2,100 sach way CP3200HD

3500 Watt Honda Generator No Bid No Bid $100.00 No Bid $00.00 $240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal No Bid No Bid $130,00] No Bid $170.00 $420.00 No Bid Na Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid $330.00 No Bid $400.00 $725.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dollvared $125 each way Dalivery/Pickup 575 each way
CAT XQ230 Emergency Standby Generator Mo Bid No Bid $1,365.00 No Bid No Bid $1,465.00 Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal No Bid No Bid $3,420.00 No Bid No Bid $3,125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid $8,538.00 No Bid No Bid $7.185.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Daliverad $250 sach way)| vary/Pickup §200 sach way
Diesel Powered Light Plants No Bid No Bid 140,00 §120.00 200.00 300,00 300.00 No Bid $00.00 No Bid No Bid
wiiour 1000 watt Metal Halide No Bid No Bid 300.00 5255.00 350.00 450.00 450.00 No Bid $230.00 No Bid No Bid
Flood Lights No Bid No Bid 675.00 $515.00 800.00 725.00 775.00 No Bid $600.00 No Bid No Bid

Dallvared $150 sach way| ryiPickup S100 ssch way Magnum
285 CFM Diesel Powered Air No Bid No Bid No Bid 5315.00 No Bid 5458.00 $470.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Compressor wi00 ft. of 1 in. No Bid No Bid No Bid $645.00 No Bid $755.00 $670.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
hoses or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,410,00 No Bid §1,640.00 $1,865.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivarsd $150 sach way, livary/Pickup $100 aach way Sullair
Gas Powered Portable Welding No Bid No Bid $300.00, No Bid No Bid $330.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Machine - Medium Duty No Bid No Bid $500.00! No Bid No Bid $515.00 No Bid Na Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid $900.00 Na Bid No Bid $825.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

DalivanFickip 3190 sieh wiy Millsr
40 ft. Tawable Bucket Lift $500.00 No Bid $300.00 No Bid $430.00 $720.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$800.00 No Bid §825.00 No Bid $750.00 51,335.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$1,746.00 No Bid $1,700.00 No Bid $1,680.00 $2,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ered §125 sach way| DalivaryiPlevup $150 ach way.

Toyota Model 7FGU25 Forklift $500.00 No Bid No Bid 5215.00 5485.00 $550.00 $550.00 No Bid No Bid Na Bid
or equal Weekly $800.00 No Bid No Bid $425.00 $830.00 $1,000.00 $915.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly $1,600.00 No Bid No Bid §1,265.00 $1,625.00 $2,150.00 $1,525.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

erod §145 sach way DelivaryiPickup $150 ssch way Doosan
LP Gas Power Forklift Dai $500.00 No Bid No Bid $215.00 5485.00 No Bid $550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly $B800.00 No Bid' No Bid $425.00 $830.00 No Bid $815.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manthly $1,600.00 No Bid No Bid $1,265.00 $1,625.00 No Bid $1,525.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dailverad 5145 sach way DallvaryiPiekisp $120 aach way Dooasn
32" Scissor Lift Dai No Bid No Bid No Bid 5210.00 $365.00 $285.00 $550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $425.00 $535,00 $415.00 $775.00 No Bid Nao Bid No Bid
Manthly No Bid No Bid No Bid §775.00 $1,700.00 5§1,046.00 $1,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dalivarad $125 sach way| Dalivary/Pickup 3150 wach way Qanis
Trencher Da No Bid No Bid No Bid §170.00 $393.00 $535.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available wiprice Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid §515.00 $646.00 $950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manthl No Bid No Bid No Bid §1,225.00 $1,249.00 §1,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




8lza 24 Dellvared $126 Walk-Behlnd DulbaryiPichup 415 ch vty W ] |_
Trencher Dally No Bk o Bld Ne Bid No Bld $700.00] §690.00 o Bld No E_ No Bid No B
List various sizes available wprk Weekly No B No Bld Ne Bid No Bk $1,000.00] £1,300.00 o Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid
Monthly No Bkt o Bid No Bid Ne Bid $2,200.00 $2,500.00 o Bid No Bid Na Bld| No Bld
5184 vaoh way DW
Trencher Daly No Bkl No Bld Ne Bid Ne Bid o Bid o Bid No Bld o Bid ko Bld
Llst varlous sizes available w/prics Weekl: Ne Bid No Bid No Bl Ne Bid lo Bid la Bid Na Bld lo Bid lo Bld
Monthly Ne Bid Na Bl No 8id No Bid o Bid o Bid No Bld No Bid Mo Bld
Horlzental Directicral Boring Machina Dally No Bid Ne Bid o Bid o Bid o Bld No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
List varicus sizes availabla w/prlice Waskly Na Bid No Bid o Bld o Bid o Bid No Bid Mo Bld Mo Bid Ma Big Na Bid
Monthly o Bid No B o Bid o Bid o Bld Na Bid No Bid Ne B No Bid Mo mE_
Hoifzontal Directicnal Borlng Machine Dally No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No £ o Bid No Bld Ne Bid Ne Bld No Bid No E_
Llst varkots sizes avallabls wiprice Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bk{ No Bld Mo Bid| o Bid No Bid MNe Bld No g_ No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid Mo Birl No Bid No Big No Bid o Bid No Bid Mo Bld No Bld No Bid Nao Bid
Herlzental Diectional Boring Machine D No Bid Ne BId Mo Bid No Bld No Bld Ne Bld o Bld o Bld o Bid Na Bid
List varkous sizes avatiable wiptica Waskly No Bld No Bld Nao Bid MNo Bd No Bid No Bld o Bld o Bid o Bid Na Bid
Monihly No Bid No B1d o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid o Bld a Bld No Bid
Diesel Powsred Knuckla Boom Truck-8 Daily No Bid No Bld Ne Eid No Bid No Bid o Bk No Bid No Bid No Bld
Long 24 CU Yard with Barn Doar Tallgate Weekly HNo Bid No Bld No Bid Na Bid No Bidf No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid
Boom Relation 280 dg by Hydraulic Motor Monthly No Bkd Ne Bld No B No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Na Bld Mo Bid No Bid|
Mack Tri-Axle 21 Yard Dump Truck Dally No Bid o Bid Ne Bid No Bid Ne Bk No Bid No Bid o Bld No Bid No mm_ Mo Bid
or aqual Weokly Ne B o Bld No Bid No Bid e Bl No Bid Na Bid Mo Bid No Bld No Bid No Bid
Month! No B o Bid No Bid Ne Bid Neo Bl No Bid Na Bld Ne Bid Mo Bid No B No Bid
_waﬁ_&_:m_. Single Axle 8 Yard Dump D Na Bid No Bld Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld! Ne Bid No Bld No Bld No Bid
Truck or squal Weskly | Ne Bid Na Bd No Bid No Bld e Bid No Bid Na Bid No Blid No Bid No Bld No Bid
Monthly Na Bid Mo Bid No Bld No Bid Ne Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bl No Bid Mo Bid
Mack Tandum Axle 14 Yaid Dump Caily a Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld $1,100.00 No Bld No Bld No Bld la Bid
Trusk or equal Woeskly o Bld Mo Bid No Bld o Bld No Bid $2,660.00 Mo Bid No Blck o Bid o Bid
onthly o Bid No Bld No Bid o Bld No Bld $6,220.00 Na Bid No Bid lo Bld o Bid
Volve AZ5D- 25 ton 636 Articulated Caily Ne Bld No Bid $1,600.0¢ §2.500.00 No Bid $3,310.00 Ne Bid $1,865,00] Ne Bid Mo Bid No Bld
OIf Road Truck or squal Weckly Ne Bid No Bld $4,200,00 $2,200.00] No Bid $6,160.00] No Bld $4.165.00 No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bld
Morthly Neo Bkl No 8id $10.200.00 $8,500.00 $15,000.00 $12,032.00 Mo Bid 59,395.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Big
Fan $3,000 sz3h way! Deosan DA3 OAT725/25 Ton od|
Fralghtliner M2 108 with 10ft Dump Body [ v} Ne Bid No Bkl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid] Mo Bid No Bid|
or aqual Weskly Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
tdonthly No Bid No Bid Mo Bld No Bd No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargo Truck 26§, Extended Length Box Trusk [+ Ne Bl o Bid Mo Bid MNa Bld No Pid No Bld No Bid No Bld No Bid o Bid No Bid
or equal Weskly No Bid No Bid No Bld Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid Na Bid
Monthl Ne Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bld Ne B No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid
Water Truck - 2000 Gallon Capacily o] No Bl o Bid $560.00 $400.00! Ne Bid $800.00 $875.00 $745,00 No Bid| No Bid o Bld
of equal Weekly Na Bid o Bid §1,650.00 $1,000.00 No Bkl $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,295.00 No Bid No Bid o Bid
Monthly No Bld 0 Bld $3,700.00 $2,260.00 No Bid $4,350.00 $3,850.00 $3,185.00 Mo Bid No Bid o Bid
Faa $1,000 sach way, DoliveryiPlokup $208 sach way
Water Wagaon - 500 Gallon Capacity Ne Bl o Bkl Ne Bid No B No Bid $360.00 $480.00 No Bk No ﬁ o Bld
ar equal Mo Bid o Bl Ne Bld No B No Bid $800.00 $695.00 No Bld No Bid o Bld
Na Bid o B No Bid No Bid No Bld $1,360,00 $1,005.00 Mo Bid No Bid o Bid
DellvaryiPickup $130 aach way
938K Rubber Tire Loadar wid way Bucket $1,190.00 Ne Bid $050.00 $700.00 1,000.00 $2,000.00 o Bl 1,205.00 No Bid|
w26 cll, yd, mullipurpaesae Bughel Weekly $2,506.00 No Bid $2,500.00 $2,400.00 3,000.00 $3,500,00 o Bid 1,695.00 No Bid
ar equal Monthly $5,480.00 No Bid $6,100.00 $7,000.00 6,000.00] $7,000.00 No Bid 4,505 .00 No Bid
Boosan OL20U Foa $2,600 sanh way Dooean DL2SE Hitaoht ZW140
Cal 966K Front End Loacler or equal D: Ne Bid No Bld £1,500.00 $1,500.00 1,850.00 $3,040.00 Na Bid 1,486 .00 No Bid No Bid
Waeskly Ne Bid No Bl $3,850.00 §4,000,00 3,200,00 $6,640.00 Mo Bld 3,405.00 No Bid| Na Bid
Monthly Ne Bld Ne Bld $8,600.00 $11,5600.00] 7.500.00 $11,810.00 Nao Bid 5,295.00 Mo Bid No Bid
Fon $3.000 oach way, ootan DL33 Hitachl ZY110]
Caterplliar 863D Track Loader with Baily Ne Bld o Bld 1,200.00 Mo Bid No Pid Neo Bid o Bld No Bid o Bld o Bld
multipurpese bucket or equal Weskly Ne Bld o Bid 3.,050.00 ,000.00 Ne Bid No B Ne Bd No Bid No Bid o Bid
onthly Mo Bld o Bid 7,600.00 $12,000.00 No B Mo Bid Ne Bid Na Bld No Bl No 8id
R Fon §5,000 aach way
Boheat TB70 Track Loader wihigh capacily Daily $780.00 No Bid $460.00 $500.00] No BK No Bld $800.00 No Bld Mo Bid $830.00 No Bid
Hydraulle Pump with alachments or equal Weskly $1,820.00 No Bid $1,226.00] $1,000.00] Ne Bid o Bid $1,700.00 No Bid Mo Bld $1,380.00/ Mo Bld
Monthly $3,620.00 Mo Bid $3,050.00 $3,000.00 Ne Bld o Bid §3,500,00 Ne Bid Na Bid $3,030.00| Mo Bid
Kubata SULD7 Fas $200 sach way DeltvaryiPluk up $300 sush way Kubiota| How Hofland G343 igh Flow,
Cal 326GC Excavator w/Thumb and AIC | Dally 1,815.00 Mo Bid $1,650.00 $600.00 $2,199.00 $3,180.00 $2,700.00 1,805 00 No Bid No B No Bid
ar equal Waeskly 3,697.00 No Bld $4,300.00 $4,000,00 $4,44000 $5,080.00 $5,600.00 3,095.00 No Bld Na Bid No Bkl
Monthly 9,745.00 No Bid $10,200.00/ §10,000.00 $6,509.00 $12,848.00 $11,600.00 9 285.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Doosan DXI5Y Faa $3,000 oaoh way Doosan DX350 DalivaryiPlek up SE40 sash way Jdoore,
Cat 326E Exzavalor w/Thumb and AIC o] $1.560.00 No Bld $1,230,00 $1,230,00 $1,950.00 $2,880,00 No Bld $1,385.00 No Bid No Bl No Bid
or equal Woakly $3,525.00 No Bid $3,150.00 $3,100.00 $4,000.00] $6,250.00 Na Bid $3,305.00 No Bid No Bld| Na Bi|




$0,040.00 No Bid $8,100.00 $2.000,00] $8,000,00] $10,876.00 No Bl $7,805.00] No Bld No Bid No BId
Docaan DX300 Fao $3,000 sach way' Doosan DX30D,
Galt 324E Excavater w/Thumb and A/C $1,130,00] o Bld 1,100.00 $1,230,00 1,624.00 $2,760,00 No Bid 1,196.00 o Bld No Bid No Bld
o equal Wesk $2,620.00/ o Bld 2,850,800 $3,100.00 3,640.00 0810.00 No BId! 2,205.00 o Bld Na Bld Mo Bid
Monthly $8,025.00/ o Bid 7 400.00 §8,000.00 7,690.00 $10,042.00 Ne Bld $6,995.00 o Bid No B Na Bid
Dotsan DX225 Fea $3,000 sach wey| Doosan BX255
Cat 322 Rubker Tira Excavator or equal D No Bid Ne Bld Na Bid o Bld Mo Bld lo Bid| o Bid No Bld o Bd No Bid No Bid
Weskly Mo Bid No Bld No Bid o Bid No Bid o Bld o Bld No B o Bid No Bid No Bid
Month Mo Bid Mo Bld Mo Bid o Bld Ne Bid o Bid o Bid No BKl o Bld No Bid No Bid
XL4100 Gradall or equal | Daily No Bid o Bld| No 8l Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld o Bid Ne Bld No Bid] ja Bid
Woeskly. Mo Bld o Bid: No Skl No B No Bid Mo Bkl No Bid o Bld No Eld: No Bld o Bid
Monthly Ho Bid lo Bld Mo Bld No Bid No Bid Mo Bl No Bid o Bld Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bid
Cat 320 Lony Reach Excavator wilh AJC | Daily No Bid o Bid 1,500.00] 1,200.00 2,100.00 $3,660.00 $3,100.00 No Bld o Bid Mo Bid o Bid
or equal 80 R. reach Waoekiy No Bid o Bld 4,000.00 $3,800.00| 4,200.00 $7.020.00 $5,850.00 No Bid No Bld No Bid o Bld
Monthly No Bid No Bid 9,500,00 9,500.00 $,000.00 $15.157.00 £12,370.00 No Bid No Bid No BK o Bld
Fan $3,000 oach way| Docaan DX26E U3-30 aniPiek up §500 ¥ Sany
Cat 349 Excavalor Leader with multipurpose | Dalty No Bid No Bld 1,700.00 $2,500.00 No Bid $5,750.00 o Bld Ne Bld o Bid Na Bid
bucket or egual Weekly No B No Bd £4,400.00 $4,500.00 No Bld $11,870.00 o Bld No Bid o Bid No Bld
Menthly No Bid No B $10,800,00 $12,600,00 No Bid $10,647,00 No Bled Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
Fuo $5,000 each way
Diteh Cleaning Bucket {for Exzavator) | Daity No Bid e Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid o Bld No Bid No Bld!
Weekly No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid| Ne Bid Ne Bld o Bid No Bid Mo Bid
Monthly No Bid Ne Bid No Bld Na Bl Ne Bld No Bid o Bid o Bld Mo Bld
Cat 12M Mator Grader or equal | Dally No Bid Mo Bid No Bid| No Bid $3,080.00 $2,260.00 o Bld Neo Bld Ma Bid
\Woskly No Bid Mo Bid Na Bld No Bid 5,580 00 55,150.00 o B Ne Bid o Bid
Manthly Mo Bid Ne Bid No Bld No Bd $11,637.00 $7,760.00 o Bld No Bitl No Bid
Oudhya ryiPJok up $304 wsch yay Suay,
Cat 12M Matar Grader with Frant Dally No Bkt No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bld No Bid Nao Bid MNo Bid No Bid o Bid
Blade or squal Woekly No Bk No Bid Mo B No Bid o Bid Mo Bid No 8k Mo Bld No mﬂ No Bld
Monthly No Bid No Bld No Bld Ne Bid No Bd No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bkl Nao Bid
CAT 140M Mator Srader or aqual | Daily No Bld: No Bk Mo Bid $1,600,00 No Bid 3,080.00 $2,850.00 No Bid Mo Bld|
Weekly o Bid Na Bid No Bid $3,600.00 No Bid £5.580,00] £6,100,00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bld Nao Bid $0,000.00 No Bid $11,637.00 $13,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Foo $3,000 sach way| Dty PleK p 3500 4t ity Sy
GAT 140M Motor Grader with Front D: No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bk Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
Blade or aqual Woekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
_E:z_ No Bid Ne Bld No Bl No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
Cat DK LGP Dozer of equal with Straight Blade Dally No Bid Na Bid No Bld $1,600,00| No Bld 2,760.00 No Bid Mo Bld Nao Bid
Weekly No Bid Ne Bld No Bid $2,100.00 Mo Bid 4,650.00 No Bld No Bld No Bld
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,200.00 No Bkl 6,280.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Faa $3,000 sach way
Cat DK LGP Dozer ar egual with Tilt Blada D No Bid No Bid Mo Bid $1,000.00 Mo Bid 2,760.00 No Bid $1,495,00
Waekly No Bid Ne Bid No Bid $2,100.00 No Bld $4,650.00 Na Bid $3,406.00 Mo B
Manthly Na Bid Ne Bld No Bk $5,700.00 No Bid 8,200.00 Mo 8l $7,885.00 No Bid
Fun §3,H4H) aach way
Cat D6 LGP Dozer or equal with Stralght Blade, | Dally o Bk Ne Bid Na Bid $1,000.00 Ne Bld $4,480.00 No Bid o Blid No Bid ko Bid
and A/C, Aulo Reversing Fan Weekly o Bid No Bld Ne Bid $2,100,00 Nc Bid $7,620,00 No Bld o Bid No Bld la Bid
Monthly o Bicl Mo Bid No Bil $5,200.00 Nec Bid $15,320.00 No Bld! lo Bid o Blek lo 8id
Feo $3,000 sach way]
Cat D4 LGP Dozer with 8-way Angle Blade or o] $1,100.00 No Bld No Bid $1,000.00 $1,650,00| 2, 780,00 2,400.00 1,146.00 No Bld| o Bid
equal with Cab and A/C Waekly $2,700.00 lo Bid Ne Bid $2,800.00 $2,750.00 #4,660.00| 54,000.00 1,685.00 Ne Bid o Bld No Bid
Moathly $6,350.00 No Bl No Bid $5,800.00 $0,260.00| 3,665.00 4,860.00 No Bid [0 Bid ha Bid
Doosan DN100] Faa 33,000 aach way| ry!Ple b up §500 amoh rwy Jeiaar
Cat 418E Back Hoe or equal Dally Ne Bld lo Bid Neo Bld $650.00 $525.00 £825.00 $845.00 No Bid Nz Bid la Bid
Waekly Ne Bid lo Bld No Bld $1,000.00 $1,100.00 $1,425.00 $1,265.00 No Bid Ne Bid la Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bld 32,7500 $1,050.00 $2,400.00 $1,045.00 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
Foa $250 sach way| D Frva BTk up §200 ansh way Cans,
Cat 623H - 18 to 23 ou. yd. capacity Dy No Bid Na Bl o Bid No Bid o B No Bid o Bld o Bld No Bid] No 8id
or equal Waekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bl Mo Bid
Menthly No Bld No 8K No Bid No Bid No Bld No B No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bld
Full behind Traclor Soraper D & Bld No Bid No Bkl No Bld| No Bld Mo Bid No Bld o Bid| No Bid
& cu, yd, capacity or equal Weekly o Bld No Bk No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No 8id o Bld No Bid
Monthly o Bl No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid o Bid No Bid
4 - G Ton Slea! Wheel Roller wicompaction Dally $820.00 No Bid $600.00 $420.00] Ne Bid No Bid 1,026.00 $745.00 No Bid No B
whith of 86 in. or squal Wasekly §1,750.00 HNo Bid $1,425.00 $1,200.00 NeBld No Bid 1,800.00 $1,245.00 No Bid No Bid
Manthly $4,340,00 No Bid $3,600.00 $2,857.00 Ne Bd No Bid 3,000.00 $3,146.00 No m|_ No Bid
Sakal 5V400 Faa $150 sach way $200 gann wry Bomag Dynapagc SG4200¥4
8-10 Ton Stesl Wheel Roller swcompaction D iNo Bld Mo Bld $700,00 $505.00 No Bid Na Bld $1,126.00 $895.00 Na Bid Na Bid!
width of 84 in. or equal Weekly Ne Bid No Bid $1,760.00 $320.00! No Bid No Bid $2.300.00 $1,505,00 No 8kl No Bid
Monthly No Bld No Bid $4,400.001 $2,875.00 No Bid No Bid $5,100.00 $3,805.00 Mo Bid Mo Bid
Fao §175 vach way | CullvanyPick up $200 aazh vy 3aay| Dynapaa GCE200VI
©-12 Ton Rubber Tira Roller Dally Mo Bld No Bld Na Bid $527.00 No mltr_ No Bid No Bld £1,005 00 Na Bid No Bid
Waekly No Bld No Bid Ne Bid $1437.00 No Bl No Bld No Bl $2,385.00 No Bid| Mo Bld




Monthly No Bid No Bkl $4.972.00 Ne Bld No Bid No Brd] $4.855.00 Mo Bid Mo Bid
Faa §350 sach way| I_ Dynapaa 21200
Cal GF 44 S8heepfoot Reller $560.00 $705.00 §1,100.00 $1,025.00 $705.00 Na B lo Bld
wiblada or eqjual ‘Waakly $1,260.00 $1,660.00 $1,600.00 $2,000.00 $1.445.00 No Bld la Bid
Monthly $3,100.00 $3,300.00 $4,000.00 $4,560.00 $3,605.00 No Bid o Bid
Ol rwPlolc up 204 waoh Wiy Bomay| Umsnmln A1500PD|
Cat CP 74 Sheaploot Rellsr of aqual Daily Ne Bld No Bkl $600.00 $650.00 No Bldl $1,125.00 ,285.00 No Bid la Bid:
Weekly No Bid No B $1,460.00 $1,040.00 Nao Bid $2,400.00 ,B85.00 No Bld
Monthly Ne Bid No Bid $3,500.00] $4,860.00 No Bldl $5,376.00 4,205.00 o Bld o mE No %_
Fes $2,600 asch way Dalhviyiick up $200 orwa Dynapas CAZ00PD
Cne Ton Small Steel Whee! Roller Dally No Bid No Bid o Bld No Bid o Bid $570.00 $405.00| o Bid Na Bid Na Bid
Weakly No Bk No Bid o Bid o Bid lo Bld $050.00] $1,005.00 o Bld Nao Bld Mo Bid
Monthly o Bid No 8k o Bl o Bid o Bkl $1,886.00 $2,150.00 o Bld Na Bid No Bkl
. Dynapac GGH000
Minimum 114 HF Kubota Farm Type Tractor o Bld 3450.00 o Bid $800.00 o Did Ne Bid No Bl Mo Bld No Bid| $780.00 Ne Bid
ar equal o Bld $1,000.00 o Bid $2,400.00 o Bid Ne Bid Ne Bld No Bid No Bld $1,100.00! No Bid
o Bld $2,200.00 o Bl §6,000.00 o Bld Ne Bld Mo Bid No Bld Mo B $2,450.00 No Bid
130HP Magsoy Model: 8713 Naw Holland 120
4 Whee!| Drive Boom Mower wiTractor Dally No Bid No Bid o Bid $050.00 No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid o Bld Mo Bid No B
wiSft. Mewer Dack 23 ft, boom reach Weekly No Bid Mo Bid o Bid $2,620,00 No Bld No Bld No Bid No Bid a Bid Ne Bid o Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid o Bid $8.300.00 No Bkl No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bld Ne Bid No Bid
Fos §2,600 oach way
Cat 28003 Skid Steer Loader (Hi-Flo} Dally $780.00 No Bid $§426,00 $375.00 No Bid $850.00 $800.00 No Bid No Bl $830.00 Na Bld
73hp or equal, Rubber Tracks Waskly $1,820.00 No Bid $1,150.00 $000.90 Na Bid §1,850.00 $1,700.00 No Bid Ne Bld $1,380.00 No 8ld
Monthly $3,820.00 No Bid $2,650.00 $1.776.00] No Bid $4,050.00 $3.,600.00 No Bld No Bid $3,030.00 No Bl
Kuhota SULST| Fob 3200 cach way| C4llvanyfPlek up §150 suc wy Kubola|
Cat 2268 Skid Steer Loader 65 hp Dally No Pid No Bid $360.00 $500.00 Ne Bld $500.00 $716.00 Ne Bid Ne Bld MNao Bid Mo Bid
or equal Weekly No BK Ho Bid $200.00 $1,100.00 No Bl $1,050.00 $1,400.00 Ne Bid No Bld Na Bld No Bid
Monthly No Bid No BK| $2.,200,00 $1.900.00 Ne 8ld $1,750,00] $2,600.00 Mo Bid Mo Bid Na Bid No Bid
) DulbvaryiPlel op §100 ansh iy Kol
Auger 8" - 38" bits for Skid Steer No Bkt Mo Bid $260,00 No Bld No Bid Ne Bld $175.00 Me Bid
l.oader Na Bl No Bid $305.00 No Bid Ne Bld No Bid $260,00| No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bld $700.00 No Bld No Bid, No Bild $325.00 No Bid
Angle Broom for Skid Steer Daly Ne Bid No Bid $185.00] o Bid $400,00 No Bld No Bid No Bid Mo Bid o E
Loader Weekly No Bid Mo Bkl $250.00) o Bid $650.00 No Bid No Bid Mo BId Mo Bid o Bid
Monthly Ne Bid No 8 $695.00! lo Bid $1,100.00 No Bid No 8 No Bid| No Bi _ la Bid
Cold Planner for Skid Steer Loadar Dally Ne Bid No BK Ne Bid o Bid $600.00 No Bid No Bld Ne Bid No Bidd lo Bid
Weskly No Bid No Bid o Bid o Bid $800.00 No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bl
Monthly Ne Bid Mo Bid No Bld o Bid $1,800,00 Na Bid No Bid Mo Bld o E_ o Bid
Forks for Skid Staer Loader Dally No Bid No B No Bid No Bid o Bid $112.00 Na Bld Ne Bid $190.00] Mo Bik
Weskly No Bid No Bld No Bl No Bld o Bid £130,00 Mo Bid No Bid $285.001 No Bld
Monthly Na Bl No Bld Nao Bld No Bid No Bld $270.00 No 8id No B $375.00 No Bid|
Hydraulic Hammer for Skid Steer Loadar $520.00 Ne Bid No Bkl No Bid No Bki $225.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bld No Bid No Bid
$845.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid $800.00 Mo Bid No Bld No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
$1,790.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,160.00 No Bid Na mﬁ_ Nu Bid No Bid Mo Bid
Tracks for Skid Steer Loadar No Bid o Bld Ne Bid Mo Bid Ne Bid No Bld o Bid Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid
No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bk Ne Bid No Bid o Bl No B No Bid No Bid
No Bld o Bid Ne Bid No Bl No Bld Nao Bld lo Bid Na Bld Mo Bld No Bid
Brush Cutter for Skkl Staer Loatdar Na Rid lo Bld No Bid No Bid $615.00 No Bid No Bid $205.00] o Bid
Ne Bl o Bid Ne Bid Mo Bid $900.90 Ne Bid No Bid $325.00 No Bid
No Bkl lo Bid Ne Bid No Bid $1,605.00 Mo Bid $476.00 N Bld
New Holland 72"
Ratary Cutter for Skid Stear Loader e Bid Mo Bid No Bid| $500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bl No Bld N Bid No Bid
No Bil No Bid No Bld $1,000.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No @_ o Bid No Bld
No Bl No Bid Mo Bid $2,000.00) No Bid No Bl No Bid la g_ No Bid
Uallverad $200 sach way
Portable Scresning Plant Ne Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bld Mo Bld Mo Bld No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid
Modsl 271 or equal No B No Bkl No Bid Noc Bid No Bld Na Bid No 8d No Bid No Bld No Bid
Ne Bil No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld Na Bid Mo Bid No Bld
Miling Machine No Bid o Bld No Bid Mo Bid No Bid lo B No Bld Mo Bld No Bld No Bid
Writgen 2000 ar equivalent with oparators Ne Bid b Bid No Bid No B No Bid lo Bid Na Bld o Bld No Bid No Bid
Ne Bl o Bid No Bl No Bd No Bid o Bl No Bid No Bid Mo Bld No mE_
Mauldin 1760-C Asphalt Spreader No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bl Na Bki Mo Bid lo Bid $2460.00 No Bld| No Bid
ar equai Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid o Bid §6,460.00 No Bid No Bid
Ne Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid Ne Bid Mo Bid e Bid $9,450.00 No Bid No Bk
Dynagas FGITEOC,
Cat APB5SF Asphalt Spreader Na Bil No Bid HNo Bid Mo Bid Na Bid No Bld No 8ld No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Ne Bid No Bid No Pid No Bk Ne Bid No Bid Ma Bid No Bld Mo Bid Mo Bid
Ne Bid No Bk No Bk Mo Bl No Bid Na Bld No Bld No Bld! No Bid Na Bld
Cat AP1056F Asphalt Spreader Daily Ne Bld No Bid No Bld Mo B No Bld HNe Bid No Bid Ne Bld Na Bl No Bid
or equal Weskly No Bid No Bk No Bil Mo Bid Ne Bld Ne Bid Nao Bid No Bid Ne Bld No Bld




Monihly No Bid No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bld No Bld Mo Bid No Bld No Bid No Bid
25" Trailer Meunted Hydra Platfonm or equal Na Bld No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ng Bid Ne Bld Mo Bid
for Under Bridge Inspection No Bid Mo Bid e Bid No Bld Ne Bid Na Bid Ne Bld No Bid No Bid
No Bld HNo Bid No Bl No Bid Ne Bid No Bl o Bid No Bld No g_
AWD self-propelled 24° Boom mowar with 60" No Bid No Bid e Bid o Bl ‘o Bld o Bld o Bl Ne 8ld No Bid o Bid
Muiching head or equal Na Bl No Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid lo Bid No Bld No Bid No Bk No Bid
No Bid No Bid o Bl o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid No Bid No Bd Ne Bi
Trimble Grade Gontrol System GC5800 2D for No Bid o Bl No Bld Mo Bl No Blid No Bid No Bid o Bid a Bld lo Bld
Deozers and Spactra Precision GLB22N/GLE221R Woeeki! No Bid o Bid No Bid No 8ki Na Bid No Bld Ne Bid o Bk o Bld: No 8Id|
(dual grade) Automatic Grade Lasers or equal Monthly Na Bld o Bid No Bld Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld a Bld o Bld Mo Bid|
26 Cuble Yard Reer Loader Garbaga Trusk Dally. No Bid o B o Brd No Bid Mo B No Bid o Bid o Bid Ne Bld o Bid
ar equal Weekly No Bl Na Bld o Bid No Bid Ho Bid Mo Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid
Monthly No Bid o Bid o Bid No Bid Mo 8id No Bld o Bid o Bld No Bid fo BKd
13 Cubis Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck Daily No Bid Ne Bld o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bd Ne Bld No Bld MNe Bid
or aqual . Weekly No Bid No Bid| 2 Bl No Bld No Bid No Bld o 8id No Bid No E No Bid
Menthly No Bld Ne Bk o Bld No Bid No Bid Ne Bid Na Bld o Bid Nao Bid No E
25-33 Cublc Yard Automatic Skie Loader Daily No Bid No Bid No 8ld No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bld No Bid o Bld No Bid No Bid
Garbage Truck or equal Woaakly No Bid No Bl No 8k No Bl No Bid Mo Bid No Brd o Bid Na Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid] No Bld| Mo Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid

EXCEPTIONS!

Stinbeft Rantals, In¢. hes reviawed the decumants provided, however noted that no terns and conditions were included for review, If awarded, Sunbelt reserves the right to nagotfate any terms.
Purchusing notes terms ond conaftions are stated In the Invitation ta 8!d and Specifieations - Corpetive Bid AWG23-18 - Pravision of Rentaf Equipment,

H&E Equipment Services, Inc. [Isted delivery and plck-up charges are each way. One-fime charga, reducing rental rates per rental period.

NOTES;

Coastal Machinery Equlpment options are Doosan, Kubota & Sakal far various equipmant

Cobleatz Equipment & Parts Co., Inc, are only bidding on Farm Tractors; Tractors shall ba 4-Whael Brive, Cab, A/C, Power Shuttle Transmissfon & Wheels Widenad for Rlght of Way Mowing.
Thempsan Tracter Company listed Volvo A25D-25 Ton 6x6 Artlculated Off Road Truck optlon as CAT 725 25 Ten 6x6,

Plttman Tractor Company Equipmant options are Hitachi 8 Dynapac for varlous equipment.

Kingline Equipment lIsted Bobeat T820 Track Loader w/high-capacfty Hydraulie pump w/attachmants or equal & CAT 265D3 Skid Steer Loader {HIHFlaw)73hp or equal, ruhber tracks optlons as Mew Holland €345 Cab Compact Track Loader, High-Flow, w/bucket and;
Mlalmumn 114 HP Kubota Farm Type Tractor or equivalent option as New Holland Workmaster 120 Cab; New Holland brand for Auger 8'-36" blts for Skid Steer, Mew Holland Forks and New Holland 72* Extrame Duty High-Flow Brush Cutter.



