

Crushed Aggregates Bid WG23-12 Area 100 Bid Tabulation

Plant or Yard Location for Pick-up Only	Vulcan Materials Company, Inc.				Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.				Graestone Aggregates, LLC		C.R. Pate Logging, Inc.		Stephens Trucking Co.				Premier Holding Co.	
	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY
	Bay Bridge, Mobile		Blakeley, Mobile		Saraland, AL		Theodore, AL		Mobile, AL		Andalusia, AL		Titus, AL		Brierfield, AL		Mobile, AL	
CRUSHED GRAVEL																		
ALDOT #467	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #57	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	49.00
ALDOT #78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	48.50
CRUSHED LIMESTONE																		
ALDOT #467	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #4	45.00	56.00	No Bid	No Bid	44.50	60.50	No Bid	No Bid	39.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	49.00
ALDOT #57	45.00	56.00	45.00	56.00	44.50	60.50	No Bid	No Bid	39.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #67	45.00	56.00	45.00	56.00	44.50	60.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	44.50	60.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #89	48.00	59.00	48.00	59.00	44.50	60.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #8910	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	40.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	44.00
ALDOT #5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRUSHED RIP-RAP & GABION																		
ALDOT CLASS 1	53.00	64.00	No Bid	No Bid	60.50	77.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	32.00	51.68	No Bid	49.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT CLASS 2	53.00	64.00	No Bid	No Bid	60.50	77.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	32.00	51.68	No Bid	49.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT CLASS 3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	49.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT 3X6 GABION STONE	53.00	64.00	No Bid	No Bid	60.50	77.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRUSHED CONCRETE PROD.																		
2" X 0 BASE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6" x 2" COBBLES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
RUBBLE RIP-RAP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE																		
	3/4" Base	3/4" Base																
825-A	45.00	56.00	No Bid	No Bid	43.50	59.50	No Bid	No Bid	37.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	47.50
825-B	45.00	56.00	45.00	56.00	43.50	59.50	No Bid	No Bid	37.10	No Bid	20.00	43.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	47.50
2" MINUS SCREENED LIMESTONE																		
2" MINUS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	14.00	33.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
WHITE SAND - WASHED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Supply Locations	Supply Locations	Supply Locations	Supply Locations	Supply Locations	Supply Locations
Pride - Mobile, AL SACTUN - Mobile, AL	Maylene - Saraland, AL O'Neal - Saraland, AL Bahama - Theodore, AL	Winn Materials Lafarge Three Rivers Quarry N. Montgomery Materials	Brooklyn Limestone - Andalusia, AL	RMUSA - Brierfield, AL Har Rock Hill - Titus, AL	

Low Bid Price is highlighted in YELLOW



Secondary Bid is highlighted in RED

Location and transportation cost to the County was used in determining the Prime Bidder.

Crushed Aggregates Bid WG23-12 Area 200 Bid Tabulation

	Vulcan Materials Company, Inc.				Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.				Graestone Aggregates, LLC		C.R. Pate Logging, Inc.		Stephens Trucking Co.		Premier Holding Co.			
	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY		
Plant or Yard Location for Pick-up Only	Bay Bridge, Mobile		Blakeley, Mobile		Saraland, AL		Theodore, AL		Mobile, AL		Andalusia, AL		Titus, AL		Brierfield, AL		Mobile, AL	
CRUSHED GRAVEL																		
ALDOT #467	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #57	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	54.25	No Bid
ALDOT #78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	53.75	No Bid
CRUSHED LIMESTONE																		
ALDOT #467	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #4	45.00	55.00	No Bid	No Bid	44.50	57.50	No Bid	No Bid	39.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	54.25	No Bid
ALDOT #57	45.00	55.00	45.00	55.00	44.50	57.50	No Bid	No Bid	39.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #67	45.00	55.00	45.00	55.00	44.50	57.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	44.50	57.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #89	48.00	58.00	48.00	58.00	44.50	57.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #8910	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	40.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	49.25	No Bid
ALDOT #5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRUSHED RIP-RAP & GABION																		
ALDOT CLASS 1	53.00	64.00	No Bid	No Bid	60.50	74.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	32.00	56.72	No Bid	54.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT CLASS 2	53.00	64.00	No Bid	No Bid	60.50	74.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	32.00	56.72	No Bid	54.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT CLASS 3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	54.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT 3X6 GABION STONE	53.00	64.00	No Bid	No Bid	60.50	74.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRUSHED CONCRETE PROD.																		
2" X 0 BASE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6" x 2" COBBLES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
RUBBLE RIP-RAP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE	3/4" Base	3/4" Base																
825-A	45.00	55.00	No Bid	No Bid	43.50	56.50	No Bid	No Bid	37.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	52.75	No Bid
825-B	45.00	55.00	45.00	55.00	43.50	56.50	No Bid	No Bid	37.10	No Bid	20.00	44.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	52.75	No Bid	No Bid
2" MINUS SCREENED LIMESTONE																		
2" MINUS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	14.00	38.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
WHITE SAND - WASHED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid



Supply Locations	Supply Locations	Supply Locations	Supply Locations	Supply Locations
Pride - Mobile, AL SACTUN - Mobile, AL	Maylene - Saraland, AL O'Neal - Saraland, AL Bahama - Theodore, AL	Winn Materials Lafarge Three Rivers Quarry N. Montgomery Materials	Brooklyn Limestone - Andalusia, AL	RMUSA - Brierfield, AL Har Rock Hill - Titus, AL

Low Bid Price is highlighted in YELLOW 
 Secondary Bid is highlighted in RED 
 Location and transportation cost to the County was used in determining the Prime Bidder.

Crushed Aggregates Bid WG23-12 Area 300 Bid Tabulation

Plant or Yard Location for Pick-up Only	Vulcan Materials Company, Inc.				Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.				Graestone Aggregates, LLC		C.R. Pate Logging, Inc.		Stephens Trucking Co.		Premier Holding Co.			
	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY	PICK-UP	DELIVERY		
	Bay Bridge, Mobile		Blakeley, Mobile		Saraland, AL		Theodore, AL		Mobile, AL		Andalusia, AL		Titus, AL		Brierfield, AL		Mobile, AL	
CRUSHED GRAVEL																		
ALDOT #467	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #57	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	57.15	No Bid
ALDOT #78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	56.65	No Bid
CRUSHED LIMESTONE																		
ALDOT #467	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #4	45.00	60.00	No Bid	No Bid	44.50	60.50	No Bid	No Bid	39.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	57.15	No Bid
ALDOT #57	45.00	60.00	45.00	60.00	44.50	60.50	No Bid	No Bid	39.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #67	45.00	60.00	45.00	60.00	44.50	60.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	44.50	60.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #89	48.00	60.00	48.00	60.00	44.50	60.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT #8910	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	40.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	52.15	No Bid
ALDOT #5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRUSHED RIP-RAP & GABION																		
ALDOT CLASS 1	53.00	69.00	No Bid	No Bid	60.50	77.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	32.00	59.60	No Bid	57.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT CLASS 2	53.00	69.00	No Bid	No Bid	60.50	77.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	32.00	59.60	No Bid	57.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT CLASS 3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	57.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ALDOT 3X6 GABION STONE	53.00	69.00	No Bid	No Bid	60.50	77.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRUSHED CONCRETE PROD.																		
2" X 0 BASE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6" x 2" COBBLES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
RUBBLE RIP-RAP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE	3/4" Base		3/4" Base															
825-A	45.00	60.00	No Bid	No Bid	43.50	59.50	No Bid	No Bid	37.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	55.75	No Bid
825-B	45.00	60.00	45.00	60.00	43.50	59.50	No Bid	No Bid	37.10	No Bid	20.00	47.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	55.75	No Bid	No Bid
2" MINUS SCREENED LIMESTONE																		
2" MINUS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	14.00	41.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
WHITE SAND - WASHED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Supply Locations	Supply Locations	Supply Locations	Supply Locations	Supply Locations	Supply Locations
Pride - Mobile, AL SACTUN - Mobile, AL	Maylene - Saraland, AL O'Neal - Saraland, AL Bahama - Theodore, AL	Winn Materials Lafarge Three Rivers Quarry N. Montgomery Materials	Brooklyn Limestone - Andalusia, AL	RMUSA - Brierfield, AL Har Rock Hill - Titus, AL	

Low Bid Price is highlighted in YELLOW 
 Secondary Bid is highlighted in RED 
 Location and transportation cost to the County was used in determining the Prime Bidder.