COMPETITIVE BID #WG22:28 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials
Bid Tabulation - Solid Sod

BIDDER: Premier Conerete Products, INC

Price Bid per Price Bid per
Sod Type Cuts Square Yard Square Yard
Delivered Picked-up

Centipede Block No Bid No Bid
Centipede Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
Centipede 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid
Bermuda/Tifton Block No Bid No Bid
Bermuda/Tifton Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
Bermuda/Tifton 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid
Celebrations Bermuda Block No Bid No Bid
Celebrations Bermuda Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
Celebrations Bermuda 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine Block No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid

Pick-up Location: No Bid
Exceptions: Bidder is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State to do
business in Alabama

BIDDER: Evans & Company, Inc.

Price Bid per Price Bid per
Sod Type Cuts Square Yard Square Yard
Delivered Picked-up
Centipede Block No Bid No Bid
Centipede Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
Centipede 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid
Bermuda/Tifton Block No Bid No Bid
Bermuda/Tifton Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
Bermuda/Tifton 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid
Celebrations Bermuda Block No Bid No Bid
Celebrations Bermuda Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
Celebrations Bermuda 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine Block No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid
Pick-up Location: No Bid
Exceptions: No Bid
BIDDER: Ferguson Waterworks 5 e
Price Bid per Price Bid per
Sod Type Cuts Square Yard Square Yard
Delivered Picked-up

Centipede Block No Bid No Bid
Centipede Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
Centipede 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid
Bermuda/Tifton Block No Bid No Bid
Bermuda/Tifton Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
Bermuda/Tifton 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid
Celebrations Bermuda Block No Bid No Bid
Celebrations Bermuda Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
Celebrations Bermuda 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine Block No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid

Pick-up Location: No Bid
Exceptions: No Bid




COMPETITIVE BID #WG22-28 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials
Bid Tabulation - Grass Seeds

BIDDER: Evans & Company, Ine.

Price Bid per Pound Price Bid per Pound Price Bid per Pound

Seed Type Delivered/Picked-up | Delivered/Picked-up | Delivered/Picked-up
AREA 100 AREA 200 AREA 300
Annual Ryegrass 0.85 0.85 0.85
Tall Fescue 2.85 2.85 2.85
Crimson Clover 1.70 1.70 1.70
Brown Top Millet 0.75 0.75 0.75
Unhulled Bermuda Grass 435 4.35 4.35
Hulled Bermuda Grass 7.95 7.95 7.95
Pensacola Bahia Grass 4,98 4.98 4,98
Centipede 18.50 18.50 18.50
Kentucky 31 Fescue 2.80 2.80 2.80
Weeping Lovegrass 5.10 5.10 5.10
Annual Lespedeza (Kobe) 1.65 1.65 1.65
PreMix Summer Seed Blend 2.25 2.25 2.25

Crimson Clover 4.75%, Brown Top Millet 19%, Hulled Bermuda Grass 5%, Pensacola Bahia Grass 16%,
Kentucky 31 Fescue 48%, Annual Lespedeza (Kobe) 2%

PreMix Winter Seed Blend 2,25 2.25 2.25
Crimson Clover 9%, Gulf Rye 13%, Unhulled Bermuda Grass 9%, Pensacola Bahia Grass 9%, Kentucky 31
Fescue 50%

Bid Bond: Yes
Pick-up Location: 7930 Zeigler Blvd, Mobile
Exceptions:

BIDDER; Ferguson Waterworks

Price Bid per Pound|Price Bid per Pound | Price Bid per Pound Price Bid per
Seed Type Delivered Delivered Delivered Pound
AREA 100 AREA 200 AREA 300 Picked-up
Annual Ryegrass No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tall Fescue No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Crimson Clover No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brown Top Millet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Unhulled Bermuda Grass No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hulled Bermuda Grass No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola Bahia Grass No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Centipede No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kentucky 31 Fescue No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Weeping Lovegrass No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Annual Lespedeza (Kobe) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PreMix Summer Seed Blend No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Crimson Clover 4.75%, Brown Top Millet 19%, Hulled Bermuda Grass 5%, Pensacola Bahia Grass 16%,
Kentucky 31 Fescue 48%, Annual Lespedeza (Kobe) 2%

Fescue 50%

Pick-up Location: No Bid

Exceptions: Bidder is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State to do business in Alabama

PreMix Winter Seed Blend No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Crimson Clover 9%, Guif Rye 13%, Unhulled Bermuda Grass 9%, Pensacola Bahia Grass 9%, Kentucky 31

Fescue 50%
Pick-up Location: No Bid
Exceptions: None
BIDDER: Premier Concrete Products INC

Price Bid per Pound | Price Bid per Pound | Price Bid per Pound Price Bid per
Seed Type Delivered Delivered Delivered Pound
AREA 100 AREA 200 AREA 300 Picked-up

Annual Ryegrass No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tall Fescue No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Crimson Clover No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brown Top Millet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Unhulled Bermuda Grass No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hulled Bermuda Grass No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola Bahia Grass No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Centipede No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kentucky 31 Fescue No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Weeping Lovegrass No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Annual Lespedeza (Kobe) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PreMix Summer Seed Blend No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Crimson Clover 4.75%, Brown Top Millet 19%, Hulled Bermuda Grass 5%, Pensacola Bahia Grass 16%,

Kentucky 31 Fescue 48%, Annual Lespedeza (Kobe) 2%
PreMix Winter Seed Blend No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Crimson Clover 9%, Gulf Rye 13%, Unhulled Bermuda Grass 9%, Pensacola Bahia Grass 9%, Kentucky 31




COMPETITIVE BID #WG22-28 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials

Bid Tabulation - Fertilizer

BIDDER: Evans & Company, Inc.

Pick-up Location: No Bid

to do business in Alabama

Price Bid per Price Bid per
Fertilizer Type Pound Pound
Delivered Picked-up
13-13-13 0.65 0.65
10-10-10 No Bid No Bid
8-8-8 0.59 0.59
Agricultural Lime (Bag) 0.50 0.50
Agricultural Lime (Bulk) - Price per Ton No Bid No Bid
Bid Bond: Yes
Pick-up Location: 7930 Zeigler Blvd, Mobile
Exceptions: None
BIDDER: Ferguson Waterworks B
Price Bid per Price Bid per
Fertilizer Type Pound Pound
Delivered Picked-up
13-13-13 No Bid No Bid
10-10-10 No Bid No Bid
8-8-8 No Bid No Bid
Agricultural Lime (Bag) No Bid No Bid
Agricultural Lime (Bulk) - Price per Ton No Bid No Bid
Pick-up Location: No Bid
Exceptions: No Bid
BIDDER: Premier Concrete Products, INC = z
Price Bid per Price Bid per
Fertilizer Type Pound Pound
Delivered Picked-up
13-13-13 No Bid No Bid
10-10-10 No Bid No Bid
8-8-8 No Bid No Bid
Agricultural Lime (Bag) No Bid No Bid
Agricultural Lime (Bulk) - Price per Ton No Bid No Bid

Exceptions: Bidder is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State




COMPETITIVE BID #WG22-28 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials

Bid Tabulation - Silt Fence

BIDDER: Evans & Company, Inc,

Bid Bond: Yes
Pick-up Location: 30065 Al 59 Loxley, AL
Exceptions: None

g . Price Bid Price Bid .

Description Product Bid S — Picked-up Unit of Measure
Type "A" Silt Fence Kit Mirafi 140N 1.20 1.20 Per Linear Foot
Type "B" Silt Fence Kit SF90 0.400 0.400 Per Linear Foot
6' C-Flex T Fencing Tenax 1.33 1.33 Per Linear Foot
8' C-Flex T Fencing Tenax 1.42 1.42 Per Linear Foot
Wattles (12 in.) Straw 1.75 175 Per Linear Foot
Wattles (20 in.) Straw 2.35 235 Per Linear Foot
Sediment Logs (12 in.) Curlex 2:52 2.52 Per Linear Foot
Sediment Logs (20in.) Curlex 3.29 3.29 Per Linear Foot
Type 53 RECPs - 3 Month A.E.C. S/N Straw 0.32 0.32 Per Square Yard
Type 53 RECPs - 12 Month A.E.C. 5/N Straw 0.32 0.32 Per Square Yard
Type 52 RECPs - 12 Month A.E.C. D/N Straw 0.42 0.42 Per Square Yard
Type S1 RECPs - 24 Month Curlex Il 0.72 0.72 Per Square Yard
Type 51 RECPs - 36 Month Curlex 11l 0.89 0.89 Per Square Yard
Type S1 RECPs - Perm TRM V 2.42 2.42 Per Square Yard
Type C2 RECPs - 12 Month D/N Straw 0.42 0.42 Per Square Yard
Type C2 RECPs - 24 Month 70/30 Straw/Coco. 0.67 0.67 Per Square Yard
Type C2 RECPs - 36 Month Coconut 1.09 1.09 Per Square Yard
Type C6 RECPs - Perm TRM V 2.42 2.42 Per Square Yard
Type C10 RECPs - Perm TRM V 2.42 2.42 Per Square Yard
Sod Staples 11 Gauge Galvanized Steel- 10,000/box 45.00 45.00 Per Box
Nonwoven Geotextile 4.0 ox/sy (Filter fabric) Mirafi 140N 0.99 0.99 Per Square Yard
Nonwoven Geotextile 8.0 ox/sy (Filter fabric) Mirafi 180N 1.60 1.60 Per Square Yard
Woven Geotextile (Filter fabric) Mirafi 500X 0.80 0.80 Per Square Yard
Soil Slope Reinforcement Type 1 Mirafi 2XT 1.95 1.95 Per Square Yard
Soil Slope Reinforcement Type 2 Mirafi SXT 1.85 1.85 Per Square Yard
Soil Slope Reinforcement Type 3 Mirafi 7XT 2.16 2.16 Per Square Yard
Soft Soil Reinforcements Type 1 "Geogrid" BX1100 1.25 1.25 Per Square Yard
Soft Soil Reinforcements Type 2 "Geogrid" BX1200 1.79 1.79 Per Square Yard
Soft Soil Reinforcements Type 3 "Geogrid" BX1500 3.70 3.70 Per Square Yard
Bid Bond: Yes
Pick-up Location: 7930 Zeigler Blvd, Mobile
Exceptions: None
BIDDER: Ferguson Waterworks

- . Price Bid Price Bid i

Description Product Bid Dalfvara Piékadsiip Unit of Measure
Type "A" Silt Fence Kit No Bid 1.79 Per Linear Foot
Type "B" Silt Fence Kit No Bid 0.299 Per Linear Foot
6' C-Flex T Fencing No Bid No Bid Per Linear Foot
8' C-Flex T Fencing No Bid No Bid Per Linear Foot
Wattles (12 in.) No Bid No Bid Per Linear Foot
Wattles (20 in.) No Bid 4.06 Per Linear Foot
Sediment Logs {12 in.) No Bid 4.00 Per Linear Foot
Sediment Logs {20 in.) No Bid No Bid Per Linear Foot
Type S3 RECPs - 3 Month No Bid 0.51 Per Square Yard
Type 53 RECPs - 12 Month No Bid 0.58 Per Square Yard
Type S2 RECPs - 12 Month No Bid 1.02 Per Square Yard
Type S1 RECPs - 24 Month No Bid 1.13 Per Square Yard
Type S1 RECPs - 36 Month No Bid 1.65 Per Square Yard
Type S1 RECPs - Perm No Bid 3.92 Per Square Yard
Type C2 RECPs - 12 Month No Bid 1.02 Per Square Yard
Type C2 RECPs - 24 Month No Bid 1.13 Per Square Yard
Type C2 RECPs - 36 Month No Bid 1.13 Per Square Yard
Type C6 RECPs - Perm No Bid 1.23 Per Square Yard
Type C10 RECPs - Perm No Bid 3.2 Per Square Yard
Sod Staples No Bid 100.00 Per Box
Nonwoven Geotextile 4.0 ox/sy (Filter fabric) No Bid 1.34 Per Square Yard
Nonwoven Geotextile 8.0 ox/sy (Filter fabric) No Bid 2.84 Per Square Yard
Woven Geotextile (Filter fabric) No Bid 3.12 Per Square Yard
Soil Slope Reinforcement Type 1 No Bid No Bid Per Square Yard
Soil Slope Reinforcement Type 2 No Bid No Bid Per Square Yard
Soil Slope Reinforcement Type 3 No Bid No Bid Per Square Yard
Soft Soil Reinforcements Type 1 "Geogrid" No Bid 2.45 Per Square Yard
Soft Soil Reinforcements Type 2 "Geogrid" No Bid 2.45 Per Square Yard
Soft Soil Reinforcements Type 3 "Geogrid" No Bid 2.75 Per Square Yard

*Premier Concrete Products, INC did not bid on this category

*Premier Concrete Products is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State to do business in Alabama




COMPETITIVE BID #WG22-28 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials

Bid Tabulation - Articulating Concrete Block Mats

BIDDER: Premier Concrete Products, INC

Price Bid per Price Bid per
Dimensions (H x W x L) Type Square Foot Square Foot
Delivered Picked-up

4,75x15.5x17.4 Open Cell 6.01 4.67
6.0x15.5x17.4 Open Cell 7.40 5.52
8.0x15.5x17.4 Open Cell 10.02 7.68
4.75x155x17.4 Closed Cell 7.02 5.14
6.0x15.5x17.4 Closed Cell 8.41 6.07
8.0x15.5x17.4 Closed Cell 10.86 Zid 3
Anchors (price per unit) 28.32 28.32

Bid Bond: Yes

Pick-up Location: 3820 LA Hwy 16, Denham Springs, LA 70706
Exceptions: Bidder is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State

to do business in Alabama

BIDDER: Ferguson Waterworks

Price Bid per Price Bid per
Dimensions (H x W x L) Type Square Foot Square Foot
Delivered Picked-up
4,75x15.5x17.4 Open Cell No Bid 11.17
6.0x15.5x17.4 Open Cell No Bid 12.08
8.0x155x174 Open Cell No Bid 19.42
4.75x155x17.4 Closed Cell No Bid 11.83
6.0x15.5x17.4 Closed Cell No Bid 12.85
8.0x15.5x17.4 Closed Cell No Bid 20.25
Anchors (price per unit) No Bid No Bid
Bid Bond: Yes
Pick-up Location: 30065 Al-59 Loxley, AL
Exceptions: None
BIDDER: Evans and Company, INC ee L e
Price Bid per Price Bid per
Dimensions (H x W x L) Type Square Foot Square Foot
Delivered Picked-up

4.75x15.5x17.4 Open Cell No Bid No Bid
6.0x15.5x17.4 Open Cell No Bid No Bid
8.0x15.5x17.4 Open Cell No Bid No Bid
4.75x15.5x17.4 Closed Cell No Bid No Bid
6.0x15.5x17.4 Closed Cell No Bid No Bid
8.0x155x17.4 Closed Cell No Bid No Bid
Anchors (price per unit) No Bid No Bid

Bid Bond: Yes

Pick-up Location: No Bid

Exceptions: None




COMPETITIVE BID #WG22-28 - Provision of Erosion Control Materia
Bid Tabulation - Standard Flexamats

BIDDER: Premier Concrete Products, INC
Price Bid per Price Bid per
Dimensions (L x W) Square Foot Square Foot
Delivered Picked-up
8'x 30' 3.43 3.10
8" x40' 3.43 3.10
8'x 50’ 3.43 3.10
12' x 30' 3.43 3.10
12'x 40' 3.43 3.10
12'x 50' 3.43 3.10
16'x 30' 3.43 3.10
16'x 40' 3.43 3.10
16'x 50' 3.43 3.10
Anchors (price per unit) 0.00 0.00
Bid Bond: Yes
Pick-up Location: 38200 La Hwy 16 Denham Springs, LA 70706
Exceptions: Bidder is not registered with the Alabama
Secretary of State to do business in Alabama
[BIDDER: Evans and Company, INC
Price Bid per Price Bid per
Dimensions (L x W) Square Foot Square Foot
Delivered Picked-up
8'x 30 5.05 5.05
8'x 40' 5.05 5.05
8'x 50' 5.05 5.05
12' x 30' 5.05 5.05
12' x 40" 5.05 5.05
12'x 50' 5.05 5.05
16' x 30' 5.05 5.05
16' x 40' 5.05 5.05
16'x 50' 5.05 5.05
Anchors (price per unit) 5.05 5.05
Bid Bond: Yes
Pick-up Location: Zeigler Blvd, Mobile
Exceptions: No Bid
BIDDER: Ferguson Waterworks it
Price Bid per Price Bid per
Dimensions (L x W) Square Foot Square Foot
Delivered Picked-up
8'x 30 6.50
8'x 40' 6.50
8'x50' 6.50
12'x 30' 6.50
12' x 40' 6.50
12'x 50' 6.50
16' x 30' 6.50
16' x 40' 6.50
16' x 50' 6.50
Anchors (price per unit) 44.00
Bid Bond: Yes
Pick-up Location: 30065 AL-59 Loxley, AL
Exceptions: No Bid




