

COMPETITIVE BID #WG22-26 BID TABULATION
Provision of Police Vehicle Accessories

BIDDER: Floyd's Exhaust & Performance Accessories, Inc.																			
GROUP #1	GROUP #2																		
SPRAY IN BEDLINERS FOR PICKUP TRUCKS	RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS																		
<table border="0"> <tr> <td></td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>5.5 Foot Regular Bed</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$450.00</td> <td>per vehicle</td> </tr> <tr> <td>6.5 Foot Regular Bed</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$500.00</td> <td>per vehicle</td> </tr> <tr> <td>6.5 Foot Utility Bed</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$700.00</td> <td>per vehicle</td> </tr> </table>		Amount Bid		5.5 Foot Regular Bed	\$450.00	per vehicle	6.5 Foot Regular Bed	\$500.00	per vehicle	6.5 Foot Utility Bed	\$700.00	per vehicle	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Amount Bid																		
5.5 Foot Regular Bed	\$450.00	per vehicle																	
6.5 Foot Regular Bed	\$500.00	per vehicle																	
6.5 Foot Utility Bed	\$700.00	per vehicle																	
Model	Amount Bid																		
No Bid		No Bid																	
ECCO EW3225 25" ECCO LED BAR	Base Mount																		
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>ECCWEW3225 LED Bar</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$470.00</td> <td>each</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		ECCWEW3225 LED Bar	\$470.00	each	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>	No Bid		No Bid									
Model	Amount Bid																		
ECCWEW3225 LED Bar	\$470.00	each																	
No Bid		No Bid																	
BETTER BUILT SEC 70" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010901	BROTHER POCKETJET 762 IN CAR PRINTER WITH BLUETOOTH																		
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>BBILPDeep70in</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$488.80</td> <td>each</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		BBILPDeep70in	\$488.80	each	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		No Bid		No Bid						
Model	Amount Bid																		
BBILPDeep70in	\$488.80	each																	
Model	Amount Bid																		
No Bid		No Bid																	
BETTER BUILT SEC 72" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010902	Base Mount																		
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>BBSLESeries 72in Drop</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$488.80</td> <td>each</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		BBSLESeries 72in Drop	\$488.80	each	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>	No Bid		No Bid									
Model	Amount Bid																		
BBSLESeries 72in Drop	\$488.80	each																	
No Bid		No Bid																	
RIGID LED POD LIGHT 50231 IN PAIRS	RAM PLASTIC PRINTER MOUNT																		
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>502313 Rigid Industries</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$423.59</td> <td>each</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		502313 Rigid Industries	\$423.59	each	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		No Bid		No Bid						
Model	Amount Bid																		
502313 Rigid Industries	\$423.59	each																	
Model	Amount Bid																		
No Bid		No Bid																	
DECKED LOCKABLE TRUCK STORAGE FULL BED UNIT PAR DF-4 TONNEAU COVER	Base Mount																		
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>DF-4 Full bed Unit Storage Decked</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$1,449.99</td> <td>each</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		DF-4 Full bed Unit Storage Decked	\$1,449.99	each	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>	No Bid		No Bid									
Model	Amount Bid																		
DF-4 Full bed Unit Storage Decked	\$1,449.99	each																	
No Bid		No Bid																	
TRIFOLD NON-LOCKABLE; BLACK	E-SEEK M-260 CARD READER AND CABLE																		
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>Undercover Flex</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$1,290.00</td> <td>each</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		Undercover Flex	\$1,290.00	each	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		No Bid		No Bid						
Model	Amount Bid																		
Undercover Flex	\$1,290.00	each																	
Model	Amount Bid																		
No Bid		No Bid																	
	Base Mount																		
	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>	No Bid		No Bid															
No Bid		No Bid																	
	DESKTOP FUJITSU F17030 OR CURRENT MODEL																		
	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		No Bid		No Bid												
Model	Amount Bid																		
No Bid		No Bid																	
	Base Mount																		
	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>	No Bid		No Bid															
No Bid		No Bid																	

BIDDER: ProLogic ITS, LLC																									
GROUP #1	GROUP #2																								
SPRAY IN BEDLINERS FOR PICKUP TRUCKS	RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS																								
<table border="0"> <tr> <td></td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>5.5 Foot Regular Bed</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> <tr> <td>6.5 Foot Regular Bed</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> <tr> <td>6.5 Foot Utility Bed</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>		Amount Bid		5.5 Foot Regular Bed		No Bid	6.5 Foot Regular Bed		No Bid	6.5 Foot Utility Bed		No Bid	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td>YEAR/Model</td> </tr> <tr> <td>RAM-VB-195-SW1 Computer Mount</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$180.62</td> <td>each 2015-2020 Ford F150</td> </tr> <tr> <td>RAM-VB-187-SW1 Computer Mount</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$178.47</td> <td>each 2011-2019 Ford Explorer</td> </tr> <tr> <td>RAM-VB-193-SW1 Computer Mount</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$271.29</td> <td>each 2015-2020 Tahoe</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid	YEAR/Model	RAM-VB-195-SW1 Computer Mount	\$180.62	each 2015-2020 Ford F150	RAM-VB-187-SW1 Computer Mount	\$178.47	each 2011-2019 Ford Explorer	RAM-VB-193-SW1 Computer Mount	\$271.29	each 2015-2020 Tahoe
	Amount Bid																								
5.5 Foot Regular Bed		No Bid																							
6.5 Foot Regular Bed		No Bid																							
6.5 Foot Utility Bed		No Bid																							
Model	Amount Bid	YEAR/Model																							
RAM-VB-195-SW1 Computer Mount	\$180.62	each 2015-2020 Ford F150																							
RAM-VB-187-SW1 Computer Mount	\$178.47	each 2011-2019 Ford Explorer																							
RAM-VB-193-SW1 Computer Mount	\$271.29	each 2015-2020 Tahoe																							
ECCO EW3225 25" ECCO LED BAR	Base Mount																								
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>Code 3 #CW3225</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$239.67</td> <td></td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		Code 3 #CW3225	\$239.67		<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td>YEAR/ Model</td> </tr> <tr> <td>RAM-VB-195 Base Mount</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$38.25</td> <td>each 2015-2020 Ford F150</td> </tr> <tr> <td>RAM-VB-187 Base Mount</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$35.52</td> <td>each 2011-2019 Ford Explorer</td> </tr> <tr> <td>RAM-VB-193 Base Mount</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$133.03</td> <td>each 2015-2020 Tahoe</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid	YEAR/ Model	RAM-VB-195 Base Mount	\$38.25	each 2015-2020 Ford F150	RAM-VB-187 Base Mount	\$35.52	each 2011-2019 Ford Explorer	RAM-VB-193 Base Mount	\$133.03	each 2015-2020 Tahoe						
Model	Amount Bid																								
Code 3 #CW3225	\$239.67																								
Model	Amount Bid	YEAR/ Model																							
RAM-VB-195 Base Mount	\$38.25	each 2015-2020 Ford F150																							
RAM-VB-187 Base Mount	\$35.52	each 2011-2019 Ford Explorer																							
RAM-VB-193 Base Mount	\$133.03	each 2015-2020 Tahoe																							
BETTER BUILT SEC 70" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010901	RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODEL 2021+																								
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>79010901 69In Saddle Truck Box low profile, Deep, Brite</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$451.00</td> <td></td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		79010901 69In Saddle Truck Box low profile, Deep, Brite	\$451.00		<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td>YEAR/ Model</td> </tr> <tr> <td>RAM-VB-195-SW1 Computer Mount</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$180.62</td> <td>each 2021+ Ford F150</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid	YEAR/ Model	RAM-VB-195-SW1 Computer Mount	\$180.62	each 2021+ Ford F150												
Model	Amount Bid																								
79010901 69In Saddle Truck Box low profile, Deep, Brite	\$451.00																								
Model	Amount Bid	YEAR/ Model																							
RAM-VB-195-SW1 Computer Mount	\$180.62	each 2021+ Ford F150																							
BETTER BUILT SEC 72" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010902	Base Mount																								
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>79010902 71in Saddle truck Box, low profile, Deep, Brite</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$451.00</td> <td></td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		79010902 71in Saddle truck Box, low profile, Deep, Brite	\$451.00		<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td>Year</td> </tr> <tr> <td>RAM-VB-202-A-SW1 Computer Mount</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$190.45</td> <td>each 2020+ Ford Explorer</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid	Year	RAM-VB-202-A-SW1 Computer Mount	\$190.45	each 2020+ Ford Explorer												
Model	Amount Bid																								
79010902 71in Saddle truck Box, low profile, Deep, Brite	\$451.00																								
Model	Amount Bid	Year																							
RAM-VB-202-A-SW1 Computer Mount	\$190.45	each 2020+ Ford Explorer																							
RIGID LED POD LIGHT 50231 IN PAIRS	RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODEL 2021+																								
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>50231 D2 Driving Light (Set of 2)</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$319.59</td> <td></td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		50231 D2 Driving Light (Set of 2)	\$319.59		<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td>Year</td> </tr> <tr> <td>RAM-VB-196 Base Mount</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$58.31</td> <td>each 2021+ Ford F150</td> </tr> <tr> <td>RAM-VB-202 Base Mount</td> <td style="text-align: right;">48.08</td> <td>each 2020+ Ford Explorer</td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid	Year	RAM-VB-196 Base Mount	\$58.31	each 2021+ Ford F150	RAM-VB-202 Base Mount	48.08	each 2020+ Ford Explorer									
Model	Amount Bid																								
50231 D2 Driving Light (Set of 2)	\$319.59																								
Model	Amount Bid	Year																							
RAM-VB-196 Base Mount	\$58.31	each 2021+ Ford F150																							
RAM-VB-202 Base Mount	48.08	each 2020+ Ford Explorer																							
DECKED LOCKABLE TRUCK STORAGE FULL BED UNIT PAR DF-4 TONNEAU COVER	BROTHER POCKETJET 762 IN CAR PRINTER WITH BLUETOOTH																								
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>Df-4 tTruck Bed Storage Solutions</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$1,134.08</td> <td></td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		Df-4 tTruck Bed Storage Solutions	\$1,134.08		<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>PJ762 (with LB3692-003 & Lb3603)</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$328.66</td> <td></td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		PJ762 (with LB3692-003 & Lb3603)	\$328.66													
Model	Amount Bid																								
Df-4 tTruck Bed Storage Solutions	\$1,134.08																								
Model	Amount Bid																								
PJ762 (with LB3692-003 & Lb3603)	\$328.66																								
TRIFOLD NON-LOCKABLE; BLACK	Base Mount																								
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>448339 MX4 tri- Folding Cover</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$905.63</td> <td></td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		448339 MX4 tri- Folding Cover	\$905.63		<table border="0"> <tr> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>	No Bid		No Bid															
Model	Amount Bid																								
448339 MX4 tri- Folding Cover	\$905.63																								
No Bid		No Bid																							
	RAM PLASTIC PRINTER MOUNT																								
	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>RAM-VPR-101-1 Ram U-Bolt Mount with Printer Cradle for Brother Pocketjet</td> <td style="text-align: right;">85.21</td> <td></td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		RAM-VPR-101-1 Ram U-Bolt Mount with Printer Cradle for Brother Pocketjet	85.21																			
Model	Amount Bid																								
RAM-VPR-101-1 Ram U-Bolt Mount with Printer Cradle for Brother Pocketjet	85.21																								
	Base Mount																								
	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>	No Bid		No Bid																					
No Bid		No Bid																							
	E-SEEK M-260 CARD READER AND CABLE																								
	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Model</td> <td style="text-align: right;">Amount Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>M260 2D Barcode & Magnetic Stripe ID Card Reader with CN8000 USB Cable</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$429.18</td> <td></td> </tr> </table>	Model	Amount Bid		M260 2D Barcode & Magnetic Stripe ID Card Reader with CN8000 USB Cable	\$429.18																			
Model	Amount Bid																								
M260 2D Barcode & Magnetic Stripe ID Card Reader with CN8000 USB Cable	\$429.18																								
	Base Mount																								
	<table border="0"> <tr> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>	No Bid		No Bid																					
No Bid		No Bid																							

Exception: Code 3 CW3225 is being offered instead of the Ecco Led bar