
COMPETITIVE BID #WG22-11 BID TABULATION
JANITORIAL SERVICES 

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
LOCATION Jani King JazzyClean BD & S Services Creek Clean LLC Service Master Keep It Clean Serv.

Bid Bond Yes No Yes No Yes No
Per/Month

Sheriffs Office 310 Hand Ave- Bay Minette $531.00 No Bid $2,477.48 $803.00 No Bid No Bid
Sheriff's Support Services Bldg - Bay Minette $292.00 No Bid $1,612.64 $1,860.00 No Bid No Bid
Criminal Investigation Division -Rdale $783.00 No Bid $4,152.48 $3,066.00 $636.00 $1,777.05
Law Enforcement Support Serv - Rdale $258.00 No Bid $2,717.70 $900.00 $456.00 $493.00
Law Enforcement Maintenance - Rdale $468.00 No Bid $1,692.01 $3,176.00 $539.00 $766.94
BRATS Agency-Robertsdale $829.00 $565.00 $4,250.43 $2,300.00 $637.00 $1,324.57
Silverill Barn & Maintenance Division $469.00 No Bid $2,451.69 $3,050.00 $604.00 $1,040.00
Parks Building- Silverhill $453.00 No Bid $2,451.68 $1,556.00 $299.00 $305.31
Foley Highway $512.00 No Bid $1,645.97 $1,366.00 $484.00 No Bid
Bay Minette Hwy $475.00 No Bid $1,412.98 $1,384.00 $384.00 No Bid
Solid Waste - New Admin Bldg - Magnolia $612.00 $705.00 $2,294.84 $1,650.00 $695.00 $596.82
Solid Waste - Scale House - Magnolia $87.00 $235.00 $204.13 $480.00 $222.00 $200.00
Solid Waste - Maintenance Shop - Magnolia $139.00 $280.00 $516.47 $900.00 $270.00 $205.86
Solid Wate - Residential Collections Bldg - Magnolia $399.00 $520.00 $1,125.59 $2,000.00 $495.00 $634.29

Per/Day
Sheriffs Office - Bay Minette $40.85 No Bid $189.62 $100.00 No Bid No Bid
Sheriff's Support Services Bldg - Bay Minette $22.46 No Bid $123.57 $155.00 No Bid No Bid
Criminal Investigation Division -Rdale $60.23 No Bid $318.20 $250.00 $48.92 $136.60
Law Enforcement Support Serv - Rdale $19.85 No Bid $208.26 $112.00 $35.08 $37.92
Law Enforcement Maintenance - Rdale $36.00 No Bid $129.66 $264.00 $41.46 $58.99
BRATS Agency-Robertsdale $63.77 $44.61 $325.71 $200.00 $49.00 $101.89
Silverill Barn & Maintenance Division $36.08 No Bid $187.87 $250.00 $46.46 $80.00
Parks Building- Silverhill $52.25 No Bid $281.80 $194.00 $34.50 $35.22
Foley Highway $59.05 No Bid $189.20 $170.00 $55.85 No Bid
Bay Minette Hwy $54.78 No Bid $162.41 $173.00 $44.31 No Bid
Solid Waste - New Admin Bldg - Magnolia $70.65 $81.35 $263.77 $205.00 $80.19 $68.86
Solid Waste - Scale House - Magnolia $10.09 $27.12 $23.46 $60.00 $25.62 $23.07
Solid Waste - Maintenance Shop - Magnolia $16.01 $32.31 $59.37 $115.00 $31.15 $23.70
Solid Wate - Residential Collections Bldg - Magnolia $46.07 $60.00 $129.38 $250.00 $57.12 $73.18

Note: 
Jazzy Clean In the event the Contractor is called in to perform cleanup other than the designated days,  
this will be charged by the day on the Bid Response Form and will include all normal daily activity.
Service Master submitted a $250.00 Bond

Exceptions: 
Creek Clean submitted a company check for their Bid Bond.  The bid specifications requires it to be a bid bond (individual or annual) 
postal money order, certified check, cashier's check or letter of credit.


