Competitive Bid #WG16-41 Bid Tabulation - Provision of Networking Equipment

Group- 1 Cisco Network Gear

TG Vss Venture |
Item# MFG. Part# Variation BID Price Variation BID Price Variation BID Price
1 Cisco WS-C3750X-48P-E $15,100.80 WS-C3850-48P-E $11,970.00 WS-C3850-48P-E $11,077.50
2 Cisco WS-C3750X-24P-E $8,112.00 WS-C3850-24P-E $6,441.00 WS-C3850-24P-E $5,960.75
3 Cisco C3KX-NM-10G $1,809.60 C3850-NM-2-10G, C3850-NM-4-1G $1,710.00 C3850-NM-2-10G, C3850-NM-4-1G $1,582.50
4 Cisco ASA5505-BUN-K9 $371.28 ASAS5506-X $567.00 ASA5506-X $539.79
5 Cisco WS-C3750X-24P-S $5,241.60 WS-C3850-48P-S $7,410.00 WS-C3850-48P-5 $6,857.50
6 Cisco WS-C3750X-48P-S $9,360.00 WS-C3850-24P-S $4,161.00 WS5-C3850-24P-5 $3,850.75
7 Cisco WS-C3560X-24P-5 $3,681.60 WS-C3650-24PS-S $2,907.00 WS-C3650-24PS-S $3,481.50
8 Cisco WS-C3560X-48P-S $6,489.60 WS-C3650-48PS-S $5,358.00 WS-C3650-48PS-S $5,749.75
9 Cisco X2-10GB-SR $1,244.88 $1,177.05 $1,102.24
10 Cisco X2-10GB-LR $2,496.00 $2,360.00 $2,210.00
11 Cisco X2-10GB-ER $6,240.00 $5,900.00 $5,525.00
12 Cisco SFP-10G-SR= $620.88 $587.05 $549.74
13 Cisco SFP-10G-LR= $2,492.88 $2,357.05 $2,207.24
14 Cisco SFP-10G-ER= $6,240.00 $5,900.00 $5,525.00
15 Cisco GLC-SX-MMD $312.00 295.00 $276.25
16 Cisco GLC-LH-SMD $620.88 $587.05 $549.74
17 Cisco WS-C3560-8PC-S $998.40 WS-C3560CX-8PC-S $966.15 WS-C3560CX-8PC-S $894.11
18 Cisco L-ISE-ADV3Y-1K= $24,336.00 $22,230.00 $20,572.50
19 Cisco WS-X45-SupT-E $12,476.88 WS-X45-Sup8-E $11,397.15 WS-X45-Sup8-E $10,547.36
20 Cisco PWR-C45-4200ACV $1,868.88 $1,707.15 $1,654.74
21 Cisco C4500E-LB-ES $12,476.88 $11,397.15 $10,547.36
22 Cisco WS-C4506-E $3,116.88 $2,847.15 $2,634.86
23 Cisco AIR-CAP2602I-A-K9 $745.68 AIR-CAP3802I-A-K9 $940.50 AIR-CAP28021-A-K9 $683.11
24 Cisco AIR-CAP2702I-A-K9 $683.28 AIR-CAP38021-A-K9 940.50 AIR-CAP3802I-A-K9 $870.38
25 Cisco AIR-CAP36021-A-K9 $1,026.48 AIR-CAP38021-A-K9 $940.50 AIR-CAP2802I-A-K9 5683.11
26 Cisco AIR-CAP3702I-A-K9 $932.88 AIR-CAP3802I-A-K9 940.50 AIR-CAP38021-A-K9 5870.38
27 Cisco AIR-CAP2802I-A-K9 $808.08 AIR-CAP3802I-A-K9 $940.50 AIR-CAP2802I-A-K9 $683.11
28 Cisco AIR-CAP3802I-A-K9 $1,029.00 AIR-CAP3802I-A-K9 $940.50 AIR-CAP38021-A-K9 $870.38
29 Cisco WS-C3560CX-12PC-S $1,307.28 $1,194.15 $1,105.11
30 Cisco WS-C3560CX-8PC-S $1,057.68 $966.15 $894.11
3 ADDON COMPUTERS [GLC-SX-MMD-AQ $56.33 $285.00 GLC-SX-MMD $276.25
32 ADDON COMPUTERS [GLC-LX-SMD-AQ $80.07 $567.15 GLC-LH-SMD $549.74
33 ADDON COMPUTERS | GLC-ZX-SMD-AQ $182.60 $2,277.15 GLC-ZX-SMD $2,207.24
34 ADDON COMPUTERS | SFP-10G-LR-AQ $440.83 $2,277.15 SFP-10G-LR= $2,207.24
35 ADDON COMPUTERS [SFP-10G-ER-AD $1,200.18 $5,700.00 SFP-10G-ER= $2,207.24
36 ADDON COMPUTERS [SFP-10G-SX-A0 $282.73 $567.15 SFP-10G-SR= $5,525.00
37 Cisco WS-X45-SUP7L-E $7,484.88 WS-X45-Sup8L-E $6,837.15 WS-X45-Sup8L-E $6,327.36
38 Cisco WS-X4748-RJ45V+E $5,612.88 $5,127.15 $4,744.86
39 Cisco A03-D300GA2= $249.74 UCS-HD300G10K12G= $336.87 $351.93
40 Cisco UCS-HD12TB10K12G= $619.04 $832.20 $872.35
41 Cisco WS-C3650-24PS-S $3,182.40 $2,907.00 $2,690.25
42 Cisco WS-C3650-48PS-S $5,865.60 $5,358.00 $4,958.50
43 Cisco CTS-SX10-K9 $2,489.76 $2,274.00 $2,464.58
44 Cisco CTS-5X20-PHD12X-K9 $7,425.60 $6,783.00 $6,455.75
45 Cisco CTS-SX80-IP60-K9 $15,537.60 $17,385.00 $13,508.25
46 Cisco CTS-SX80-IPST60-K9 $19,032.00 $14,193.00 $16,546.25
47 Cisco CTS-MX300-K9 $14,913.60 $13,623.00 $13,965.75
438 Cisco CTS-MX800S-2CAM-K9 $34,881.60 $31,863.00 $30,325.75
49 Cisco CTS-CTRL-DVX-10 $936.00 $855.00 $813.75

Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes BID RULES WERE NOT FOLLOWED
SEE EXCEPTION NOTE BELOW
Totals $253,771.72 _5238.083.22 $227,553.91

Exceptions: Venture Technologies submitted a personal check for their bid bond. The specifications requires that the bid bond be a postal money order, certified check,

Letter of Credit, or certain bonds of United States.
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Description:

|Cisco Network Equipment

Source Of Manufacturer Reference Price:

Manufacturer
Reference Discount

Item# MFG. Part # Description Price: Factor % Bid Price $

1 Cisco WS-C3750X-48P-E Catalyst 3750X 24 Port PoE IP Services $24,200.00 37.60% $15,100.80
2 Cisco WS-C3750X-24P-E Catalyst 3750X 24 Port PoE IP Services $13,000.00 37.60% $8,112.00
3 Cisco C3KX-NM-10G Catalyst 3K-X 10G Network Module option PID $2,900.00 37.60%! $1,809.60
4 Cisco ASA5505-BUN-K9 ASA 5505 Appliance with SW 10 Users 8 ports 3DES/AES $595.00 37.60%! $371.28
5 Cisco WS-C3750X-24P-S Catalyst 3750X 24 Port PoE IP Base $8,400.00 37.60% $5,241,60
6 Cisco WS-C3750X-48P-S Catalyst 3750X 48 Port PoE IP Base $15,000.00 37.60% 9,360.00
7 Cisco WS-C3560X-24P-5 Catalyst 3560X 24 Port PoE IP Base $5,900.00 37.60% 3,681.60
8 Cisco WS-C3560X-48P-S Catalyst 3560X 48 Port PoE IP Base $10,400.00 37.60% 6,489.60
9 Cisco X2-10GB-SR 10GBASE-SR X2 MODULE $1,995.00 37.60%. $1,244.88
10 Cisco X2-10GB-LR 10GBASE-LR X2 MODULE $4,000.00 37.60%! $2,496.00
11 Cisco X2-10GB-ER 10GBASE-ER X2 MODULE $10,000.00 37.60%! $6,240.00
12 Cisco SFP-10G-SR= 10GBASE-SR SFP Module $995.00 37.60% $620.88
13 Cisco SFP-10G-LR= 10GBASE-LR SFP Module $3,995.00 37.60% $2,492.88
14 Cisco SFP-10G-ER= 10GBASE-ER SFP Module $10,000.00 37.60% $6,240.00
15 Cisco GLC-SX-MMD GE SFP, LC connector SX transceiver $500.00 37.60% 312.00
16 Cisco GLC-LH-SMD GE SFP, LC connector LX/LH transceiver $995.00 37.60% 620.88
17 Cisco WS-C3560-8PC-S CATALYST 3560 COMPACT 8 10/100 POE + 1 T/SFP; IP BASE IMAGE $1,600.00 37.60% $998.40
18 Cisco L-ISE-ADV3Y-1K= Cisco ISE 1000 EndPoint 3Year Advanced Subscription License $39,000.00 37.60% $24,336.00
19 Cisco WS-X45-Sup7-E Cisco Catalyst 4500 Series Supervisor Engine 7-E $19,995.00 37.60% $12,476.88
20 Cisco PWR-C45-4200ACV Cisco Catalyst 4500 Series 4200W AC power supply (with integrated PoE) $2,995.00 37.60% $1,868.88
21 Cisco C4500E-LB-ES Lan Base to Eneterprise Services paper license $19,995.00 37.60% $12,476.88
22 Cisco WS-C4506-E Cisco Catalyst E-Series 4506 switch (6-slot chassis), fan, no power supply $1,995.00 37.60% $1,244.88
23 Cisco AIR-CAP2602I-A-K9 AIRONET CAP 11N 600MB 5GHZ WPA INT ANT WITH CLEANAIR 3X4:35S MOD $1,195.00 37.60% $745.68
24 Cisco AIR-CAP2702I-A-K9 AIRONET 11AC CAP W/ CLEANAIR3X4:3SS INT ANT A REG DOMAIN $1,095.00 37.60%! $683.28
25 Cisco AIR-CAP3602I-A-K9 CISCQO AIRONET 3602I IEEE 802.11N (DRAFT) 450 MBPS WIRELESS ACCESS POINT - POWER OVER ETHERNET - CEILING-MOUNTABLE $1,645.00 37.60%! $1,026.48
26 Cisco AIR-CAP37021-A-K9 AIRONET 11AC CTLR AP 4X4:3SSW/CLEANAIR INT ANT A REG DOMAIN $1,495.00 37.60% $932.88
27 Cisco AIR-CAP2802I-A-K9 AIRONET 11AC CAP W/ CLEANAIR3X4:3SS INT ANT A REG DOMAIN 1,295.00 37.60%! $808.08
28 Cisco AIR-CAP3802I-A-K9 AIRQONET 11AC CTLR AP 4X4:3SSW/CLEANAIR INT ANT A REG DOMAIN $1,650.00 37.60% $1,029.60
29 Cisco WS-C3560CX-12PC-S CATALYST 3560-CX 12PORT POE IPBASE $2,095.00 37.60% $1,307.28
30 Cisco WS-C3560CX-8PC-S CATALYST 3560-CX 8PORT POE IPBASE $1,695.00 37.60% $1,057.68
31 ADDON COMPUTERS |GLC-SX-MMD-AQ 1000Base-SX SFP Transceiver $90.00 37.60% $56.16
32 ADDON COMPUTERS |GLC-LX-SMD-AQ 1000Base-LX SFP Transceiver 130.00 38.41% $80.07
33 ADDON COMPUTERS | GLC-ZX-SMD-AQ 1000Base-ZX SFP Transceiver 310.00 41.10% $182.59
34 ADDON COMPUTERS | SFP-10G-LR-AQ 10GBase-LR SFP+ Transceiver 750.00 41.22% $440.85
35 ADDON COMPUTERS |SFP-10G-ER-AQ 10GBase-ER SFP+ Transceiver $2,080.00 42.30% $1,200.16
36 ADDON COMPUTERS |SFP-10G-SX-A0 10GBase-SX SFP+ Transceiver $480.00 41.10% $282.72
37 Cisco WS-X45-SUPTL-E Catalyst 4500 E-Series Supervisor LE, 520Gbps $11,995.00 37.60% $7,484.88
38 Cisco WS-X4748-RJ45V+E 48PORT 10/100/1000 RJ45 POE 802.3AT CATALYST 4500 K10 $8,995.00 37.60% $5,612.88
39 Cisco AD3-D300GA2= 300GB SAS 10K RPM SFF 6GB HDD/HOT PLUG/DRIVE SLED MOUNTED $589.00 57.60% $249.74
40 Cisco UCS-HD12TB10K12G= 1.2 TB 12G SAS 10K RPM SFF HDD $1,460.00 57.60% $619.04
4 Cisco WS-C3650-24P5-S CISCO CATALYST 3650 24 PORT POE 4X1G UPLINK IP BASE $5,100.00 37.60%) $3,182.40
42 Cisco WS-C3650-48P5-8 CISCO CATALYST 3650 48 PORT POE 4X1G UPLINK IP BASE $9,400.00 37.60% $5,865.60
43 Cisco CTS-SX10-K9 $X10 HD w/ wall mount int 5x cam and mic $3,990.00 37.60% $2,489.76
44 Cisco CTS-5X20-PHD12X-K9 $X20 Quick Set HD NPP 12xPHDCam 1 mic_remote cntrl $11,900.00 37.60% $7,425.60
45 Cisco CTS-5X80-IP60-K9 Cisco SX80 Codec Precision 60 Cam Touch 10 $24,900.00 37.60% $15,537.60
46 Cisco CTS-SX80-IPST60-KS Cisco SX80 Codec Speaker Track 60 Touch 10 30,500.00 37.60% 19,032.00
47 Cisco CTS-MX300-K9 Cisco TelePresence MX300 55 Gen 2 PHD 1080p 8x Touch Mic 23,900.00 37.60% 14,913.60
48 Cisco CTS-MX8005-2CAM-K$ Cisco MX800 NPP Single 70 55,900.00 37.60% 34,881.60
49 Cisco CTS-CTRL-DVX-10 TOUCH 10 CONTROL DEVICE $1,500.00 37.60% $936.00]
50 Cisco Catalog Discount % This would be the overall discount on all other items not listed above. 37.60% $0.00|
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Description:

[Cisco Network Equipment

Source Of Manufacturer Reference Price:

Manutacturer
Reference Discount

ltem# MFG. Part # Description Price: Factor % Bid Price $

1 Cisco WS-C3850-48P-E Catalyst 3850 24 Port PoE IP Services $21,000.00 43.00% $11,970.00
2 Cisco WS-C3850-24P-E Catalyst 3850 24 Port PoE IP Services $11,300.00 43.00% $6,441.00
3 Cisco C3850-NM-2-10G Catalyst 3850 4 x 1GE Network Module $2,500.00 43.00% $1,425.00
4 Cisco C3850-NM-4-1G Catalyst 3850 2 x 10GE Network Module $500.00 43.00% $285.00
5 Cisco ASA5506-FPWR-BUN ASA 5506-X with Firepower Svcs $995.00 43.00% $567.15
[ Cisco WS-C3850-48P-5 Catalyst 3850 48 Port PoE IP Base $13,000.00 43.00% $7,410.00
7 Cisco WS- 3850-24P-S Catalyst 3850 24 Port PoE IP Base $73,000.00 43.00% $41,610.00
8 Cisco WS-C3650-24PS-S CISCO CATALYST 3650 24 PORT POE 4X1G UPLINK IP BASE $5,100.00 43.00% $2,907.00
9 Cisco WS-C3650-48PS-S CISCO CATALYST 3650 48 PORT POE 4X1G UPLINK IP BASE $9,400.00 41.00% $5,546.00
10 Cisco X2-10GB-SR 10GBASE-SR X2 MODULE $1,995.00 41.00% $1,177.05
11 Cisco X2-10GB-LR 10GBASE-LR X2 MODULE $4,000.00 41.00% $2,360.00
12 Cisco X2-10GB-ER 10GBASE-ER X2 MODULE $10,000.00 41.00% $5,900.00
13 Cisco SFP-10G-SR= 10GBASE-SR SFP Module $995.00 41.00% $587.05
14 Cisco SFP-10G-LR= 10GBASE-LR SFP Module $3,995.00 41.00% $2,357.05
15 Cisco SFP-10G-ER= 10GBASE-ER SFP Module $10,000.00 41.00% $5,900.00
16 Cisco GLC-SX-MMD GE SFP, LC connector SX transceiver $500.00 41.00% $295.00
17 Cisco GLC-LH-SMD GE SFP, LC connector LX/LH transceiver $995.00 41.00% $587.05
18 Cisco WS-C3560CX-8PC-S CATALYST 3560-CX 8PORT POE IPBASE $1,695.00 43.00% $966.15
19 Cisco L-ISE-ADV3Y-1K= Cisco ISE 1000 EndPoint 3Year Advanced Subscription License $39,000.00 43.00% $22,230.00
20 Cisco WS-X45-5up8-E Cisco Catalyst 4500 Series Supervisor Engine 8-E $19,995.00 43.00% $11,397.15
21 Cisco PWR-C45-4200ACV Cisco Catalyst 4500 Series 4200W AC power supply (with integrated PoE) $2,995.00 43.00% $1,707.15
22 Cisco C4500E-LB-ES Lan Base to Eneterprise Services paper license $19,995.00 43.00% $11,397.15
23 Cisco WS-C4506-E Cisco Catalyst E-Series 4506 switch (6-slot chassis), fan, no power supply 4,995.00 43.00% $2,847.15
24 Cisco AIR-CAP38021-A-K9 AIRONET 11AC CTLR AP 4X4:3SSW/CLEANAIR INT ANT A REG DOMAIN 1,650.00 43.00% $940.50
25 Cisco WS-C3560CX-12PC-S CATALYST 3560-CX 12PORT POE IPBASE 2,095.00 43.00% $1,194.15
26 Cisco WS-C3560CX-8PC-S CATALYST 3560-CX 8PORT POE IPBASE $1,695.00 43.00% $966.15
27 ADDON COMPUTERS |GLC-SX-MMD-AQ 1000Base-SX SFP Transceiver $500.00 43.00% $285.00
28 ADDON COMPUTERS |GLC-LX-SMD-AQ 1000Base-LX SFP Transceiver $995.00 43.00% $567.15
29 ADDON COMPUTERS |GLC-ZX-SMD-AQ 1000Base-ZX SFP Transceiver $3,995.00 43.00% $2,277.15
30 ADDON COMPUTERS |SFP-10G-LR-AQ 10GBase-LR SFP+ Transceiver $3,995.00 43.00% $2,277.15
AN ADDON COMPUTERS |SFP-10G-ER-AQ 10GBase-ER SFP+ Transceiver $10,000.00 43.00% $5,700.00
32 ADDON COMPUTERS |SFP-10G-SX-AQ 10GBase-SX SFP+ Transceiver $995.00 43.00% $567.15
34 Cisco WS-X45-SUPSL-E Catalyst 4500 E-Series Supervisor 8-LE $11,995.00 43.00% $6,837.15
35 Cisco WS-X4748-RJ45V+E 48PORT 10/100/1000 RJ45 POE 802.3AT CATALYST 4500 K10 $8,995.00 43.00% $5,127.15
36 Cisco UCS-HD300G10K12G= 300GB SAS 10K RPM SFF 6GB HDD/HOT PLUG/DRIVE SLED MOUNTED $591.00 43.00% $336.87
37 Cisco UCS-HD12TB10K12G= 1.2 TB 12G SAS 10K RPM SFF HDD $1,460.00 43.00% $832.20
38 Cisco WS-C3650-24PS-S CISCO CATALYST 3650 24 PORT POE 4X1G UPLINK IP BASE $5,100.00 43.00% $2,907.00
39 Cisco WS-C3650-48PS-S CISCO CATALYST 3650 48 PORT POE 4X1G UPLINK IP BASE $9,400.00 43.00% $5,358.00
40 Cisco CTS-SX10-K9 $X10 HD w/ wall mount int 5x cam and mic $3,990.00 43.00% $2,274.30
41 Cisco CTS-8X20-PHD12X-K9 $X20 Quick Set HD NPP 12xPHDCam 1 mic remote cntrl $11,900.00 43.00% $6,783.00
42 Cisco CTS-SX80-IP60-K9 Cisco SX80 Codec Precision 80 Cam Touch 10 $30,500.00 43.00% $17,385.00
43 Cisco CTS-SX80-IPST60-K9 Cisco SX80 Codec Speaker Track 60 Touch 10 $24,900.00 43.00% $14,193.00
44 Cisco CTS-MX300-K9 Cisco TelePresence MX300 55 Gen 2 PHD 1080p 8x Touch Mic $23,900.00 43.00% $13,623.00
45 Cisco CTS-MX8005-2CAM-K9 Cisco MX800 NPP Single 70 $55,900.00 43.00% $31,863.00
46 Cisco CTS-CTRL-DVX-10 TOUCH 10 CONTROL DEVICE $1,500.00 43.00% $855.00




VENTURE

[ #

Description: |Cisco Network Equipment
Source Of Manufacturer Reference Price: |
WManufacturer
Reference Discount

ltem# MFG. Part # Description Price: Factor % Bid Price $

1 Cisco WS-C3850-48P-E Catalyst 3850 24 Port PoE IP Services $21,000.00 47.25% $11,077.50
2 Cisco WS-C3850-24P-E Catalyst 3850 24 Port PoE IP Services $11,300.00 47.25% $5,960.75
3 Cisco C3850-NM-4-1G Catalyst 3850 2 x 10GE Network Module $500.00 47.25% $263.75
4 Cisco C3850-NM-2-10G Catalyst 3850 4 x 1GE Network Module $2,500.00 47.25% $1,318.75
5 Cisco ASA5506-FPWR-BUN ASA 5506-X with Firepower Svcs $995.00 45.75% $539.79
6 Cisco WS-C3850-48P-S Catalyst 3850 24 Port PoE IP Base $7,300.00 47.25% $3,850.75
T. Cisco WS-C3850-24P-S Catalyst 3850 24 Port PoE IP Base $13,000.00 47.25% $6,857.50
8 Cisco WS-C3650-24PD-S CISCO CATALYST 3650 24 PORT POE 2X10G UPLINK IP BASE $6,600.00 47.25% $3,481.50
9 Cisco WS-C3650-48PD-S CISCO CATALYST 3650 48 PORT POE 2X10G UPLINK IP BASE $10,900.00 47.25% $5,749.75
10 Cisco X2-10GB-SR 10GBASE-SR X2 MODULE $1,995.00 44.75% $1,102.24
11 Cisco X2-10GB-LR 10GBASE-LR X2 MODULE $4,000.00 44.75% $2,210.00
12 Cisco X2-10GB-ER 10GBASE-ER X2 MODULE $10,000.00 44.75% $5,525.00
13 Cisco SFP-10G-SR= 10GBASE-SR SFP Module $995.00 44.75% $549.74
14 Cisco SFP-10G-LR= 10GBASE-LR SFP Module $3,995.00 44.75% $2,207.24
15 Cisco SFP-10G-ER= 10GBASE-ER SFP Module $10,000.00 44.75% $5,525.00
16 Cisco GLC-SX-MMD GE SFP, LC connector SX transceiver $500.00 44.75% $276.25
17 Cisco GLC-LH-SMD GE SFP, LC connector LX/LH transceiver $995.00 44.75% $549.74
18 Cisco WS-C3560CX-8PC-5 CATALYST 3560-CX 8PORT POE IPBASE $1,695.00 47.25% $894.11
19 Cisco L-ISE-ADV3Y-1K= Cisco ISE 1000 EndPoint 3Year Advanced Subscription License $39,000.00 47.25% $20,572.50
20 Cisco WS-X45-Sup8-E Cisco Catalyst 4500 Series Supervisor Engine 8-E $19,995.00 47.25% $10,547.36
21 Cisco PWR-C45-4200ACV Cisco Catalyst 4500 Series 4200W AC power supply (with integrated PoE) $2,995.00 44.75% $1,654.74
22 Cisco C4500E-LB-ES Lan Base to Eneterprise Services paper license $19,995.00 47.25% $10,547.36
23 Cisco WS-C4506-E Cisco Catalyst E-Series 4506 switch (6-slot chassis), fan, no power supply 4,995.00 47.25% $2,634.86
24 Cisco AIR-CAP28021-A-K9 AIRONET 11AC CAP W/ CLEANAIR3X4:3SS INT ANT A REG DOMAIN 1,295.00 47.25% $683.11
25 Cisco AIR-CAP38021-A-K9 AIRONET 11AC CTLR AP 4X4:3SSW/CLEANAIR INT ANT A REG DOMAIN 1,650.00 47.25% $870.38
26 Cisco WS-C3560CX-12PC-S CATALYST 3560-CX 12PORT POE IPBASE 2,095.00 47.25% $1,105.11
27 Cisco WS-C3560CX-8PC-S CATALYST 3560-CX 8PORT POE IPBASE 1,695.00 47.25% $894.11
28 Cisco GLC-SX-MMD GE SFP, LC connector SX transceiver $500.00 44.75% 276.25
29 Cisco GLC-LH-SMD GE SFP, LC connector LX/LH transceiver $995.00 44.75% 549.74
30 Cisco GLC-ZX-SMD GE SFP, LC connector ZX transceiver $3,995.00 44.75% $2,207.24
3 Cisco SFP-10G-LR= 10GBASE-LR SFP Module $3,995.00 44.75% $2,207.24
32 Cisco SFP-10G-ER= 10GBASE-ER SFP Module $10,000.00 44.75% $5,525.00
33 Cisco SFP-10G-SR= 10GBASE-SR SFP Module $995.00 44.75% $549.74
34 Cisco WS-X45-SUPSL-E Catalyst 4500 E-Series Supervisor 8-LE $11,995.00 47.25% $6,327.36
35 Cisco WS-X4748-RJ45V+E 48PORT 10/100/1000 RJ45 POE 802.3AT CATALYST 4500 K10 $8,995.00 47.25% $4,744.86
36 Cisco A03-D300GA2= 300GB SAS 10K RPM SFF 6GB HDD/HOT PLUG/DRIVE SLED MOUNTED $589.00 40.25% $351.93
37 Cisco UCS-HD12TB10K12G= 1.2 TB 12G SAS 10K RPM SFF HDD 1,460.00 40.25% $872.35
38 Cisco WS-C3650-24PS-S CISCO CATALYST 3650 24 PORT POE 4X1G UPLINK IP BASE 5,100.00 47.25% 2,690.25
39 Cisco WS-C3650-48PS-S CISCO CATALYST 3650 48 PORT POE 4X1G UPLINK IP BASE 9,400.00 47.25% 54,958.50
40 Cisco CTS-SX10-K9 $X10 HD w/ wall mount int 5x cam and mic $3,990.00 45.75% $2,164.58
41 Cisco CTS-5X20-PHD12X-K9 5X20 Quick Set HD NPP 12xPHDCam 1 mic remote cntrl $11,900.00 45.75% $6,455.75
42 Cisco CTS-SX80-IP60-K9 Cisco SX80 Codec Precision 60 Cam Touch 10 $24,900.00 45.75% $13,508.25
43 Cisco CTS-SX80-IPST60-K9 Cisco SX80 Codec Speaker Track 60 Touch 10 $30,500.00 45.75% $16,546.25
44 Cisco CTS-MX300-K9 Cisco TelePresence MX300 55 Gen 2 PHD 1080p 8x Touch Mic $23,900.00 45.75% $12,965.75
45 Cisco CTS-MX800S-2CAM-K9 Cisco MX800 NPP Single 70 $55,900.00 45.75% $30,325.75
46 Cisco CTS-CTRL-DVX-10 [TOUCH 10 CONTROL DEVICE $1,500.00 45.75% $813.75




Bid Group:

#2

Description:

Cisco Smartnet Maint.

Source Of Manufacturer Reference Price:

Discount Discount

Item# MFG. Part # Description TIG Factor % VSS Factor % Venture Discount Factor %
Smartnet Maint. 8x5 NBD ( on Items listed in Group 1 ) Please

1 Cisco provide an itemized sheet in this format. 16.00% 20.00% 16.75%
Smartnet Maint. 24x7x4 ( on Items listed in Group 1) Please

2 Cisco provide an itemized sheet in this format. 16.00% 20.00% 16.75%
Smartnet Maint. 8x5 NBD ( provide a discount percentage off

3 Cisco Catalog Discount % on all other catalog items 16.00% 20.00% 16.75%
Smartnet Maint. 24x7x4 ( provide a discount percentage off on

4 Cisco Catalog Discount % all other catalog items 16.00% 20.00% 16.75%

BID RULES WERE NOT FOLLOWED
SEE EXCEPTION NOTE BELOW

Exceptions: Venture Technologies submitted a personal check for their bid bond. The specifications requires that the bid bond be a postal money order, certified check,
Letter of Credit, or certain bonds of United States.




Bid Group: | #3

Description:| VSS | Cisco Smartnet Maint. Existing Equipment

Source Of Manufacturer Reference Price:

Manutacturer
Reference Discount
litem# MFG.  Serial # Description Service Price: Factor % Bid Price $

1 Cisco SWSS UPGRADES Pl 1.2 - Lifecycle -100 Deviee Lic CON-ECMU-PI12LF1H 12.00%

2 Cisco FTX1930105U ASA5525-FPWR-K9 CON-SNT-A25FPKE $1,842.00 12.00% $1,620.96
3 Cisco FTX19301058 ASA5525-FPWR-K9 CON-SNT-A25FPK9 1,842.00 12.00% $1,620.96
4 Cisco SPE1945003X WS-C4503E-S7L+48V+ CON-SNTP-C450387L 1,004.00 12.00% $883.52
5 Cisco FDO1423R218 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE 1,356.00 12.00% $1,193.28
6 Cisco FCH2004VOWS UCS-SP-C220M4-51 CON-SNTP-SMC2208 $499.00 12.00% $439.12
7 Cisco SW APP SUPP + UPGR Cisco Identity Services Engine Virtual CON-SAU-ISEVM 1,198.00 12.00% 1,054.24
8 Cisco CAT1106WO5R WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE 1,356.00 12.00% 1,193.28
9 Cisco FDO1427R1QH WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE 1,356.00 12.00% 1,193.28
10 Cisco FDO1435Y1DR WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE b1,356.00 12.00% 1,193.28
11 Cisco FDO1439V0LD WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE 1,356.00 12.00% 1,193.28
12 Cisco FDO1439VOKS WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 12.00% 1,193.28
13 Cisco FDO1439VOK7 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE 1,356.00 12.00% 1,193.28
14 Cisco FDO1152V0J0 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE 1,356.00 12.00% 1,193.28
15 Cisco FDO1423R21N WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 12.00% 1,193.28
16 Cisco FDO1423R22K WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 12.00% 1,193.28
17 Cisco FDO1202V011 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE 51,356.00 12.00% 1,193.28
18 Cisco FD01437V053 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE 51,356.00 12.00% $1,193.28
19 Cisco FDO1734702E WS-C3750%-125-8 CON-SNT-C375X128 1,200.00 12.00% 1,056.00
20 Cisco FDO1734Z0CZ WS-C3750%-245-E CON-SNT-C375X24E 1,200.00 12.00% 1,056.00
21 Cisco FOX1538G5EH WS-C4510R+E CON-SNTP-C4510R+E 8,400.00 12.00% 7,392.00
22 Cisco FOX1616G3WR WS-C4510R+E CON-SNTP-4510RES7 4,546.00 12.00% $4,000.48
23 Cisco FXS1648Q2EH WS-C4510R+E CON-SNTP-4510RES7 4,546.00 12.00% 4,000.48
24 Cisco FXS1648Q284 WS-C4510R+E CON-SNTP-4510RES7 4,546.00 12.00% 4,000.48
25 Cisco FCW1620L008 AIR-CT5508-K9 CON-SNT-CT08100 5,199.00 12.00% 4,575.12
26 Cisco FCW1628L08R AIR-CT5508-K9 CON-SNT-CT08100 5,199.00 12.00% 4,5675.12
27 Cisco FXS1822Q13P WS-C4507RE+06V+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV 2,146.00 12.00% 1,888.48
28 Cisco FXS1822Q18Z WS-C4507RE+98V+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV 2,146.00 12.00% 1,888.48
29 Cisco FXS1930Q3RK WS-C4507RE+98V+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV 2,146.00 12.00% 1,888.48
30 Cisco FXS$1931Q4W9 WS-C4507RE+06V+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV 2,146.00 12.00% 1,888.48
31 Cisco EXS1046Q1SN WS-CAS0TRE-96V+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV 2,146.00 12.00% 1,888.48
32 Cisco WZP1725008T UCS-SP6-C22V CON-SNTP-SPBC22V $265.00 12.00% $233.20
33 Cisco L-ASAS5525-TAMC= L-ASA5525-TAMC-1Y $3.085.00 12.00% $2,714.80
34 Cisco L-ASA5525-TAMC= L-ASA5525-TAMC-1Y $3,085.00 12.00% $2,714.80
35 Cisco L-PI2X-AS-100-P CON-ECMU-PI2XPATH 12.00% $0.00
36 Cisco 7371J558DEC SW APP SUPP + UPGR Cisco FireSIGHT CON-SAU-VMWSW2 $100.00 12.00% $88.00
37 Cisco WKK19152156 CTS-MIC-TABLEO CON-ECDN-CTSMICTB $48.00 12.00% $42.24
38 Cisco FCZ1938502U CTS-MX700D-2CAM-K9 CON-ECDN-MX700D2C $5,031.00 12.00% $4,427.28
39 Cisco FCH1941V2N1 TCS-SMB-C220-K9 CON-ECDN-SMBCK9 $1,045.00 12.00% $919.60
40 Cisco CTS-MIC-CLNG CON-ECDN-SMICCLNG $160.00 12.00% $140.80
“ Cisco CTI-TMS-SW-K9 CON-ECMU-CTITMSSW $912.00 12.00% $802.56
42 Cisco LIC-TMS-25 CON-ECMU-LICTMS25 $4,894.00 12.00% $4,306.72
43 Cisco LIC-TP-SMP CON-ECMU-LICTPSMP $1,440.00 12.00% $1.267.20
44 Cisco R-PI2X-K9 CON-ECMU-PI2XKSB 12.00% $0.00
45 Cisco R-CBEBK-K9 CON-ECMU-RCBEEBKK $100.00 12.00% $88.00
46 Cisco R-VTS-K9 CON-ECMU-RVTSKS 12.00% 0.00
A7 Cisco TP-SMP-K9 CON-ECMU-TPSMPKO 12.00% 0.00
48 Cisco UCM-10X-UWLPRO CON-ECMU-UCM10XUL $60.00 12.00% $52.80
49 Cisco UCM-11X-TP-UCL CON-ECMU-UCMUCLTP $78.00 12.00% $52.80
50 Cisco /CS-C-GWBDL CON-ECMU-VCSCGWBD $2,030.00 12.00% $68.64
51 Cisco FCH1937V2EY BEGH-M4-Kg= CON-SNT-BEGHM4Ka 315.00 12.00% $1,786.40
52 Cisco FCH1936V1VF BEBH-M4-Ko= CON-SNT-BESHM4Ka 315.00 12.00% $277.20
53 Cisco FCH1910V13A CTR410V-VT$-Kg CON-SNT-CTI-410V 473.00 12.00% $277.20




Bid Group:

TIG

#3

Description:

Cisco Smartnet Maint. Existing Equipment

Source Of Manufacturer Reference Price:

Manutacturer
Reference Discount

ltem# MFG. Serial # Description Service Price: Factor % Bid Price $

1 Cisco SWSS UPGRADES PI 1.2 - Lifecycle -100 Device Lic CON-ECMU-PI2LF1H $1,799.00 18.00% $1,475.18
2 Cisco FTX1930105U ASA5525-FPWR-K9 CON-SNT-A25FPK9 $1,842.00 9.00% $1,676.22
3 Cisco FTX19301055 ASA5525-FPWR-K9 CON-SNT-A25FPK9 $1,842.00 9.00% $1,676.22
4 Cisco SPE1945003X WS-C4503E-S7L+48V+ CON-SNTP-C4503S7L $1,004.00 18.00% $823.28
5 Cisco FDO1423R21B WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 9.00% $1,233.96
6 Cisco FCH2004VOWS UCS-SP-C220M4-S1 CON-SNTP-SMC220S $559.00 18.00% $458.38
7 Cisco SW APP SUPP + UPGR Cisco Identity Services Engine Virtual CON-SAU-ISEVM $1,198.00 18.00% $982.36
8 Cisco CAT1106W05R WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 9.00% $1,233.96
9 Cisco FDO1427R1QH WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 9.00% $1,233.96
10 Cisco FDO1435Y1DR WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 9.00% $1,233.96
11 Cisco FDO1439VOLD WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 9.00% $1,233.96
12 Cisco FDO1439V0K9 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 9.00% $1,233.96
13 Cisco FDO1439V0K7 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 9.00% $1,233.96
14 Cisco FDO1152V0J0 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 9.00% $1,233.96
15 Cisco FDO1423R21N WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 9.00% $1,233.96
16 Cisco FDO1423R22K WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 9.00% $1,233.96
17 Cisco FDO1202V011 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 9.00% $1,233.96
18 Cisco FD01437V053 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE $1,356.00 9.00% $1,233.96
19 Cisco FDO1734Z02E WS-C3750X%-125-S CON-SNT-C375X12S $1,200.00 9.00% $1,092.00
20 Cisco FDO1734Z0CZ WS-C3750X%-24S-E CON-SNT-C375X24E $1,900.00 9.00% $1,729.00
21 Cisco FOX1538G5EH WS-C4510R+E CON-SNTP-C4510R+E $8,400.00 9.00% $7.644.00
22 Cisco FOX1616G3WR WS-C4510R+E CON-SNTP-4510RES7 $4,546.00 9.00% $4,136.86
23 Cisco FXS1648Q2EH WS-C4510R+E CON-SNTP-4510RES7 $4,546.00 9.00% $4,136.86
24 Cisco FXS1648Q2EH WS-C4510R+E CON-SNTP-4510RES7 $4,546.00 9.00% $4.,136.86
25 Cisco FCW1629L008 AIR-CT5508-K9 CON-SNT-CT08100 $5,199.00 9.00% $4,731.09




26 Cisco FCW1628L0BR AIR-CT5508-K9 CON-SNT-CT08100 $5,199.00 9.00% $4,731.09
27 Cisco EX$1822Q13p WS-C4507RE+96V+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV $2,146.00 9.00% $1,952.86
28 Cisco FXS1822Q18Z WS-C4507RE+96V+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV $2,146.00 9.00% $1,952.86
29 Cisco FXS1930Q3RK WS-C4507RE+98V+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV $2,146.00 18.00% $1,759.72
30 Cisco FX$1931Q4W9 WS-C4507RE+08V+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV $2,146.00 18.00% $1,759.72
31 Cisco FXS1946Q1SN WS-C4507REHI6V+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV $2,146.00 18.00% $1,759.72
32 Cisco WZP1725008T UCS-8P6-C22V CON-SNTP-SP8C22V $265.00 9.00% $241.15
33 Cisco L-ASA5525-TAMC= L-ASA5525-TAMC-1Y $6,170.00 38.00% $3,825.40
34 Cisco L-ASA5525-TAMC= L-ASA5525-TAMC-1Y $6,170.00 38.00% $3,825.40
35 Cisco L-PI2X-AS-100-P CON-ECMU-PIZXPATH $2,700.00 18.00% $2,214.00
36 Cisco 7371J558DEC SW APP SUPP + UPGR Cisco FireSIGHT CON-SAU-VMWSW?2 $100.00 9.00% $91.00
37 Cisco WKK19152156 CTS-MIC-TABLEO CON-ECDN-CTSMICTB $48.00 18.00% $30.36
38 Cisco FCZ1939502U CTS-MX700D-2CAM-K2 CON-ECDN-MX706D2C $5,031.00 18.00% $4,125.42
39 Cisco FCH1941V2N1 TCS-SMB-C220-K9 CON-ECDN-SMBCKS $1,045.00 18.00% $856.90
40 Cisco CTS-MIC-CLNG CON-ECDN-SMICCLNG $160.00 18.00% $131.20
41 Cisco CTI-TMS-SW-K9 CON-ECMU-CTITMSSW $912.00 18.00% $747.84
42 Cisco LIC-TMS-25 CON-ECMU-LICTMS25 $1,894.00 18.00% $1,553.08
43 Cisco LIC-TP-SMP CON-ECMU-LICTPSMP $1,440.00 18.00% $1,180.80
44 Cisco R-PI2X-K9 CON-ECMU-PI2XKSB $0.00 $0.00
45 Cisco R-CBEGK-K9 CON-ECMU-RCBEGKK $0.00 $0.00
46 Cisco R-VTS-K9 CON-ECMU-RVTSK® $0.00 $0.00
a7 Cisco TP-SMP-K9 CON-ECMU-TPSMPK9 $0.00 $0.00
48 Cisco UCM-10X-UWLPRO CON-ECMU-UCM10XUL $1,560.00 18.00% $1,279.20
49 Cisco UCM-T1X-TRP-UCL CON-ECMU-UCMUCLTP $78.00 18.00% $63.96
50 Cisco VCS-C-GWBDL CON-ECMU-VCSCGWED $2,030.00 18.00% $1,664.60
51 Cisco FCH1937V2EY BE&H-M4-K9= CON-SNT-BESHM4KI $315.00 18.00% $258.30
52 Cisco FCH1936V1VF BESH-M4-K9= CON-SNT-BE6HMAK9 $315.00 18.00% $258.30
53 Cisco FCH1910V13A CTI-410V-VTS-K9 CON-SNT-CTI-410V $473.00 18.00% $387.86




Bid Group:

VENTURE

#3

Description:

Cisco Smartnet Maint. Existing Equipment

Source Of Manufacturer Reference Price:

Manuracturer
Reference Discount
ltem# MFG. Serial # Description Service Price: Factor % Bid Price $
1 Cisco SWSS UPGRADES PI 1.2 - Lifecycle -100 Device Lic CON-ECMU-PI12LF1H NO BID
2 Cisco FTX1930105U ASA5525-FPWR-K9 CON-SNT-A25FPK9 NO BID
3 Cisco FTX1930105S ASA5525-FPWR-K9 CON-SNT-A25FPK9 NO BID
4 Cisco SPE1945003X WS-C4503E-S7L+48V+ CON-SNTP-C4503S7L NO BID
5 Cisco FDO1423R21B WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE NO BID
6 Cisco FCH2004VOWS UCS-SP-C220M4-S1 CON-SNTP-SMC2205 NO BID
7 Cisco SW APP SUPP + UPGR Cisco |dentity Services Engine Virtual CON-SAU-ISEVM NO BID
8 Cisco CAT1106W05R WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE NO BID
9 Cisco FDO1427R1QH WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE NO BID
10 Cisco FDO1435Y1DR WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE NO BID
11 Cisco FDO1439VOLD WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE NO BID
12 Cisco FDO1439V0K9 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE NO BID
13 Cisco FDO1439VO0K7 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE NO BID
14 Cisco FDO1152V0J0 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE NO BID
15 Cisco FDO1423R21N WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE NO BID
16 Cisco FDO1423R22K WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE NO BID
17 Cisco FDO1202V011 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE NO BID
18 Cisco FD01437V053 WS-C3750E-48PD-E CON-SNT-3750E4PE NO BID
19 Cisco FDO1734Z02E WS-C3750%-125-S CON-SNT-C375X12S NO BID
20 Cisco FDO1734Z0CZ WS-C3750%-24S-E CON-SNT-C375X24E NO BID
21 Cisco FOX1538G5EH WS-C4510R+E CON-SNTP-C4510R+E NO BID
22 Cisco FOX1616G3WR WS-C4510R+E CON-SNTP-4510RES7 NO BID
23 Cisco FXS1648Q2EH WS-C4510R+E CON-SNTP-4510RES7 NO BID
24 Cisco FXS1648Q284 WS-C4510R+E CON-SNTP-4510RES7 NO BID
25 Cisco FCW1629L008 AIR-CT5508-K9 CON-SNT-CT08100 NO BID




26 Cisco FCW1628L08R AIR-CT5508-K9 CON-SNT-CTD8100 NO BID
27 Cisco FX51822Q13P WS-C4507RE+08V+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV NO BID
28 Cisco FXS1822Q1182Z WS-C4507RE+96V+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV NO BID
29 Cisco FX$1930Q3RK WS-C4507RE+96V+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV NO BID
30 Cisco FX51931Q4W9 WS-C4507RE+0BV+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV NO BID
31 Cisco FX51946Q15N WS-C4507REHIGV+ CON-SNTP-C4507REV NO BID
32 Cisco WZP1725008T UCS-SPB-C22V CON-SNTP-SP8C22V NO BID
33 Cisco L-ASA5525-TAMC= L-ASA5525-TAMC-1Y NO BID
34 Cisco L-ASA5525-TAMC= L-ASA5525-TAMC-1Y NO BID
35 Cisco L-PIZX-AS-100-P CON-ECMU-PI2XPATH NO BID
36 Cisco 7371J558DEC SW APP SUPP + UPGR Cisco FireSIGHT CON-SAU-VMWSW2 NO BID
a7 Cisco WKK19152156 CTS-MIC-TABLEBQ CON-ECDN-CTSMICTB NO BID
38 Cisco FCZ1939502U CTS-MX700D-2CAM-K9 CON-ECDN-MX700D2C NO BID
29 Cisco FCH1944V2N1 TCS-SMB-C220-K9 CON-ECDN-SMBCKS NO BID
40 Cisco CTS-MIG-CLNG CON-ECDN-SMICCLNG NO BID
41 Cisco CTI-TMS-SW-K9 CON-ECMU-CTITMSSW NO BID
42 Cisco LIC-TMS-25 CON-ECMU-LICTMS25 NO BID
43 Cisco LIC-TP-SMP CON-ECMU-LICTPSMP NO BID
a4 Cisco R-PI2X-K9 CON-ECMU-PI12XK9B NO BID
a5 Cisco R-CBE6K-K9 CON-ECMU-RCBEBKK NO BID
46 Cisco R-VTS-K9 CON-ECMU-RVTSK9 NO BID
a7 Cisco TP-SMP-K3 CON-ECMU-TPSMPKS NO BID
48 Cisco UCM-10%-UWLPRO CON-ECMU-UCM10XUL NO BID
49 Cisco UCM-11X-TP-UCL CON-ECMU-UCMUCLTP NO BID
50 Cisco VCS-C-GWBDL CON-ECMU-VCSCGWBD NO BID
51 Cisco FCH1937V2EY BEBH-M4-K9= CON-SNT-BE6HM4K9 NO BID
52 Cisco FCH1936V1VF BEBH-M4-K8= CON-SNT-BEGHMA4KO NOBID
53 Cisco FCH1910V13A CTI-410V-VTS-K9 CON-SNT-CTI-410V NO BID




