Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

PAVING BID (OPTION 1) |Work to begin within 14 calendar day of NTP

1. Price per ton to place hot plant mix on a prepared roadway base (dirt or
gravel) surface. Price to include all labor and equipment (including traffic
control) required to clean roadway, spread, and compact the asphalt material
in place in compliance with the applicable section of the ALDOT specifications,
and specifications regarding testing contained herein.

BC-723 Baldwin County Bituminous plant mix
0-50 tons

51-150 tons

151-500 tons

501 tons & above

Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton

424A-336 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/8" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B
0-50 tons

51-150 tons
151-500 tons

501 tons & above

Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton

424A-340 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1/2" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B
0-50 tons

51-150 tons
151-500 tons

501 tons & above

Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton

424A-341 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B
0-50 tons

51-150 tons
151-500 tons

501 tons & above

Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton

$160.00 No Bid
$80.00 No Bid
$32.00 $42.50
$16.00 $15.60
$160.00 No Bid
$80.00 No Bid
$32.00 $42.50
$16.00 $15.60
$160.00 No Bid
$80.00 No Bid
$32.00 $42.50
$16.00 $15.60
$160.00 No Bid
$80.00 No Bid
$32.00 $42.50
$16.00 $15.60




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

424B-635 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $160.00 No Bid
51-150 tons Per Ton $80.00 No Bid
151-500 tons Per Ton $32.00 $42.50
501 tons & above Per Ton $16.00 $15.60
424B-636 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $160.00 No Bid
51-150 tons Per Ton $80.00 No Bid
151-500 tons Per Ton $32.00 $42.50
501 tons & above Per Ton $16.00 $15.60
424B 637 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1 1/2" Maximum Aggregate

Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $160.00 No Bid
51-150 tons Per Ton $80.00 No Bid
151-500 tons Per Ton $32.00 $42.50
501 tons & above Per Ton $16.00 $15.60
| PAVING BID (OPTION 1) Work to begin within 14 calendar day of NTP

2. Price per ton, including tack coat, to place hot plant mix on an existing paved

roadway surface (ditch section). Price to include all labor and equipment

(including traffic control) required to clean and prepare roadway (including

clipping), spread and compact the asphalt material in place in compliance with

the applicable section of the ALDOT specifications, and specifications regarding

testing contained herein.

BC-723 Baldwin County Bituminous plant mix

0-50 tons Per Ton $214.00 No Bid
51-150 tons Per Ton $109.00 No Bid
151-500 tons Per Ton $46.00 $42.50
501 tons & above Per Ton $18.00 $18.65




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

424A-336 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/8" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424A-340 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1/2" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424A-341 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-635 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-636 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

$214.00 No Bid
$109.00 No Bid
$46.00 $42.50
$18.00 $18.65
$214.00 No Bid
$109.00 No Bid
$46.00 $42.50
$18.00 $18.65
$214.00 No Bid
$109.00 No Bid
$46.00 $42.50
$18.00 $18.65
$214.00 No Bid
$109.00 No Bid
$46.00 $42.50
$18.00 $18.65
$214.00 No Bid
$109.00 No Bid
$46.00 $42.50
$18.00 $18.65




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

424B 637 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1 1/2" Maximum Aggregate
Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons

51-150 tons

151-500 tons

501 tons & above

3. Price per ton, including tack coat, to place hot plant mix on an existing paved
roadway surface (Curb Section). Price to include all labor and equipment
(including traffic control) required to clean and prepare roadway, spread and
compact the asphalt material in place in compliance with the applicable
section of the ALDOT specifications, and specifications regarding testing
contained herein.

BC-723 Baldwin County Bituminous plant mix
0-50 tons

51-150 tons

151-500 tons

501 tons & above

Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton

Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton

424A-336 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/8" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B
0-50 tons

51-150 tons
151-500 tons

501 tons & above

Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton

424A-340 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1/2" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B
0-50 tons

51-150 tons
151-500 tons

501 tons & above

Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

$214.00 No Bid
$109.00 No Bid
$46.00 $42.50
$18.00 $18.65
$164.00 No Bid
$84.00 No Bid
$36.00 $42.50
$20.00 $18.65
$164.00 No Bid
$84.00 No Bid
$36.00 $42.50
$20.00 $18.65
$164.00 No Bid
$84.00 No Bid
$36.00 $42.50
$20.00 $18.65




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

424A-341 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-635 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-636 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-637 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1 1/2" Maximum Aggregate
Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

4. Price per ton to widen an existing paved roadway at the width and rate
requested by the Baldwin County Highway Department. Price to include all
labor and equipment (including traffic control) required to notch out edge of
pavement, clean roadway, spread and compact the asphalt material in place in
compliance with the applicable section of the ALDOT specifications, and
specifications regarding testing contained herein.

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

$164.00 No Bid
$84.00 No Bid
$36.00 $42.50
$20.00 $18.65
$164.00 No Bid
$84.00 No Bid
$36.00 $42.50
$20.00 $18.65
$164.00 No Bid
$84.00 No Bid
$36.00 $42.50
$14.00 $18.65
$164.00 No Bid
$84.00 No Bid
$36.00 $42.50
$14.00 $18.65




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

BC-723 Baldwin County Bituminous plant mix

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424A-336 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/8" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424A-340 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1/2" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424A-341 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-635 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

$178.00 No Bid
$88.00 No Bid
$35.20 $42.50
$25.15 $20.00
$178.00 No Bid
$88.00 No Bid
$35.20 $42.50
$25.15 $20.00
$178.00 No Bid
$88.00 No Bid
$35.20 $42.50
$25.15 $20.00
$178.00 No Bid
$88.00 No Bid
$35.20 $42.50
$25.15 $20.00
$178.00 No Bid
$88.00 No Bid
$35.20 $42.50
$25.15 $20.00




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

424B-636 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $178.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $88.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $25.20 $42.50

501 tons & above Per Ton $25.15 $20.00

424B-637 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1 1/2" Maximum Aggregate

Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $178.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $88.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $35.20 $42.50

501 tons & above Per Ton $25.15 $20.00
PAVING BID (OPTION 1) |Work to begin within 14 calendar day of NTP

5. Price per ton, including tack coat, to perform spot leveling on an existing

paved roadway surface at rate specified by the Baldwin County Highway

Department. Price to include all labor and equipment (including traffic control)

required to clean roadway, spread and compact the asphalt material in place in

compliance with the applicable section of the ALDOT specifications, and

specifications regarding testing contained herein.

BC-723 Baldwin County Bituminous plant mix

0-50 tons Per Ton $180.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $90.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $35.00 $42.50

501 tons & above Per Ton $12.00 $19.50

424A-336 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/8" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $180.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $90.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $35.00 $42.50

501 tons & above Per Ton $12.00 $19.50




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

424A-340 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1/2" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424A-341 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-635 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-636 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-637 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1 1/2" Maximum Aggregate
Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

$180.00 No Bid
$90.00 No Bid
$35.00 $42.50
$12.00 $19.50
$180.00 No Bid
$90.00 No Bid
$35.00 $42.50
$12.00 $19.50
$180.00 No Bid
$90.00 No Bid
$35.00 $42.50
$12.00 $19.50
$180.00 No Bid
$90.00 No Bid
$35.00 $42.50
$12.00 $19.50
$180.00 No Bid
$90.00 No Bid
$35.00 $42.50
$12.00 $19.50




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

PAVING BID (OPTION 2) |Work to begin within7 calendar day of NTP

1. Price per ton to place hot plant mix on a prepared roadway base (dirt or
gravel) surface. Price to include all labor and equipment (including traffic
control) required to clean roadway, spread, and compact the asphalt material
in place in compliance with the applicable section of the ALDOT specifications,
and specifications regarding testing contained herein.

BC-723 Baldwin County Bituminous plant mix
0-50 tons

51-150 tons

151-500 tons

501 tons & above

Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton

424A-336 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/8" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B
0-50 tons

51-150 tons
151-500 tons

501 tons & above

Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton

424A-340 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1/2" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B
0-50 tons

51-150 tons
151-500 tons

501 tons & above

Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton

424A-341 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B
0-50 tons

51-150 tons
151-500 tons

501 tons & above

Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton
Per Ton

$160.00 No Bid
$80.00 No Bid
$32.00 NO Bid
$16.00 $15.60
$160.00 No Bid
$80.00 No Bid
$32.00 NO Bid
$16.00 $15.60
$160.00 No Bid
$80.00 No Bid
$32.00 NO Bid
$16.00 $15.60
$160.00 No Bid
$80.00 No Bid
$32.00 NO Bid
$16.00 $15.60




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

424B-635 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $160.00 No Bid
51-150 tons Per Ton $80.00 No Bid
151-500 tons Per Ton $32.00 NO Bid
501 tons & above Per Ton $16.00 $15.60
424B-636 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size

Mix, ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $160.00 No Bid
51-150 tons Per Ton $80.00 No Bid
151-500 tons Per Ton $32.00 NO Bid
501 tons & above Per Ton $16.00 $15.60
424B 637 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1 1/2" Maximum Aggregate

Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $160.00 No Bid
51-150 tons Per Ton $80.00 No Bid
151-500 tons Per Ton $32.00 NO Bid
501 tons & above Per Ton $16.00 $15.60
| PAVING BID (OPTION 2) Work to begin within7 calendar day of NTP

2. Price per ton, including tack coat, to place hot plant mix on an existing paved

roadway surface (ditch section). Price to include all labor and equipment

(including traffic control) required to clean and prepare roadway (including

clipping), spread and compact the asphalt material in place in compliance with

the applicable section of the ALDOT specifications, and specifications regarding

testing contained herein.

BC-723 Baldwin County Bituminous plant mix

0-50 tons Per Ton $214.00 No Bid
51-150 tons Per Ton $109.00 No Bid
151-500 tons Per Ton $46.00 No Bid
501 tons & above Per Ton $18.00 $18.65




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

424A-336 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/8" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424A-340 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1/2" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424A-341 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-635 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-636 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

$214.00 No Bid
$109.00 No Bid
$46.00 No Bid
$18.00 $18.65
$214.00 No Bid
$109.00 No Bid
$46.00 No Bid
$18.00 $18.65
$214.00 No Bid
$109.00 No Bid
$46.00 No Bid
$18.00 $18.65
$214.00 No Bid
$109.00 No Bid
$46.00 No Bid
$18.00 $18.65
$214.00 No Bid
$109.00 No Bid
$46.00 No Bid
$18.00 $18.65




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

424B 637 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1 1/2" Maximum Aggregate
Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

0-50 tons Per Ton $214.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $109.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $46.00 No Bid
Per Ton $18.00 $18.65

PAVING BID (OPTION 2) Work to begin within7 calendar day of NTP

3. Price per ton, including tack coat, to place hot plant mix on an existing paved

roadway surface (Curb Section). Price to include all labor and equipment

(including traffic control) required to clean and prepare roadway, spread and

compact the asphalt material in place in compliance with the applicable

section of the ALDOT specifications, and specifications regarding testing

contained herein.

BC-723 Baldwin County Bituminous plant mix

0-50 tons Per Ton $164.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $84.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $36.00 No Bid

501 tons & above Per Ton $20.00 $18.65

424A-336 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/8" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $164.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $84.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $36.00 No Bid

501 tons & above Per Ton $20.00 $18.65

424A-340 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1/2" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $164.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $84.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $36.00 No Bid

501 tons & above Per Ton $20.00 $18.65




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

424A-341 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $164.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $84.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $36.00 No Bid

501 tons & above Per Ton $20.00 $18.65

424B-635 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $164.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $84.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $36.00 No Bid

501 tons & above Per Ton $20.00 $18.65

424B-636 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $164.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $84.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $36.00 No Bid

501 tons & above Per Ton $20.00 $18.65

424B-637 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1 1/2" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $164.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $84.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $36.00 No Bid

501 tons & above Per Ton $20.00 $18.65
PAVING BID (OPTION 2) |Work to begin within7 calendar day of NTP

4. Price per ton to widen an existing paved roadway at the width and rate
requested by the Baldwin County Highway Department. Price to include all
labor and equipment (including traffic control) required to notch out edge of
pavement, clean roadway, spread and compact the asphalt material in place in
compliance with the applicable section of the ALDOT specifications, and
specifications regarding testing contained herein.




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

BC-723 Baldwin County Bituminous plant mix

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424A-336 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/8" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424A-340 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1/2" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424A-341 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-635 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

$178.00 No Bid
$88.00 No Bid
$35.20 No Bid
$25.15 $20.00
$178.00 No Bid
$88.00 No Bid
$35.20 No Bid
$25.15 $20.00
$178.00 No Bid
$88.00 No Bid
$35.20 No Bid
$25.15 $20.00
$178.00 No Bid
$88.00 No Bid
$35.20 No Bid
$25.15 $20.00
$178.00 No Bid
$88.00 No Bid
$35.20 No Bid
$25.15 $20.00




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

424B-636 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $178.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $88.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $35.20 No Bid

501 tons & above Per Ton $25.15 $20.00

424B-637 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1 1/2" Maximum Aggregate

Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $178.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $88.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $35.20 No Bid

501 tons & above Per Ton $25.15 $20.00
PAVING BID (OPTION 2) |Work to begin within7 calendar day of NTP

5. Price per ton, including tack coat, to perform spot leveling on an existing

paved roadway surface at rate specified by the Baldwin County Highway

Department. Price to include all labor and equipment (including traffic control)

required to clean roadway, spread and compact the asphalt material in place in

compliance with the applicable section of the ALDOT specifications, and

specifications regarding testing contained herein.

BC-723 Baldwin County Bituminous plant mix

0-50 tons Per Ton $180.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $90.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $35.00 No Bid

501 tons & above Per Ton $12.00 $19.50

424A-336 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/8" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton $180.00 No Bid

51-150 tons Per Ton $90.00 No Bid

151-500 tons Per Ton $35.00 No Bid

501 tons & above Per Ton $12.00 $19.50




Competive Bid #WG16-26
Provison for Labor and Equipment of Asphalt Placement
Bid Tabulation

424A-340 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1/2" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424A-341 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,

ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-635 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-636 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL

Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

424B-637 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper Binder Layer, 1 1/2" Maximum Aggregate
Size Mix, ESAL Range A/B

0-50 tons Per Ton
51-150 tons Per Ton
151-500 tons Per Ton
501 tons & above Per Ton

BIDDER

BIDDER

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt Co.

$180.00 No Bid
$90.00 No Bid
$35.00 No Bid
$12.00 $19.50
$180.00 No Bid
$90.00 No Bid
$35.00 No Bid
$12.00 $19.50
$180.00 No Bid
$90.00 No Bid
$35.00 No Bid
$12.00 $19.50
$180.00 No Bid
$90.00 No Bid
$35.00 No Bid
$12.00 $19.50
$180.00 No Bid
$90.00 No Bid
$35.00 No Bid
$12.00 $19.50




