COMPETITIVE BID #WG16-20 - Erosion Control Materials - Bid Tabulation

Grass Seed
Area 100
BIDDERS: Gulf Coast Organic

Price per pound

Delivered to Price per pound

Various Baldwin Picked up by
Seed Type County Locations Baldwin County
Annual Ryegrass $0.55 $0.47
Tall Fescue $1.25 $1.20
Crimson Clover $1.10 $0.975
Brown Top Millet $0.80 50.76
Unhulied Bermuda Grass $4.05 $4.00
Hulled Bermuda Grass $5.55 $5.50
Pensacola Bahia Grass $3.35 $3.25
Centipede $21.50 $21.00

JLocation for County to Pickup Grass Seeds: 10505A Co. Rd 65, Foley, AL

BIDDERS: Evans & Company, Inc.

Price per pound

Delivered to Price per pound

Various Baldwin Picked up by
Seed Type County Locations Baldwin County
Annual Ryegrass $0.55 $0.55
Tall Fescue $1.30 $1.30
Crimson Clover $1.28 $1.28
Brown Top Millet $0.52 $0.52
Unhulled Bermuda Grass $4.10 $4.10
Hulled Bermuda Grass $6.10 $6.10
Pensacolza Bahia Grass $4.15 $4.15
Centipede $29.00 $29.00

|Location for County to Pickup Grass Seeds: 7930 Ziegler Blvd, Mobile, AL

Location for County to Pickup Grass Seeds:

BIDDERS: Alabama Pipe & Supply, Inc

Price per pound

Delivered to Price per pound

Various Baldwin Picked up by
Seed Tvpe County Locations Baldwin County
Annual Ryegrass No Bid No Bid
Tall Fescue No Bid No Bid
Crimson Clover No Bid No Bid
Brown Top Millet No Bid No Bid
Unhulted Bermuda Grass No Bid No Bid
Hulled Bermuda Grass No Bid No Bid
Pensacola Bahia Grass No Bid No Bid
Centipede No Bid No Bid




COMPETITIVE BID #ANG16-20 - Erosion Control Materials - Bid Tabulation

Grass Seed
Area 200
BIDDERS: Gulf Coast Organic

Price per pound

Delivered to Price per pound

Various Baldwin Picked up by
Seed Type County Locations Baldwin County
Annual Ryegrass $0.55 $0.47
Tall Fescue $1.25 $1.20
Crimson Clover $1.10 $0.975
Brown Top Millet $0.80 $0.76
Unhulled Bermuda Grass $4.05 $4.00
Hulled Bermuda Grass $5.55 $5.50
Pensacola Bahia Grass $3.35 $3.25
Centipede $21.50 $21.00

|Location for County to Pickup Grass Seeds: 10505A Co Rd 65, Foley, AL

BIDDERS: Evans & Company, Inc.
Price per pound
Delivered to Price per pound
Various Baldwin Picked up by
Seed Type County Locations Baldwin County
Annual Ryegrass $0.55 $0.55
Tall Fescue $1.30 $1.30
Crimson Clover $1.28 $1.28
Brown Top Millet $0.52 $0.52
Unhulled Bermuda Grass $4.10 $4.10
Hulled Bermuda Grass $6.10 $6.10
Pensacola Bahia Grass $4.15 $4.15
Centipede $29.00 $29.00

Location for County to Pickup Grass Seeds: 7930 Zeigler Blvd, Mobile, AL

Location for County to Pickup Grass Seeds:

BIDDERS: Alabama Pipe & Supply, Inc.

Price per pound

Delivered to Price per pound

Various Baldwin Picked up by
Seed Type County Locations Baldwin County
Annual Ryegrass No Bid No Bid
Tall Fescue No Bid No Bid
Crimson Clover No Bid No Bid
Brown Top Millet No Bid No Bid
Unhulled Bermuda Grass No Bid No Bid
Hulled Bermuda Grass No Bid No Bid
Pensacola Bahia Grass No Bid No Bid
Centipede No Bid No Bid




COMPETITIVE BID #W(G16-20 - Erosion Control Materials - Bid Tabulation

Grass Seed
Area 300
BIDDERS: Gulf Coast 6rganic

Price per pound

Delivered to Price per pound

Various Baldwin Picked up by
Seed Type County Locations Baldwin County
Annual Ryegrass $0.55 $0.47
Tall Fescue $1.25 $1.20
Crimson Clover $1.10 $0.975
Brown Top Millet $0.80 $0.76
Unhulled Bermuda Grass $4.05 $4.00
Hulled Bermuda Grass $5.55 $5.50
Pensacola Bahia Grass $3.35 $3.25
Centipede $21.50 $21.00

Location for County to Pickup Grass Seeds: 10505A Co Rd 65, Foley, AL

BIDDERS: Evans & Company, Inc.
Price per pound
Delivered to Price per pound
Various Baldwin Picked up by
Seed Type County Locations Baldwin County
Annual Ryegrass $0.55 $0.55
Tall Fescue $1.30 $1.30
Crimson Clover $1.28 $1.28
Brown Top Millet $0.52 $0.52
Unhulled Bermuda Grass $4.10 $4.10
Hulled Bermuda Grass $6.10 $6.10
Pensacola Bahia Grass $4.15 $4.15
Centipede $29.00 $29.00

|Location for County to Pickup Grass Seeds: 7930 Zeigler Blvd, Mobile, AL

[BIDDERS: Alabama Pipe & Supply, Inc.

Price per pound

Delivered to Price per pound

Various Baldwin Picked up by
Seed Type County Locations Baldwin County
Annual Ryegrass No Bid No Bid
Tall Fescue No Bid No Bid
Crimsan Clover No Bid No Bid
Brown Top Millet No Bid No Bid
Unhulled Bermuda Grass No Bid No Bid
Hulled Bermuda Grass No Bid No Bid
Pensacola Bahia Grass No Bid No Bid
Centipede No Bid No Bid

Location for County to Pickup Grass Seeds:




COMPETITIVE BID #WG16-20 - Erosion Contro! Materials - Bid Tabulation
Fertilizer

BIDDERS: Gulf Coast Organic

Price per pound

Delivered to Price per pound

Various Baldwin Picked up by
Fertilizer Type County Locations Baldwin County
13-13-13 $0.28 $0.23
10-10-10 $0.29 $0.264
8-8-8 $0.26 $0.23
Agricultural Lime (Bag) No Bid No Bid
Agricultural Lime (Bulk) No Bid No Bid

Location for County to Pickup Fertilizer: 10505A Co Rd 65, Foley, AL

BIDDERS: Evans & Company, Inc.

Price per pound

Delivered to Price per pound

Various Baldwin Picked up by
Ferilizer Type County Locations Baldwin County
13-13-13 $0.30 $0.30
10-10-10 No Bid No Bid
8-8-8 $0.30 $0.30
Agricultural Lime (Bag) $0.16 $0.16
Agricultural Lime (Bulk) No Bid No Bid

Location for County to Pickup Fertilizer: 7930 Zeigler Blvd, Mobile, AL

BIDDERS: Alabama Pipe & Supply, Inc.

Price per pound

Delivered to Price per pound

Various Baldwin Picked up by
Fertilizer Type County Locations Baldwin County
13-13-13 No Bid No Bid
10-10-10 No Bid No Bid
8-8-8 No Bid No Bid
Agricultural Lime {Bag) No Bid No Bid
Agriculiural Lime {Bulk) No Bid No Bid

Location for County to Pickup Fertilizer:




COMPETITIVE BID #/¥G18-20 - EROSION CONTROL MATERIALS - BID TABULATION

Siit Fence
Evans & Company |Alabama Pipe & Supply {Gulf Ceast Organic
Delivered PickedUp | Dellvered Picked Up Delivered  Picked Up

Bld Bond: Yos Yos Yos
items
Type "A" Silt Fence Kit / L.F. $0.80 $0.80 50.75 $0.75 $0.89 $0.8625
Type "B" Silt Fence Kit / L.F. $0.25 $0.25 $0.25 $0.25 $0.255 $0.24
Waltles (12 in.) / L.F. $1.50 $1.50 $2.85 $2.85 $1.63 $1.59
Wattles (20 In.) / L.F, $2.10 $2.10 $3.65 $3.65 $1.58 $1.55
Sediment Logs (12in.) /L. F. $2.10 $2.10 $2.95 $2.95 No Bid No Bid
Sediment Logs (20in.) /L.F. $2.80 §$2.80 $3.80 $3.80 No Bid No Bid
Type 53 RECPs - 3 month $0.24 $0.24 $0.32 $0.32 $0.225 No Bid
Type 53 RECPs - 12 month $0.24 $0.24 $0.32 §0.32 $0.265 50.216
Type 52 RECPs - 12 month $0.29 $0.29 $0.36 50.36 No Bid $0.24
Type S1 RECPs - 24 month §0.48 £0.48 $0.64 $0.84 No Bid No Bid
Type S1 RECPs - 38 month $0.70 $0.70 $0.79 $0.79{ No Bid No Bid
Type 51 RECPs - Parm $2,07 $2.07 $2.05 $2.05 $2.56 $2.40
Type C2 RECPs - 12 month 50.28 50.28 $0.368 $0.36 $0.225 $0.216
Type C2 RECPs - 24 month $0.54 $0.54 $0.64 $0.64 $0.60 $0.546
Type C2 RECPs - 38 month $0.62 50.62 $0.81 $0.81 $0.68 50.6474
Type C6 RECPs - Parm $2.07 $2.07 52.05 $2.05 No Bid No Bid
Type C10 RECPs - Parm $2.07 $2.07 $2.56 $2.56 $2.55 $2.40
Sod Staples $26.50 $26.50 $35.00 $35.00 $34.00 $30.00
Nonwoven Geotextile 4.0 oz/sy {Filter Fabric)/ L.F. $0.54 $0.54 $0.72 $0.72 $0.43 $0.416
Nonwovan Geolaxtile 8.0 oz/sy (Fiiter Fabric) /L.F. $0.95 $0.95 $0.98 $0.98 $0.78 $0.741
Woven Geotextile (Filter Fabric) / L.F. $0.74 $0.74 $0.79 $0.79 No Bid No Bid
Soll Slope Reinforcements Type 1 "Geogrid” $1.80 $1.80 $0.84 $0.84 No Bid No Bid
Soll Slope Reinforcements Type 2 “Geogrid” $2.25 $2.25 $1.20 $1.30 No Bid No Bid
Soil Slope Reinforcements Type 3 "Geogrid” $3.00 $3.00 $1.45 $1.45 No Bid No Bid

Total §54.93 $54.93 $66.33 $66.33 $45.87 $38.42

Location for County to Pickup: _ |Mobile, AL Mobile, AL Folaey, AL

Notes

Evans and Company:

Wattles (12 in) and (20 in) are Straw

Sediment Logs (12 In} and (20 in) are Curlex

Woven Geolextile (Filter Fabric) are Mirafi .800X

Soll Slobe Reinforcemants Type 1 “Geogrid” Mirafi 2XT

Page 17 - Paragraph #1 under "Geogrid” references BOTH Slide and Soft Soll Applications, prices above apply 1o Siope Application. Prices listed below
apply to Soft Slope Application.

Type #1 Geogrid - Soft Soil Application - §1.55 Sy. - SBX 12
Type #2 Geogrid - Soft Sall Application - §1.55 Sy. - SBX 12
Type #3 Geogrid - Soft Soil Application - $3.10 Sy - Terragrid 55
Location for Pickup - 7830 Zeigler Bivd, Mabile, AL

48" Non Oven Fabric - 330' roll of Mirafi 140 NL

330' roll of Mirafi 140NL - 48" non-woven fabric

330" roll of 38" - 14 ga. Wire fence

1 bag - (100 ea.) fence ties

2 boxes - (100 ea.} - {fabric-to-wire connectors (hog rings)

34 ea 5' 0" unpainted stesl t-post

Alabama Plpe & Supply Ing.
Locatlon for Pickup: Mobile County



COMPETITIVE BID #WG16-20- EROSION CONTROL MATERIALS - TAB

Articulating Concrete Block Mats

BIDDER:

Alabama Pipe & Supply, Inc.
Delivered FOB Baldwin County

HxWxL

Open Cell 4.75x155x17.4 $11.46 S.F.
Open Cell 60x155 x17.4 $13.72 S.F.
Open Cell 80x155 x17.4 $15.80 S.F.
Closed Cell 475x155x17.4 $12.10 S.F.
Closed Cell 60x155x17.4 $12.00 SF.
Closed Cell 80x155x17.4 $17.40 S.F.
Anchors $69.30 EA.
Pickup By Baldwin County

HxWxL
Open Cell 4.75x15.5x17.4 Delivered only 5.F,
Open Cell 6.0x155 x17.4 Delivered only S.F.
Closed Cell 475x155x17.4 Delivered only S.F.
Closed Cell 6.0x155x17.4 Delivered only EA.
Anchors Deliverad only
Pickup Location:
BIDDER: Evans & Company, Inc.
Delivered FOB Baldwin County

HxWxl
Open Cell 475x155x17.4 $7.890 S.F.
Open Cell 6.0x155 x17.4 §9.25 SF.
Open Cell B.Ox15.5 x17.4 $11.75 S.F.
Closed Cell 475x155x17.4 $8.25 SF.
Closed Cell 6.0x155x17.4 59.65 S.F.
Closed Cell BOx155x17.4 $12.50 S.F.
Anchors S48.00 EA.
Pickup By Baldwin County

HxWxlL No Bid
Open Cell 4.75x15.5x17.4 No Bid S.F.
Cpen Cell 6.0x155 x17.4 No Bid S.F.
Closed Cell 4.75x155x17.4 No Bid S.F.
IClosed Cell 6.0x155x17.4 No Bid EA.
Anchors
Pickup Location:
BIDDER: Gulf Coast Organic, Inc
Delivered FOB Baldwin County

HxWxL
Open Cell 4.75x15.5x17.4 No Bid S.F.
Open Cell 6.0x155 x17.4 No Bid S.F.
Open Cell 80x155 x17.4 No Bid S.F.
Clased Cell 475x155x17.4 No Bid S.F.
Closed Cell 60x155x17.4 No Bid S.F.
Closed Cell B.Ox155x17.4 No Bid S.F.
Anchors No Bid EA.
Pickup By Baldwin County

HxWxL
|Open Cell 4.75x15.5x17.4 No Bid S.F.
Open Cell 6.0x155 x17.4 Na Bid SF.
Closed Cell 475x%x155x17.4 No Bid S.F.
Closed Cell 60x155x17.4 No Bid EA.
Anchors No Bid

|Pickup Location:




Competitive Bid #WG16-20 Erosion Control Materials - Bid Tabulation

Solid Sod
Description Price Per Sq. Yd Price Per Sqg. Yd
of ltem Delivered Picked Up Bidder

Centipede Block $1.55 $1.35 Cleverdon Farms, Inc
Centipede Mini Rolls $1.55 $1.35 Cleverdon Farms, Inc
Centipede 30" Rolls $1.55 $1.35 Cleverdon Farms, Inc
BermudalTifton Block $1.70 $1.50 Cleverdon Farms, Inc
Bermuda/Tifton Mini Rolls $1.70 $1.50 Cleverdon Farms, Inc
Bermuda/Tifton 30" Rolls $1.70 $1.50 Cleverdon Farms, Inc
Celebration Bermuda Block No Bid No Bid Cleverdon Farms, Inc
Celebrations Bermuda Mini Roll No Bid No Bid Cleverdon Farms, Inc
Celebrations Bermuda 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid Cleverdon Farms, Inc
St. Augustine Block $2.20 $2.00 Cleverdon Farms, Inc
St. Augustine Mini Rolls Neo Bid No Bid Cleverdon Farms, Inc
St Augustine 30" Rolls $2.20 $2.00 Cleverdon Farms, Inc

Location For County Pickup Soc Bon Secour/ EoleylSummerdale
Exception: Big Rolls of Sod their cut is 42 inch Rolls instead of 30 inch Rolls

Centipede Block No Bid No Bid Evans & Company
Centipede Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid Evans & Company
Centipede 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid Evans & Company
Bermudal/Tifton Block No Bid No Bid Evans & Company
Bermuda/Tifton Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid Evans & Company
Bermuda/Tifton 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid Evans & Company
Celebration Bermuda Block No Bid No Bid Evans & Company
Celebrations Bermuda Mini Roli No Bid No Bid Evans & Company
Celebrations Bermuda 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid Evans & Company
St. Augustine Block No Bid No Bid Evans & Company
St. Augustine Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid Evans & Company
St Augustine 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid Evans & Company
Location For County Pickup Sod:

Centipede Block No Bid No Bid Alabama Pipe
Centipede Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid Alabama Pipe
Centipede 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid Alabama Pipe
Bermuda/Tifton Block No Bid No Bid Alabama Pipe
Bermuda/Tifton Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid Alabama Pipe
Bermuda/Tifton 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid Alabama Pipe
Celebration Bermuda Block No Bid No Bid Alabama Pipe
Celebrations Bermuda Mini Roll: No Bid No Bid Alabama Pipe
Celebrations Bermuda 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid Alabama Pipe
St. Augustine Block No Bid No Bid Alabama Pipe
St. Augustine Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid Alabama Pipe
St Augustine 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid Alabama Pipe

Location For County Pickup Sod:
Exceptions:

Cleverdon Farms Inc. Magnum Bid Roll Sod Harvester only cuts 42 inches wide rolls.

33.33 Sq. yards per roll




