BID TAB SUMMARY - RESURFACING GROUP S (3/16/2016)

Indexed Asphalt Cost: John G, Walton H.0. Weaver Ammons & Blackmon Mabile Asphalt Co.
Alternate 1 - Four Roads - All Labor and Material N/A TOTAL: 5 1,281,390.10 |TOTAL: $ 1,212,463.25 |[TOTAL: NOBID TOTAL: S 1,177.107.59
Alternate 2 - Four Roads - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix [ H 1,020,727.22 ILav Down: NO8ID Lay Down: NO BID llav Down: S 268,107.25 |iay Down: NO BID
[TOTAL: N/A TOTAL: N/A ITDTAL: S 1,288,834.47 |TOTAL: N/A
Alternate 3 - Four Roads {Plus Additional Scope of Work on CR 12 5} - All Labor and Material ] NfA |ToTAL: $ 1,388,837.70 [TOTAL: $ 1,317,639.20 [TOTAL: NO BiD JroTaL: $ 1,265,61859
Alternate 4 - Four Roads {Plus Additional Scope of Work on CR 12 5) - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix | s 1,105,912.19 |Lay Down; NO BID Lay Down: NO BiD Lay Down: S 2594,440.25 |Lay Down: NO BID
TOTAL: N/A TOTAL: NfA TOTAL: % 1,400,352.44 [TOTAL: N/A
Addendum 1 Yes Yes Yes Yes
Addendum 2 Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bid 8ond Included Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contract Included Yes Yes Yes Yes

{Alternate 1)| & 1,177,107.59 |Mobile Asphalt Co.
Adds Addition CR 12 §
Work {Alternate 3)|

5 1,265,618.59 |Mobile Asphalt Co.

ENGINEER'S CERTIFICATE:

I, JOEY NUNNALLYrP.E., CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER, HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE IS A TRUE AND CORRECT BID TABULATION FOR THE ABOVE REFERENCED PROJECT AND TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE .

Nunnally, P.E. Date




Alternate 1 - Four Roads - All Labor and Material John G. Walton H.0. Weaver Ammons & Blackmon Mabile Asphalt Co.
PROJECTNO. | ROADNAME | MEMNO.  |DESCRIFTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE AMDUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNTPRICE | AMDUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
P 4054000 |TACK COAT GALLON a7 s 3345 1418698 | $ 300 12,741.00 $ o01s 4247
22n 500A-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 |s  sos000fs 5000005  ss0000]s 8,500.00 5 23500008 23,500.00
§ g E 701002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT).YELLOW MILE 4 |s 550.00 | § 220000|5  S59500] 5 2,380.00 s 800005 3,200.00
et - EE 701C-003__|SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINTL-YELLOW MILE 3 s 900.00 | 5 27000008 ars0(s 2,925.00 nOBID §  ss000)s 2,550.00
g g & BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MiX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/5Y | TON B0 | 6250 & 238,125.00 | § 56508 215,265.00 $ 5870 % 208,407.00
E BC-200  [DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 8 |s 77.95 | 6360f$  sass|s 429.20 5 1500(s 12000
prosectvo. | ROADMAME | mEMNO.  |DEscRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE AMOLNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
e 405A-000  |TACK COAT GALLON w11 |5 3345 1606874 [ s 2/ 14,233,00 $ o01] 3 48.11
£ R 500A-000  |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 Fs  2m000]s 2890005 s25000]s 8,250.00 s 2650000 5 26,500.00
P i E ] 7016002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE s s 550.00 | 5 220000] 5  ssso0s 2,380.00 MO BID s 800005 3,200.00
Euf 701C-003  |S0LID TEMPORARY YRAFFIC STIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 |s 90000 § 160000[5 575003 1,950.00 s mopls 1,700.00
gz BC-723  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOLIS PLANT MIX - RER TON { RATE 165 LB5/SY ) TON 4300 |3 6250( § w875000]s  57.15]s 245,745,00 s ssasls  2msmae
= E BC:900  |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD @ |3 ss.63 $ 1557648 s365(8 150220 $ 150005 420.00
pROJECTNO. | ROApNAME | mEmno.  {pEscriPmon UNIT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT FRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE |  AMOUNT UINIT PRICE AMOUNT
o 405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 6160 |5 33408 20,574.40 | § 3.00] 5% 18,480.00 5 oni|s 61.60
E : 600A-000 | MOBILIZATION LIMP SUM 1 |5 sasmoofs 8432005 10500005 10.500.00 § 4000000 ¢ 40,000.00
a2 7010002 [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT]-YELLOW MILE 2 s 550.00 [ $ ti000]s  sesoofs 1.190.00 5 80000]% 1,600.00
TR 58 7010-003  [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3 |s 900.00 | $ 2700008  9rs.00]s 2,925.00 T 5 550008 2,550.00
g3 SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 3/4
£S5 4248341 y TON 6600
g z i e olcc B ERL RANSENVE (RATE 265 LBS2Y) 5 6012 | 5 ssso2m0ls  sars|s 387,750.00 5 5450($ 35570000
=& BC:300 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD w0 s 5021 (5 11842008 sass]s 1,072.00 s 100(s 300.00
PROECTND, | ROADNAME | mEMNO. |DEscriPTiON uNIT arv UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNTPRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
. 405A000  |TACKCOAT GALLON 4586 |5 3345 15651.24 | 5 3.00| 5 14,058.00 $ 001 $ 46.85
35 SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE LIPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 1 1/2° MAXIMUM
3 S20B-648 |76 Mix, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 330 LBS/SY) ToN 50
=l 5 64318 1sor7sels  ge3s|s 17,337.50 $  es00fs 16,250.00
gz 6004000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 |5 essoo0|s ss9000]s so0000(s 3,000.00 s %00000]s 2600000
0208018 E 701C-002__{OROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINTI-YELLOW MILE 4 |s  ssom]s 220000] 5 s9s00) s 2,380.00 N B2 5 8000(s 3,20000
g P 701C-003  [SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-VELLOW MILE 2 |s 900.00 | $ 1800005 e7s.00]s 1,550.00 s msooofs 1,700.00
g2 BC-723  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY ) ToN a013
35 5 62505 250812505 sess|s 228,139.05 $  sa3sfs 21810658
g BC-900  |DAIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 2 {s 5815 [ ¢ 1279305 saes|s 1,180.30 $  1so0ls 23000
TOTAL: S 1,281,380.10 [JOTAL & 1,212,463.25 [TOTAL NO 81D TOTAL ___ § 1,177,107.58
IBID: S 1,281,390.10 {BID: $ 1,212,463.25 |BID: NOQ 8ID BID: $ 1,177,107.59




Alternate 2 - Four Roads - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix John G. Walton H.O. Weaver Ammons & Blackmon Mobile Asphalt Co.
PROJECT NO. | ROAD RAME ITEMNO.  |DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNITPRICE | AMDUNT UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIPRICE [ AMOUNT
B 405A-000  |TACK COAT GALLON 4247 5 4005 16,588.00
S =y 600A-000  |MOBILIZATION LUME SUM 1 $ 200000 ¢ 2,000.00
o E E 701C-002  [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT-YELLOW MILE 4 $  9np0|s 3,868.00
S s § P 701C-003  [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3 R ND B0 $ 1032008 3,102.00 NO B0
g z = BC-723°  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 3810 s 1mls 2062750
tE BC-900  |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SOUARE YARD 8 $  8000|S 640.00
PROJECT NO. | HOAD NAME TEMNO.  |DESCRIPTION UNIT ary URITPRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMDUNT UNITPRICE | AMOUNT
) 4054-000  [TACK COAT GALLON a811 $ 2005 15,244.00
E = 6004-000 |MOBIUZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 200000 § 2,000.00
— g g E 701C-002  [BROKEM TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT).YELLOW MILE 4 NOBIO NOBID $  oroofs 3,888.00 NOBID
Enb 701C-003  [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 5 1.034.00(s 2,068.00
3 z 6C-723*  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 4300 s 7.75 | § 33,325.00
E BC900  |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 8 S 8000]$ 2,24000
PROJECT NO. | ROAD NAME MEMNO, [bescriPTiON UNIT ar UNITPRICE | AMOUNT NG PRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE |  AMOUNT
g y 405A-000  |TACK COAY GALLON 6160 % 4005 24,640.00
gz 600A-000  |MOBILIZATION LUMP 5UM 1 S 2,00000) 5 2,000.00
E E 701C-002  |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 $ 972005 1,944.00
0215214 ook 701C-003 50U TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3 HOBID joEG $  1,03400]s 3,102.00 LELL
25 . |SUPERFAVE BTUMINDUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 374"
€= A2A381" | MAXIMUM AGGREGATE $12E MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B { RATE 165 LBS/SY ) - §600 s imils 51,150.00
E [ BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 20 $ B80.00 | 5 1,600.00
PROJECTND. | ROAD NAME WEMNO. |DESCRIFTION uNIT any UNTPRICE |  AMOUNT UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE | AMOUNT
z 40SA D00 |TACK COAT GALLON 4686 s a00[$ 18,744.00
é g 424p.645e  |SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UIPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 1 1/2° ToN 250
] a MAXIMUM SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON [RATE 330 LBS/SY) $ 2000 | 5 5,000.00
0208015 5 E g o [ TR LOMEP S = NOBID NO BID 2 200®m1s 200% NO BID
8 3 = 701C-002  |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 4 - § 972001 3,888.00
E3 £ 701C-003  |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 $ 103400 s 2,068.00
2 g BC-723°  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINDUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/5Y | TON 4013 $ 7758 31,100.75
BC-900  |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 22 s 8000 | 8 1,760.00
TOTAL: NO 8ID ﬁOTAI.: NO BID TOTAL: 5 267,907.25 |TOTAL: NO BID
BID: nosD  [eiD: NO BID {BiD: $  268,107.25 [BID: NO BID
% {200.00)




Alternate 3 - Four Roads (Plus Additional Scope of Work on CR 12 ) - All Labor and Material John G. Walton H.0. Weaver Ammons & Blackmon Mobile Asphalt Co.
PROIECT NO. | ROAD NAME | (TEMNO.  [DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE |  AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
5 B 405A-000  |TACK COAT GALLON 4247 |5 334|% 14,184.98 § 300|s 12,741.00 5 001 |5 4247
g8E 600A-000  |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 |s 5,000.00 | § 500000 | § 8,500.00 | 5 8,500.00 5 350000 { § 23,500.00
- 4 E g 701C-002  [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINTH-YELLOW MILE TI1E 550.00 | § 220000 5 595,00 | 5 1.380.00 . $ £00.00 | 5 3,200.00
£ 3 701C-003  [SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT]-VELLOW MILE 3 [s 500.00 | 5 2,700.00 | § 57500 | § 2,925.00 $ 85000 | § 2,55000
g £z BC-723  |BALDWAN COUNTY BITUMINDUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 2810 |s 62505 23812500 | § 5650 | 5 215,265.00 5 5470 208,407.00
3 80900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD g |s 77955 62360 | § 53655 429.20 $ 15.00 | § 12000
PROJECT NO. | ROADMAME |  mEMNO.  [DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE AMDUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE |  AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
- 2 405A-000  |TACK COAT GALLON am |s 345 1606874 | § 300]$ 14,433.00 § oo }s 4811
g‘ ] 500A-000  |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 |s 2,89000 § 2,850.00 | 5 825000 | $ 8,250.00 $ 26,500.00 | 5 26,500.00
— g g 2 701C002  |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE a |s 55000 | § 220000 | $ 59500 | § 2,380.00 o BID [ 500,00 | 5 3,200.00
Eunb 701C-003  [SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 |s 900.00 | 5 1,800:001 5 a75.00 | § 1950.00 s 850.00 | § 1,700.00
B z BC-723  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINDUS PLANT MIX - PER TON [ RATE 165 LBS/SY | TON 4300 |s 62505 26875000 | 5 5715 | § 245.745.00 s 5525 $ 237,575.00
©E BC-900  [DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 2 [s 5553 | % 155764 | 5 5365 % 1,502.20 $ 15.00 | § 42000
PROJECTNO. | ROAD NAME |  mEmNO.  [DESCRIFTION UNIT arr UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE |  AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
g 3 4052000 |TACK COAT GALLON 8160 s 334]s 2057440 | 5 3.00]s 18,480.00 $ oo |s 61.50
; 600A-000  |MOBILIZATION LUIMP SUM 1 |s 8439.00 | 843900 ¢ 16,500.00 | 5 10,500.00 5 40,000.00 | § 40,000.00
do 701C-002  |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT}-VELLOW MILE 2 |s 550,00 | 5 110000 | 5 59500 | § 1,150.00 $ 800.00 | $ 1,600.00
0218214 g g i 701C003 _ [SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STAIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3 |s 90000 | $ 2,70000] § 57500 § 291500 Ll $ £50.00 | § 2,550.00
25 azaaa4s  |FUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 3/4° Ton o500
€3 MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B { RATE 165 LBS/SY ) 5012 |3 296,75200 5 5875 | § 387,750.00 $ 54500 359,700.00
gE BC900  |DAIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD o |3 5921 % 118420 5 5365 ) 5 1,073.00 % 1500 | 5 300.00
PROJECT NO. | ROADNAME | TEMNO. | DESCRIFTION UNT ary UINIT PRICE AMOUNT UINIT PRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE |  AMOUNT WINGT PRICE AMDUNT
~E C 4054000 |TACK COAT GALLON 1800 [$ 3]s 534400 | $ 300|s 4,800.00 $ o0 |s 1600
E ; g 701C-003  |SOUID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT]-YELLOW MILE 2 s 55000) 5 1,300.00 | § 595.00 | § 1,190.00 5 85000 | § 1,700.00
0219214 Y3 § 703002 |TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET w00 |5 aoois 8,000.00 | 5 865 |8 8,850.00 T 5 5005 5,000.00
[ATEANATE) | & & = s24a3q1  |SUPERPAVE BTUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 3/4° ot e
B E E MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE AfB [ RATE 165 LBS/SY ) s 61.67)5 52.505.00 | 50.25 | & 90,375.00 5 5450 |5 B1,75000
= BC-500 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 3 |s 166.20[ 5 49860 | § 53855 160.55 $ 1500 | 5 45,00
PROJECT NO. | ROADNAME |  ITEMND.  [DESCRIPTION uNrt any UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE |  AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
= é A05A-000  |TACK COAT GALLON 2686 |5 334|5 15,651.24 | § 300)5 14,058.00 $ onLls 46.86
& SUPERPAVE BITUMINDUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LATER, WADENING, 1 1/2° MAXIMUM
Elgg [ 5% |sormux, esananGeo/n . PERTON [RATE 2330 185/5Y) ToN B0 s 6a31s 1607250 5 68355 1733150 5 ss00 s 16,2500
E é 8 500A-000  [MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 6,590.00 | $ 6,590.00 | 5 5,000.00 | 5 9,000.00 $ 26,000.001 6 26,000.00
208013 g & E 7010002 |GROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT]-YELLOW MILE 4 s 550.00 | $ 2,20000 | § 585.00 [ § 2.380.00 ROBID 5 800.00 | § 3,200.00
& é z 7016003 [SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINTI-YELLOW MILE 2 |s 500.00 | 5 180000 5 975.00 | § 1,550.00 $ B50.00 | § 1,70000
] BC-723  [BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MiX - PER TON | RATE 165 LBS/SY } TON a3 s 62505 250,81250 | 5 56.85 | § 228,139.05 [ 5435 | $ 218,10655
=3 BCS00  JORIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 2 |3 s.15 [ § 11930 s BB 1,180.30 s 1500 § 33000
[TOTAL: $ 1,388,837.70 [TOTAL: 5 1,317,639.20 [TOTAL: MO BID TOTAL: $ 1,265,618.59
BID: S 1,388,837.70 |BID: $ 1,317,639.20 |BID: NO BID BID: § 1,265,618.59




Afternate 4 - Four Roads {Plus Additional Scope of Work on CR 12 5) - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix John G. Walton H.D. Weaver Ammons B Blackmon Mobile Asphait Co.
PROIECT NO. (TEM MO, [DESCRIPTION uNIT ary UNITPRICE |  AMOUNT UNITPRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UMITPRICE | amounT
b B 405A-000  [vACK CoAT GALLON 4247 $ 400|s 16,988.00
E 2 6004-000  [moBiLzanion LUMP SUM 1 5 2,000.00 | 2,000.00
029314 g g £ 7016002 [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 4 NOED NOBID $ gn2.00 s 3,888.00 vy I
fug 701003 |SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINTH-YELLOW MILE 3 B 1,034.00 | § 3,102.00
g c BC-723*  [BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 3810 5 775 |8 29,527.50
= 8C-900  |oRIvVEwAY cuT-BACKS SQUARE YARD $ 80,00 | § 640.00
PAOIECT NO. | ROAD NAME memMno.  [pEscaiPTion uNIT ar UNTPRICE | AMOUNT UNITPRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMODUNT
e 4054000  |TACK COAT GALLON 4811 s 400{§ 13,234.00
E 2 6004-000  [MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 200000 | § 2,000.00
c219a14 g 'é g 701C-002  [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT}-YELLOW MILE 4 N BID - 5 97200 § 3,888.00 -
Lab F01C-003  |SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINTH-YELLOW MILE 2 5 103300 | 5 2,068.00
g2 BC-723*  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON [ RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 4300 $ 7758 33,325.00
S E BC-900  |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SOUARE YARD 28 5 80.00 | § 2,240.00
PROVECTNO. | ROADNAME |  FEMNO.  |DESCRIPTION uNIT ary UNITPRICE | AMOUNT UNITPRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE | AMOUNT
g g 4054000 [TACK COAT GALLON 5160 $ a00|$ 24,640.00
; 600A-000  [MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 200000 | § 2,000.00
=g 701C-002  [AROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT}-YELLOW MILE 2 s 57200 § 1,944.00
osne g o R 7016003 [SOLIB TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT}-YELLOW MILE 3 HOND NoBID s 1034001 § 3,202.00 NG B
£ & a2aa3ays  |SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 3/4° S e
2 z MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESA1 AANGE AfB { RATE 165 LAS/SY | s 775 51,150.00
§E BC-900  |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 0 80.00 1,600.00
PROJECTND. | ROAD NAME TEMNO.  |DEScrirmion UNIT ary UNITPRICE [  AMOUNT UNITPRICE |  AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE | AMGUNT
Nl 405A-000  [TAck coAT GALLOW 1500 400 6.400.00
Es3 701003 [SOLIC TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 1,034.00 2,068.00
ousud | Y 2o, T03A-002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 1000 O o NGB 6.00 6,000.00 NO B
(ALTERNATE) [ & x & © a1ea3ars  |PUPERPAVE BITUMINGUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 3/4" 7. 1500
g s 5 a MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B | RATE 165 BS/SY } .75 11,625.00
E 8C-900  [DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 3 80.00 240.00
PROJECTND. | ROADNAME | WTEMNOD.  |pEscrirmion UNIT ary UNITPRICE | AMOUNT UNITPRICE | AmOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNITPRKE | AmounT
s 405A-000  |TACK COAT GALLON 4686 400(s 18,744.00
28, a2-gage  |FYPERPAVE BITUMINGUS CONCRETE LIPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 1 1/2° e 250
TR MAXIMUM SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 330 LBS/SY) 5 20005 5.000.00
0208015 B ; g AT (MOBIZATION S ! NOBID NOBID s 20000015 20050 NO BID
e 701C-002  [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 4 $ 97200 | 5 3,888.00
£ § = 701C-003  [SOUID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT}-YELLOW MILE 2 $ 103408 | § 2,068.00
] BC-723*  [BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOLS PLANT MIX - PER TON | RATE 165 LES/SY ) TON 4013 $ 7508 31,100.75
= BC-S00  |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 22 s oo | ¢ 1,760.00
TOTAL: NO BID TOTAL: NO 81D TOTAL: 5 294,240.25% NO BID
BAE: NO BID BID: NOD 8ID 18ID: § 294,440.25 NQ BID
3 {200.00)




