BID TAB SUMMARY - RESURFACING GROUP 4 (3/16/2016})

Indexed Asphait Cost: I John G. Walton H.0. Weaver Ammons & Blackmon Mobile Asphalt Co.
Alternate 1 - Six Roads - All Labor and Material N/A TOTAL: 5 1,399,170.72 [TOTAL: S 1,328,414 65 |TOTAL: NO BID TOTAL: $ 1,329,041.74

Altarnate 2 - Six Roads - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix |'s 1,073,642.80 [Lay Down: NO BID |Lay Down: NOBID  |lay Down: S 301,685.00 |[EyDown:
ToTAL: _ N/A |ToTAL: N/A ToTAL: $ 1,375327.80 1
Addendum 1 Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bid Bond Included Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contract Included Yes Yes Yes Yes

Alternate 2 (Lay Down Only)liS . 1,322,908/441| Mohile Asphalt Co. (actual low bid is *$249,265.64 for asphalt lay down)

ENGINEER'S CERTIFICATE:

I, JOEY NUNMALLY, P.E/CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER, HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE IS A TRUE AND CORRECT BID TABULATION FOR THE ABOVE REFERENCED PROJECT AND TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE .

3/08/7¢

Nunnally, P.E.

N



Alternate 1 - Six Roads - All Labor and Material John G. Walton H.0. Weaver Ammons & Blackmon Mobhile Asphalt Co.
PROJECT NO. | ROAD NAME ITEMNO. | DESCRIPTION UNIT any UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
] 4054000 |vACK COAT GALLON 4646 |5 3345 1551764 | § 3.00]$ 13,933.00 5 3505 16,261.00
5 -] a24n.g35  |SUPERPAVE BIFUMINGUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, 17 MAXIMUM AGGREGATE I 5500
-3 SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/8 - PER TON (RATE 220 LBS/SY} $ 53.68 | § 289,872.00 | 5 5070 | § 273,780.00 $ 48.00 | 5 259,200.00
E § i |summrs BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 1 1/2* e -
0207415 E g MAXIMUM SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON {RATE 330 LBS/SY} $ g214|¢ 4722640 | ¢ sasals 45.220.00 e s sso0ls 44,84000
ShE 6004-000 |MOBIUZATION LUMP 5UM 1 $ 6,095.00 | $ 5,095.00 | $ 15,000.00 | § 16,000.00 § 54,30000]3% 54,300.00
§ g 701002  |BROKEN TEMPGRARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 H 550.00 | § 110000 |$ 60000 ¢ 1,200.00 § sooools 1,600.00
g 3 701C-003  [SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 6 § 900.00 | 5 5400005 980003 5,850.00 ¢ Bsnoo|s 5,100.00
sc BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MY - PER TON [ RATE 125 LBS/SY) TON 3080 |5 5142 |$ 187,945.20 | § 5650 | § 172,890.00 $ 51518 163,740.60
g B8C-500 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SOUARE YARD 10 $ 6833 | 5 63330 § 5365 | § 536.50 $ 15.00 | 5 150.00
PROJECT NO. | ROAD NAME ITEM MO, [DESCRIPFTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
E 8 405A-000  |TACK COAT GALLON 908 {3 3348 103272 § 3.00f5 2,724.00 s 0015 5.08
2 g 2 'g' 6004-000  |moOBILZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 2,380.00 | § 2,3e000f$ 630000]% 6,300.00 $  5,80000]5 5,400.00
0207215 g g2 % 5 g 701C-003  |SOLID TEMPQRARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 H 50000 § 1,80000 |5  980.00|§ 1,960.00 NOBID $  85000)% 1,700.00
g g = R g BC-723 |BALDW1N COUNTY 8ITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 185 LBS/SY | TON 825 5 7067 | % 5830275 | % 6295 | % 51,833.75 4 5700|838 47,025.00
=2z = BC-900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD s Is 69.09 | § 62181 %  5365|$ 482.85 $ 15008 135.00
PROSECT NO. | ROAD NAME ITEMNO.  |DESCRIFTION UNIT qary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
5 Z.a 405A-000  [vAcK coAT GALLON 160 |5 3325 53140 8 3p0|$ 480.00 5 001§ 1.60
e "5’ E g E 600A-000 IM-OBILIZATIDN LUMP SUM 1 H 1,300.00 | 5 140000 | $ 5.500.00 | 5,500.00 $ 1440005 1,440.00
0207315 |2 E & = 2 701C-003  |SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT}-VELLOW MILE 1 H 900.00 | § 90000 | §  98000|3% 980.00 NO BID $ 850.00(% 850.00
% 258 E BC-723 Iaawwmcoum BITUMINGUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY } TON 150 5 77.02]3% 11.553.00) § 8180 | % 12,270.00 [3 B1.00|% 12,150.00
E=5 BC-500 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 7 $ 67.40 | 5 a71.80)$ 53,65 | § 375.55 $ 15.00 | $ 105.00
PROJECT NO. | ROAD NAME ITEMNO.  [DESCRIPTION UNIT qQry UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMDUNT UNIT PRICE [ AMOUINT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
E zg 405A-000  [TACK COAT GALLON 6453 |s 334 (% 21,553.02 ) § 300 )% 19,355.00 H 0.01 )¢ §4.53
§ § e 600A-000  |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 3,345.00 | § 3345005 950000 % 9,500.00 $ 33,900.00] % 33,900.00
J— o é = 701C-002  |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3 s 550.00 | § 165000 )% 60000 % 1,800.00 T $  80000{$ 2,400.00
905 701C-003  |SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 8 s 500,00 | § 720000{5 seoo0 ]S 7,840.00 $  85000]% 6,800.00
g 5 5 BC-723 BALDWIN COLINTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY } TON 5500 |$ sg.u7 |3 329,20500 | 5 55.35 | § 304,425.00 5 53.80 | $ 255,900.00
« g Q BC-000 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 30 H 5790 % 1737.00 | § 516515 1.509.50 5 1500 | 5 450.00
PROJECT NO. | ROAD NAME ITEMNO.  |DESCRIFTION UNIT qry UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNT PRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
E q E 405A-000  [TACK COAT GALLON 6182 |s 334|% 20,647.88 | § 30015 18,546.00 H 0.01]$ 61.82
3553 600A-000  |MOBILZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 515000 | § 5150005 8,00000)]$ 8,000.00 $ 3564000 | § 35,640.00
T géEE 701C-002  |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 4 4 55000 | 5 220000] 5 600008 240000 Mo BID s B0000]s 3,20000
£ E g= 701C-003  [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 5 s 300.00 | 5 4500005  sm000]s 4,900.00 $ 50003 4,250.00
2ok 8C-723 BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON [ RATE 165 LBS/SY | TON 5748 |3 59.87 | § 344,132.76 | § 55.00  § 316,140.00 5 5450 | $ 313,266.00
g e BC-500 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 0 $ - s - s K - H 15.00 | $ S
PROJECT NO. | ROAD NAME TEMNO.  |DESCRIFTION UNIT ud UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT unTPRICE | AMOUNT UNIY PRICE AMOUNT
g ; = 4054000  |TACK COAT GALLON m|s 3345 70474 | 5 3.001% 633,00 H 0015 2.11
E 382 500A-000  |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 2.980.00| 5 29800015 430000)$ 4,300.00 $ 1,90000|5 1,800.00
0208315 g ; E 701C-003  [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 3 800.00 | 4 spoools  osoonls 920.00 NO BID $ 850005 850.00
= g i 8C-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY } TON 00 |3 8813 | s 17,626.00 | § 7500 | § 15,000.00 - 81005 15,200.00
g5~ BC-500 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 10 $ 6833 |5 68330 § 53.65 | § 536.50 $ 15.00| $ 150.00
TOTAL: $ 1,399,170.72 [TOTAL: s 1,328,419.65 |[TOTAL S TOTAL $ 1,329,041.74
BID: S 1,399,170.72 [BID: $  1,328,414.65 |BID: NO BID jein: $1,329,041.74




Alternate 2 - Six Roads - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix Items Noted by * John G. Walton H.0. Weaver Ammons & Blackmon Mobile Asphalt Co.
PROJECTND. | ROAD NAME HEMNO.  |DESCRIFTION UNIT ary UNITPRICE |  AMOUNT UNT PRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
] A05A-000  |TACX COAT GALLON 4546 5 400 | 18,584.00 | § 3.20] 8 14,867.20
§ E 424B-636° SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, 1* MAXIMUM ToN 5400
- 3 AGGREGATE SIZE MLX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON [RATE 220 LBS/SY) 3 775 |% 41,85000] 5 7005 37,800.00
o a2ap.5ege | SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 11/2" - =
R Eg MAXIMUM SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/8 - PER TON (RATE 330 LBS/SY) MO oy 11 1500[ 5 11,400.00 | § 1500 | 11,400.00
E3 €00A-000  |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $  1,85000(% 1,85000 | § 6,750.00{ 5 6,750.00
§ E 701C-002  |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 s oram|s 1544008 BoooO| S 1,600.00
g g 7010003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-VELLOW MILE 6 5 1,03400] s 620400|5  8s0.00|$ 5,100.00
zx BC-723"  |BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 125 L8S/SY ) TON 3060 5 ZAE 23,715.00 | $ 8155 24,939.00
g BC-500  |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 10 5 8000 |8 800.00 | 1500 |8 15000
PROJECTNO. | ROAD NAME ITEMNO.  |DESCRIPTION unIT ary UNITPRICE |  AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UINIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
. 405A-D00 | TACK COAT GALLON 508 5 apofs 3,632.00 | ¢ [THE 8,08
3g2, g 5004-000  |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 1850005 185000 |5 1,200.00 | § 1,200.00
0207215 § E % ) E 701C-003  [SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 NO BID NOBID $ 1338008 26m00fs  Bsooo|s 1,700.00
g E g = § BC-723* BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON B2S $ 0ols 550000 § 113018 9,322.50
=%g BC-900  |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD [ 5 80.00 | 5 72000 | 5 1500 | § 135.00
PROJECT NQ, | ROAD NAME MEMND.  |DESCRIFTION UNIT ary unITPRICE | AamounT UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
B Z . ol 4054000 [7TACKCOAT GALLON 160 5 4005 64000 | 5 0015 1.60
3 'é E 2= s00a000 [mOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 1850008 185000 |  ss000 )5 550.00
0207315 g g § E E P01C-003  |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE {PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 NO BID NO BID $ 1,64100]% 1641005 8500} 3$ 850,00
E E 52 & BC-723*  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY } TON 150 5 1700} % 255000 | $ 3000 | $ 4,500.00
degta BC900  |ORIVEWAY CUT.BACKS SQUARE YARD 7 5 8000 | 3 $60.00 | § 1500 | 3 105.00
PROJECT NO. | ROAD NAME IMEMNO. | DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNITPRICE |  AMDUNT UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT LINIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
en E 405A000  |TACK COAT GALLON 6453 5 400 s 2681200 | % 001]% 6453
E g E 500A-000 MOBIUZATION LUMP SUM § 1850005 1850001 5 &550000(5 5,500.00
33 % 701C-002  |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT|-YELLOW MILE 3 $ o700 % 291600(5  80000(s 2,400.00
Q2Les1d 438 701C-003 _ [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINTI-YELLOW MILE [ Ll LELL 5 1034008 32200 850005 £,800.00
%%% BC-723*  |BALDWIM COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MEX - PER TON { RATE 165 LES/SY | TON 5500 s 25| ¢ e 755 | 8 42,075.00
e 4 BC-500  [DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 30 $ 80.00 | § 2,400.00 | 5 15.00 | § 450,00
PROIECT NO. | ROAD NAME ITEM NO. IIIESCNPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE [ AMOUNT UNIT PRICE I AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
ag a05A-000  |TACK COAT GALLON 6182 $ 4005 24,72800 | § 001 |$ 61.82
EL § 600A-000 _|MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 1,85000]%5 1850005 630000]5 6,300.00
§ 2= 701C-002  |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 4 $  97200]% 388800 $  80000|% 3,200,00
0208115 § g E 701C-003  |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 5 NOBID NOBID 5 1034005 s17000| %  msonc|s 4,250.00
£ é g BC-723* |memcoumalmMmous PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY } TON 5748 : 775 |8 aasaroo|s 8o | s 49,432.80
dg BC-200 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQOUARE YARD 0 s 8o.0O | S - s 1500 | & -
PROJECT NO. | ROAD NAME MEMNKO.  |DESCRIPTION unrt ary UNITPRICE |  AMOUNT UNFT PRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
T A05A-000  |TACK COAT GALLON 211 3 400§ saa.00 | 5 001 % 211
u3 § BO0A-D00  |MOBILIZATION LLMP SUM 1 $ 185000 % 185000)s 75000/ s 750.00
T g g E 701C003  [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 NOBID NOBID $ 1641008 16410005 85000 % 850.00
E §§ BC-723% |uwwmcounwan'ummous PLANT MIX - PER TON [ RATE 165 LBS/SY } TON 200 s 700 5 3.40000 | § 3000 6,000.00
i BC-902  |DRIVEWAY CuT-8ACKS SQUARE YARD 10 5 80.00 | 5 800.00 | $ 15.00 | § 150.00
TOTAL: NOBID  |TOTAL NO BID TOTAL 5 301,655.00 [TOTAL 5 249,265.64
|sio: NO BID [Bi0: NO BID BID: $ 301,685.00 |BID: § 249,265.564




