
COMPETITIVE BID #WG16-09 BID TABULATION
JANITORIAL SERVICES 

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
LOCATION Jani-King Service Master Jazzy Clean Southern Management-ABM LLC

Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes Yes
Per/Month

Sheriff's Office & Support Services $697.18 No Bid $1,014.79 $831.44
Criminal Investigation Division -Rdale $776.79 $489.00 $514.56 $512.36
Law Enforcement Support Serv - Rdale $133.67 $197.00 $325.26 $210.86
Law Enforcement Maintenance - Rdale $257.55 $275.00 $323.65 $292.01
BRATS Agency-Robertsdale $572.69 $510.00 $374.22 $474.86
Silverhill Barn & Maintenance Division $307.29 $450.00 $393.15 $485.98
Park Building- Silverhill $207.96 $244.00 $318.39 $188.66
Foley Hwy $346.45 $400.00 $348.21 $293.74
Bay Minette Hwy $259.07 $291.00 No Bid $397.33

   
Per/Day

Sheriff's Office & Support Services $53.67 No Bid $84.56 $69.29
Criminal Investigation Division -Rdale $59.80 $37.62 $42.88 $42.70
Law Enforcement Support Serv - Rdale $10.29 $15.15 $27.10 $17.58
Law Enforcement Maintenance - Rdale $19.83 $21.15 $26.97 $24.33
BRATS Agency-Robertsdale $44.09 $58.85 $31.18 $39.57
Silverill Barn & Maintenance Division $23.66 $51.92 $32.76 $40.50
Parks Building- Silverhill $24.01 $18.77 $26.53 $23.58
Foley Highway $40.01 $46.15 $29.02 $36.71
Bay Minette Hwy $29.92 $33.58 No Bid $49.79


