BID TAB SUMMARY - RESURFACING GROUP 3 (2/17/2016)

Indexed Asphalt Cost: Mobile Asphalt Co. John G. Walton H.O. Weaver Ammons & Blackmon
Alternate 1 - Five Roads - All Labor and Material N/A TOTAL: $ 2,188,003.82 |TOTAL: S 2,086,358.49 |TOTAL: S 2,176,744.20 |TOTAL: NO BID
Alternate 2 - Five Roads - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix Items Noted by * | S 1,825,942.69 |Lay Down: S 422,700.07 |Lay Down: NO BID Lay Down: NO BID Lay Down: S  577,070.97
TOTAL: S 2,248,642.76 |TOTAL: N/A TOTAL: N/A TOTAL: S 2,403,013.66
Alternate 3 - Seven Roads - All Labor and Material | N/A ITOTAL: S 2,234,773.77 [TOTAH.: $ 2,135,471.40 ITOTAL: S 2,228,581.60 ITOTAL: NO BID
Alternate 4 - Seven Roads - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix Items Noted by * l S 1,853,192.91 |Lay Down: $  446,500.04 |Lay Down: NO BID Lay Down: NO BID Lay Down: S 603,212.87
TOTAL: S 2,299,692.95 |TOTAL: N/A TOTAL: N/A TOTAL: S 2,456,405.78
Addendum 1 Yes Yes Yes Yes
Addendum 2 Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bid Bond Included Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contract Included Yes Yes Yes Yes

Five Roads (Alternate 1)

i

2,086,358.49

Seven Roads (Alternate 3)

S 2,135,471.40

John G. Walton
John G. Walton

ENGINEER'S CERTIFICATE:

l, JOEY NUNNALLY, P.;E'., CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER, HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE IS A TRUE AND CORRECT BID TABULATION FOR THE ABOVE REFERENCED PROJECT AND TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE .
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Alternate 1 - Five Roads - All Labor and Material Mobile Asphalt Co. John G. Walton H.O. Weaver Ammons & Blackmon
PROIJECT NO. ROAD NAME | ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 11233 |5 355 | 39,877.15 | § 3.28 |5 36,844.24 | $ 340 | $ 38,192.20
408A-052 |PLANING EXISTING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0" THICK) SQUAREYARD | 8609 | g 060 | § 5,165.40 | § 058 | s 4,993.22 | § 095 | $ 8,178.55
o
. o
z 1 5 48.60 | § 631,800.00 | § 48.03 | $ 624,390.00 | 3 49.40 | 5 642,200,00
g o 4248645 |SVPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 1 1/2" ToN 1800
0218814 EE MAXIMUM SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 330 LBS/SY) s 54608 98,280.00 | $ 59.01 ¢ 106,218.00 | 5 64.00 | § 115,200.00 NO BID
e 600A-000 [MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 |s 112700003 112,700.00 | §  16,235.00 | $ 16,235.00 | $  28,000.00 | § 28,000.00
; 701C-002 [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 55 s 800.00 | § s40000)s  se216]s 474188 | s 540,00 | § 2,970.00
§ 701C-003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 942 |s 850.00 | § 800700 s 916043 862910 | § 1030003 9,702.60
. BC-723  [BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 7387 | 5375 | s —— — avigaos |3 — 42290575
BC-900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUAREYARD | 71 |5 15.00 | § 1,065.00 | $ 4256 | $ 3,021.76 | $ 5200 | $ 3,692.00
5 405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 2346 |3 0.01]3 2346 | s 3.28 | s 7,694.88 | 340 |8 7,976.40
£3 600A-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 |s 13325008 1332500 | $  1,7a0000 | $ 1,740.00 | §  6500.00 | § 5,500.00
EE 701C-002 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 123 |3 800.00 | § 98400 s 86216 | 1,060.46 | $ 540.00 | § 664.20
qa1p91s §§ 701C-003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 301 [s 850.00 | § asseso | s 91605 | $ 2757318 1030005 3,100.30 NoBn
%g BC-723  [BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/5Y ) TON 1936 | " " seanis vomsaes | & ssisa | ¢ {67 RRE
e BC-900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 56 S 15.00 | § 840.00 | 5 39.00 | 2,184.00 | S 52.00 | § 2,912.00
5 405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON S87 |3 0013 58715 328(5 192536 | $ 3.40|3 1,995.80
g% 500A-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 s 370000]$ 3,70000 | 5 3,150.00 | $ 3,150.00 | 5 650000 | $ 6,500.00
EE 701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 042 |3 800,00 | § 33600 |5 862173 362118 540.00 | § 226.80
0219114 g £ [ 701003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINTL-YELLOW MILE 055 |s 850.00 | 3 46750 |5 91604 |5 s03.82 s 103000 % 566.50 i 1o
%g BC-723 [BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON soo |, — P 3500000 | ¢ gss ] 197500 | 8 o I $i86000
3 BC-900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS squarevarD | 24 | 15.00 | 5 360.00 | § 43.00 [ 5 1,032.00 | $ 5200 [ § 1,248.00
S 405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 4107 S 00115 41.07 | & 328 | S 13,47096 | S 3405 13,963.80
Eq 600A-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 |s 1s1s5000]s 18,150.00 | §  2,380.00 | & 2,380.00 | $  9,00000 | $ 9,000.00
w 701€-002 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 277 |s 800.00 [ 221600 | 86216 | § 2,388.18 | $ 540.00 | § 1,495.80
0218614 ég 701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 328 |3 850,00 | & 278800 | 91605 300464 |5 1030005 3,378.40 NaBm
%5 BC-723 [BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 3500 | ssen | s e I seis | e it | T
8 BC-900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUAREYARD | 67 |5 15.00 | § 1,005.00 36.00 | § 2,412.00 | 52.00 | 5 3,484.00
o 405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 6272 | 0015 6272 $ 3.28 |5 20,572.16 | 340 [ s 21,324.80
=]
e el I
TE ; 5 55.60 | § 404,490.00 | $ 52.96 | § 385,284.00 | $ sas0 [ 396,487.50
sz 4248643 |SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 11/2" e "B
0207515 Ed MAXIMUMSIZE MPG ESALBANGE A/B - PERTON (RATES30.85/5Y) $ 53.75 | 8 s6437.50| s 6088 |8 63,924.00 | 67.00 | § 70,350.00 LD
Eg 500A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 s 1750008 41,750.00 | §  3,150.00 | § 3150005 14000003 14,000.00
;g 701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 459 |s 800.00 | § 3,672.00 | § 862.16 | $ 395731 | % 540,00 | § 2,478.60
z® 701€-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 314 |3 850.00 | § 266900 8 916.04 |3 287637 |5 103000 s 3,234.20
B BC-900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 84 s 15.00 | § 1,260.00 | & 36.00 | § 3,024.00 | S 5200 | % 4,368.00
TOTAL: S 2,188,003.82 |TOTAL: 5 2,086,358.459 |TOTAL: S 2,176,744.20 |TOTAL: NO BID
BID: $ 2,188,003.82 !BID: S Z,UBS&Q BID: S 2,176,744.20 |BID: NO BID




Alternate 2 - Five Roads - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix Items Noted by * Mobile Asphalt Co. John G. Walton H.O. Weaver Ammons & Blackmon
PROJECT NO. | ROAD NAME | rTEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT ary | uniTerice AMOUNT UNITPRICE|  AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE[  AMOUNT
405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 11233 |5 ass|s 39,877.15 s ars|s  az123s
408A-052 |PLANING EXISTING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0" THICK) SQUARE YARD 09 |s  o7s|s 6,456.75 s 325|s 2797935
@
R P e e
= , s 8o0ls 104,000.00 s 9z21|$ 11973000
% = 208645+ |SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 1 1/2" . T
0218814 g2 MAXIMUM SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 330 LBS/SY) & wooole TEcadi NOBID NO BID s wmsols  susonoe
g = 600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 |s  oo1fs 0.01 $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
= 701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 55 |s soooo0|s 4,400.00 $  900.00 | § 4,950.00
§ 701€-003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 942 |5 ss000]s 8,007.00 $ 90000 | % 8,478.00
- BC-723* |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 7287 | 1000 73,870.00 $  oauld  esomen
BC-900 [DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 71 |s 1soofs 1,065.00 s 100.00 | $ 7,100.00
3 405A-000 [TACK COAT GALLON 246 |5 o0o01]s 23.46 s 3s|s 8,797.50
g § 600A-000 [MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 s o001]|s 0.01 $ 2,695.00 | § 2,695.00
£2 701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 123 |5 soooo|s 584,00 $ 900.00 | $ 1,107.00
0218914 é 5 701C-003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 301 [¢ ssoo0]s 2,558.50 NOBID NO BID s 900,00 | $ 2,709.00
% UE BC-723* |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY | TON 1936 | o0fs 5565 % i5El%  SisdEcs
8 BC-900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD s6 |5 1s.00(s 840.00 s 100005 5,600.00
& 405A-000 [TACK COAT GALLON s87 |s oo 5.87 s 4108 2,406.70
5 E 600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 s oo1]s 0.01 $ 1,750,00 | § 1,750.00
e 701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 042 |s eoooo]s 336.00 5 95000 | § 399.00
0219114 .5; g 701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT]-YELLOW MILE 055 |s ssooo|s 467.50 NOBID NOBID s 950008 522.50
% g BC-723* |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 00 e 15008 350040 s 1600 8,000.00
8 BC-900 [DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 22 |s 15008 360.00 $ 105003 2,520.00
= 405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 4107 s oofs 41.07 $  375[3  1540125
g - 600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 0.01 |8 0.01 $ 1,750.00 | § 1,750.00
Ee 701C-002 [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT}-YELLOW MILE 277 | sonoo|s 2,216.00 s gs0.00(s 2,631.50
0218614 é E 701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 328 |s ss000]s 2,788.00 NOBID NOBID $ 950,00 | $ 3,116.00
g A BC-723* |BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 3500 | 000 25000100 s 1ws0ls 3675000
S BC-900 [DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 67 |s 1s00(s 1,005.00 100.00 | $ 6,700.00
o 405A-000 [TACK COAT GALLON 6272 |s o001 52.72 s 375[s 2352000
(2]
oo SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 3/4" MAXIMUM
%% A2AA331" || GGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESALRANGEA/‘B-PERTON{RATEH(]I.BS,"S!Y) ToN 275 ¢ foeele 72,750.00 s o7s|s  70sas
J— % é 42ap-64g¢ |PUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 11/2" o i — —
E E MAXIMUM SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 330 LBS/SY) s 1zl o o see|y s
52 600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 s 0013 0.01 $ 4,700.00 | $ 4,700.00
; 2 701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 459 |s soooo|s 3,672.00 s 9s0.00s 4,360.50
z= 701C-003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT}-YELLOW MILE 314 |$ ssooos 2,669.00 s gso00(s 2,983.00
8 BC-900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD g |s 15008 1,260.00 s 100003 8,400.00
TOTAL: $  422,700.07 |TOTAL: NO BID TOTAL: NO BID TOTAL: $ 577,070.97
BID: S 422,700.07 |BID: NO BID BID: NO BID BID: S 577,070.97




Alternate 3 - Seven Roads - All Labor and Material Mobile Asphalt Co. John G. Walton H.0. Weaver Ammons & Blackmon
PROJECT NO. | ROAD NAME | ITEM NO. [DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE | AMOUNT
405A-000 [ TACK cOAT GALLON 11233 |3 355§ 39,877.15 | $ 328§ 36,844.24 | § 340 % 38,192.20
40BA-052 |PLANING EXISTING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0" THICK) SQUARE YARD 8609 5 0.60 | § 5,18540 | § 0.58 | § 4,993.22 | § 0.95|% 8,178.55
& .
R
; ! s 4860 | § 631,800.00 | $ 2803 | § 624,350.00 | § 4940 $ 542,200.00
g E 424B.648 SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 1 1/2" ToN 1800
0218814 £ MAXIMUM SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 330 LBS/SY) s sien | s S5 s 10621800 | ¢ sa0| s 115,200.00 NO BID
EF 0DA-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $  112,700.00 | § 112,700.00 | §  16,235.00 | 16,235.00 | $ 28,000.00 | § 28,000.00
; 701-002 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT}-YELLOW MILE 5.5 $ 80000 | $ 440000 )S 862165 474188 |5 54000 ]S 2,970.00
§ 701C-003 | SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 9.42 $ B850.00 | § 8,007.00 | 5 916.04 | § 8,629.10 | § 1,030.00 | 5 9,702.60
u BC-723 [BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON | RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 7387 s 5375 | § 397,051.25 | § 56.15 | 5 414,780.05 | $ 575 | § 422,905.75
BC-900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 71 s 1500 | § 1,065.00 | 5 4256 | S 3,021.76 | § 52,00 | 5 3,692.00
a 405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 2346 s 0015 2346 | 3 3.28 |5 7,694.88 | § 3405 7,976.40
§§ 600A-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 13,325.00 | § 13,325.00 | $  1,74000 | § 1,740.00 | 3 6,500.00 | § 6,500.00
E% 701C-002 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 123 s 800.00 | § sa00|$ 2165 106046 | 54000 | § 664.20
0218914 §§ 701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT}-YELLOW MILE 301 | 850,00 | § 255850 | & o1605| s 2757231 |5 1030008 3,100.30 No BID
%% BC-723 |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 1936 s 5365 | 5 103,865.40 | $ seas | s 109,151.68 | 5 5550 | & 107,448.00
() BC-900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 56 § 1500 | § 840.00 | § 39.00 | § 2,184.00 | § 52.00 | & 2,912.00
& 405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 587 s 001 [ s 5875 328(s 1,825.36 | $ 340 | § 1,995.80
SE 600A-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 S 3,700.00 | § 3,700.00 | 5 3,15000 | § 315000 |5 650000 % 6,500.00
EE 701C-002 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 042 |s 800,00 | 5 s3600|s  86217]s 36211 | s4000] 8 226,80
0213114 Eg 701€-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW, MILE 0ss s 850.00 | a67.50 |3 o604 |5 sos.82|$ 108000 ¢ 566.50 bt il
%g BC-723 |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 185 LBS/SY ) TON 500 $ 86.00 | & 3300000 | § 63.95 | § 3197500 | & s1.00| % 30,500.00
g BC-900 [DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 24 5 15.00 | § 360.00 | 5 4300 | % 1032008 s2.00| % 1,248.00
5 405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 4107 |s 001 |$ 4107 |5 3288 1347096 | § 340 s 13,963.80
5 500A-000 [MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 1815000 [ 1815000 | §  2,38000 | § 238000 ¢  900000] 8 5,000.00
Eg 701C-002 [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 277 |s 800.00 | § 221600 |5 8216 s 238818 | ¢ saooo|s 1,495.80
0218614 EE 701C-003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3.28 $ 85000 | § 2,788.00 | § 916.05 | § 300464 | § 108000/ § 3,378.40 NoBID
%E BC-723 [BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 3500 $ 5590 | & 195,650.00 | $ 5615 | ¢ 196,525.00 | ss.00 | § 192,500.00
S BC-S00 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 67 5 1500 | $ 1,005.00 | § 3600 | $ 2,412.00 | § 52.00 | § 3,484.00
o 405A-000 [TACK COAT GALLON 6272 |s 0018 6272 s 328 % 20,5726 | § 340§ 21,324.80
@
R e L e I
;% ‘ 5 55.60 | $ 404,490.00 | § 52.96 | § 385,284.00 | § 54.50 | § 396,487.50
3 6 424 SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 1 1/2"
0207515 oz 248848 |\ 1AXIMUM SIZE MI¥, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 330 LBS/sY) ToN 10 8 s | warle  smls wmily  wawls . NoBID
i% S00A-000 [MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 4175000 S 4175000 | § 315000 | § 3,15000 | $ 14,000.00 | § 14,000.00
;2 701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT}-YELLOW MILE 4.59 s 800.00 | § 367200] 8 862.16 | § 3,957.31 ) $ 540,00 | § 2,478.60
g“ 701C-003 [SOUID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 314 |s 850,00 | § 266900]$ 916045 287637 |$ 1080003 3,234.20
O BC-900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 84 5 15.00 | 1,260.00 | $ 36.00 | 302400 | 3 5200 | § 4,368.00
2 405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 232 s 3558 823.60 | § 328 76096 | $ 340 s 788.80
s
£l |osmmimmeacarenmnapaiameet | s | w
8%z J 5 100.00 | $ 3,500.00 | § 89.04 | § 311640 | § 11850 | § 4,182.50
0207015 a8 2] = 600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 H 2,300.00 | § 230000 | $ 266000 ¢ 2,660.00 | § 550000 | % 5,500.00 NO BID
253 701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 03 |5 850,00 | § 30600]s o606 32078 | §  1,08000 | $ 370.80
g% BC-723 |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY | TON a0 |, v | e O smss | ¢ Tl e I RS
= BC-900 [DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 42 5 15.00 | § 53000 | § 3000 $ 1,638.00 | 5 52.00 | $ 2,184.00
@ 405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 217 H 355 | § 77035 | 5 328 |58 71176 | § 3408 737.80
% 4242341 |SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 3/4" MAXIMUM o S
gm AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 220 LBS/SY) s o 1730000 | 7001 | 8 1850250 | ¢ 050 | 5 15.125.00
0207115 g % 4245645 |SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 11/2" = = NOBID
29 MAXIMUM SIZE MiX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 330 LBS/SY) s s0.00 | $ 315000 | 504 | § 311640 | 11950 5 4.182.50
E 600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 3 2,400.00 | § 240000 |§ 267000 ¢ 267000 ¢ 450000 5 4,500.00
>:— 701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 0.2 s 850.00 | & 170.00 § & 91605 | & 183.21 | § 1,030.00 | § 206.00
w BC-900 [DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 20 |3 1500 | § 300.00 | § 51.00 | § 1,020.00 | § 52.00 | $ 1,040.00
TOTAL: $ 2,234,773.77 [TOTAL: & 2,135,471.40 JTOTAL: S 2,228,581.60 [TOTAL: NO BID
BID: S 2,234,773.77 |BID: 5 5,471.40 |BID: BID: NO BID




Alternate 4 - Seven Roads - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix Items Noted by * Mobile Asphalt Co. John G. Walton H.0. Weaver Ammons & Blackmon
PROJECT NO, | ROAD NAME | ITEM NO. [DESCRIPTION UNIT ary | unITPRICE AMOUNT UNITPRICE | AMOUNT UNITPRICE | AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
405A-000 [TACK COAT GALLON 11233 | 5 355§ 39,877.15 5 3758 42,123.75
408A-052 | PLANING EXISTING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0* THICK) SQUARE YARD | 8603 |3 075 | 6,456.75 5 3253 27,979.25
a
2 SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, 1 MAXIMUM
% A24B-636" || GGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 220 LBS/SY) N 1200 s il doupcand s ssle gl
g g 424p-g4g~ |SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 11/2" o 1800
0218814 £l MAXIMUM SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 330 L8S/SY) s 1000 | $ 18,000.00 NO BID NO BID s — 31,500.00
E e B600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 H 0015 0.01 $ 500000 |5 5,000.00
z 701C-002_|BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 55 s 800003 4,400.00 $ 90000 $ 4,950.00
§ 701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 942 s 850005 8,007.00 $ 90000 % 8,478.00
= BC-723* |BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MIX - PER TON [ RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 387 | 1000 | 8 D, s eo |3 68.084.27
BC-900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS squAREYARD [ 71 |5 1500 | § 1,065.00 s 10000]|$ 7,100.00
5 405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 2346 | s oot [ § 23.46 5 375§ 8,757.50
25 500A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 |s oo1 [ 0.01 S 2,69500]3 2,685.00
£g 701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 123 |s  eooco s 984.00 5 90000]|% 1,107.00
0218914 § § 701C-003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT}-YELLOW MILE 301 |5  esooo|s 2,558.50 NoBID No sip s soooo|s 2,709.00
% g BC-723% | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON | RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 136 | ool & 5885160 s o] 000
8 BC-900 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS sQuAREYARD | 56 |$ 15.00 | § 840.00 5 100008 5,600.00
g 405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 587 | s 0018 5.87 s 410 | 8 2,406.70
H E GD0A-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 |s 0018 0.01 5 175000 | § 1,750.00
E £ 701C-002 |BAOKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 042 |5 800008 336.00 5 95000 |8 399.00
0215114 E S 701C-003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT}-YELLOW MILE 055 |5 sso00)s 467,50 NOBID NOBID 5 950008 522.50
% g BC-723* |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON so0 |, 1510 0 s igoo| £,000,00
8 BC-900 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUAREYARD | 24 |§ 15.00 | § 360.00 s 10500 $ 2,520.00
é 4058-000 |TACK COAT SALLON il I 001 s 41.07 5 ars|s 15,401.25
z 600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 ]s 001 0.01 $ 1750003 1,750.00
o g g 701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 277 |5 soooo)s 2,216.00 NOBID SiEIG s 95000 2,631.50
og 701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT]-YELLOW MILE 328 |5 ssooos 2,788.00 s 950008 3,116.00
% BC-723*  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY } TON 3500 | 1000 ¢ — s dosa) & SE 75006
o BC-500 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUAREYARD | 67 |¢ 15.00 | § 1,005.00 $ 10000 $ §,700.00
o 4054000 |TACK COAT GALLON 5272 |3 001 | s 62.72 3 375 s 23,520.00
8 SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 3/4" MAXIMUM
2 % A24A38L" | \GGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/S - PER TON (RATE 220 LBS/5Y) ol 232 - 3 smls oo
5 SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 11/2"
0207515 é é A24B-GIB" |3 AXIMUM SIZE MI¥, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 330 L8S/sY) ¢ o8 | P . . NO BID NO BID N w5750
E g 6004-000_[MmoBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 s 0018 0.01 S 470000 | § 4,700.00
; ES 701€-002_|BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 459 |s  Boooo|s 3,672.00 $  95000|s 4,360.50
£® 701C-003_|SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 324 |5 ssooo|s 2,669.00 § 95000 2,983.00
S BC-900  [DRIVEWAY cUT-BACKS squaREYARD | Ba s 1500 | § 1,260.00 5 100003 8,400.00
2 405A-000 [TACK coaT GALLON 232 |s 355 s 823.60 $ 4103 95120
é 5 a24p-cage |SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 11/2" o -
'é g E MAXIMUM SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 330 LBS/SY) ¢ anopo e o s sae] & R
0207015 58 = | e00a000 [MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM i 001 |$ 0.01 NO BID NO BID $ 450000 | § 4,500.00
g % 3 701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 036 |8 850,00 | § 306.00 $ 160000 | § 576.00
% Z BC-723*  [BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 155 LBS/SY ) TON 20 | a000 | 6.300.00 s _— —_—
= BC-900  [DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS squaREYARD | 42 | 1500 | $ 630,00 $ 52.50 | § 2,205.00
? 405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 217 $ 355 |5S 770.35 S 410 S 8B9.70
% 42an.3a1+ | SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 3/4" MAXIMUM ToN 250
2 5 AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/ - PER TON [RATE 220 LBS/SY) . — — ¢ seisa 8 —
0207115 g 4243-64g+ |PIPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 11/2" TN s NO BID NOBID
s e MAKIMUM SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B - PER TON (RATE 330 L8S/5Y) s 100008 3,500.00 s 63.00 | § 2,205.00
; 600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM T § 001 |5 0,01 § 450000 % 4,500.00
£ 701C-003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 0z |s ssooa|s 170,00 S 1,600.00 | $ 320.00
E BC-900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 0 |s 15.00 | 300.00 s 2050 | 5 410.00
TOTAL: $ 446,500.04 [TOTAL: NO BID TOTAL: NO BID TOTAL: $ 603,212.87
BID: S 446,500.04 |BID: NO BID BID: NQO BID |BID: S 603,212.87




