COMPETITIVE BID #WG16-06 BID TABULATION
Telecommunication Materials

BIDDERS Graybar Wesco Power &
Electric Co. Distribution Telephone Supply
Systimax Solutions - MGS400BH - 246 CAT 6 Mode Ivy Data Jack #700 206 717 $7.75 each $6.40 each $13.00 each Substitue OCC $4.49 each
Systimax Solutions - PM-GS3-24 Port Patch Panel #760 062 372 $268.53 each $229.00 each $411.00 each Substitue OCC $84.89 each

Systimax Solutions - PM-GS3-48 Port Patch Panel #760 062 380

Systimax Solutions - FPCWSCSC21 - RF001 Single Mode SC to SC Jumper

Systimax Solutions - FPCWSCSC21 - RF003 Single Mode SC to SC Jumper

Systimax Solutions - FPCWSCSC21 - RF006 Single Mode SC to SC Jumper

Systimax Solutions - FPCWSCSC21 - RF010 Single Mode SC to SC Jumper

Systimax Solutions - FPCWSCSC21 - RF020 Single Mode SC to SC Jumper

Quiktron 810-112-006 ST TO ST DPLX M/Mode 2MTR Jumper

Quiktron 810-112-009 ST TO ST DPLX M/Mode 3MTR Jumper

Quiktron 810-112-009 LC TO ST DPLX M/Mode 3MTR Jumper

AllenTel GBLCC-D1-02 LC/SC DUPLEX SM 2MTR

AllenTel GBLCC-D2-02 LC/SC DUPLEX MM 2MTR

Corning 850-LL2-003 2M LC-LC DPLX 1.8 MM FIBER CBL

UniCam 95-200-98 LC Single-mode Connector with Ultra PC polish and rotating cam
UniCam 95-200-41 SC Single-mode Connector with Super PC polish and rotating cam
UniCam 95-200-42 SC Single-mode Connector with Ultra PC polish and rotating cam
UniCam 95-200-51 ST Compatible Single-mode Connector with Super PC polish and rotating cam
UniCam 95-200-52 ST Compatible Single-mode Connector with Ultra PC polish and rotating cam
UniCam 95-200-61 FC Single-mode Connector with Super PC polish and rotating cam
UniCam 95-200-62 FC Single-mode Connector with Ultra PC polish and rotating cam
UniCam 95-000-98 LC Multimode Connector for 62.5 pum fiber with ceramic ferrule

UniCam 95-050-98 LC Multimode Connector for 50 um fiber with ceramic ferrule

UniCam 95-000-40 SC Multimode Connector for 62.5 um fiber with composite ferrule
UniCam 95-000-41 SC Multimode Connector for 62.5 pum fiber with ceramic ferrule

UniCam 95-050-41 SC Multimode Connector for 50 pm fiber with ceramic ferrule

UniCam 95-000-50 ST Compatible Multimode Connector for 62.5 um fiber with composite ferrule
UniCam 95-000-51 ST Compatible Multimode Connector for 62.5 um fiber with ceramic ferrule
UniCam 95-050-51 ST Compatible Multimode Connector for 50 um fiber with ceramic ferrule
UniCam 95-000-61 FC Multimode Connector for 62.5 um fiber with ceramic ferrule

Systimax Solutions - Fiber Coupler #108-009-408

Systimax Solutions - Duplex Faceplate #108-168-477

Systimax Solutions - Quad Faceplate #108-168-550

Systimax Solutions - 6 Plex Faceplate #108-168-592

Systimax Solutions - Blank Cover #107-067-860

Systimax Solutions - 4 pr. 24 port Patch Panel #108-320-029

Systimax Solutions - Category 6 Cable 4 pr. 24 Gauge Blue #760-004-689

Systimax Solutions - Category 6 Cable 4 pr. 24 Gauge Gray #700-211-931

Systimax Solutions - 12 Strand Direct Burial Multi Fiber #700-010-705

Systimax Solutions - 24 Strand Single Mode Pr. Direct Burial #700-012-297

General Aerial 24 Strand SM Fiber #AQ0244M1Y-DWB

Systimax Solutions - Protector Unit 4C3S-75 #105-581-086

B-Line Telcom Relay Rack Black #19INX7FTALUM

TYCO MOD Plug SOL 8P 24-26AWG

$537.07 each
$8.75 each
$8.95 each
$12.18 each
$15.67 each
$21.47 each
$8.22 each
$9.22 each
$9.22 each
$19.03 each
$16.96 each
$13.34 each
$13.01 each
$12.08 each
$12.08 each
$12.04 each
$12.04 each
$15.00 each
$17.00 each
$10.83 each
$11.02 each
$8.07 each
$10.35 each
$10.69 each
$7.65 each
$10.35 each
$10.58 each
$17.00 each
$7.88 each
$1.32 each
$1.32 each
$1.32 each
$13.90 per 100
$188.74 each
$232.91 per M Ft.
$232.91 per M Ft.
$0.97 each
$0.92 each
$1.04 per Ft
$9.00 each
$175.30 each
$0.28 each

$460.00 each
$17.25 each
$17.55 each
$18.00 each
$18.70 each
$20.30 each
$7.00 each
$9.00 each
$11.00 each
$41.00 each
$34.00 each
$10.00 each
$13.65 each
$12.46 each
$14.26 each
$12.42 each
$12.45 each
no bid obsolete no replacement
no bid obsolete no replacement
$11.38 each
$11.34 each
$8.30 each
$10.65 each
$11.30 each
$8.78 each
$10.65 each
$10.90 each
no bid obsolete no replacement
$7.75 each
$1.20 each
$1.20 each
$1.20 each
$12.75 each
$150.00 each
$198.00 each
$198.00 each
$0.34 each
$0.41 each
$0.75 each
$4.12 each
$112.00 each
$0.29 each

$760.00 each
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
$4.70 each
$5.35 each
$5.25 each
$30.00 each
$30.00 each
no bid
$17.16 each
$15.00 each
$18.00 each
$15.00 each
no bid
no bid
no bid
$14.00
$14.00
$10.60
$13.00
$13.00
$10.59
no bid
no bid
no bid
$11.91 each
$1.99 each
$1.99 each
$1.99 each
$1.99 each
no bid
$3.35 each
$3.35 each
$2.05 per Ft.
$1.1372 per Ft.
$1.29 each
$44.00 each
$119.00 each
nobid

Substitute Siemens $305.00 each
Substitute Quiktron $3.82 each
Substitute Quiktron $3.90 each
Substitute Quiktron $4.19 each
Substitute Quiktron $4.49 each
Substitute Quiktron $5.25 each

Substitute Quiktron $7.90 each
Substitute Quiktron $9.20 each
Substitute Quiktron $10.50 each
Substitute SSSolutions $7.69 each
Substitute SSSolutions $7.69 each
Substitute SSSolutions $7.69 each
Substitute SSSolutions $7.69 each
Substitute SSSolutions $7.69 each
Substitute SSSolutions $7.69 each
Substitute SSSolutions $7.69 each
Substitute SSSolutions $7.69 each
Substitute SSSolutions $7.69 each
Substitute SSSolutions $7.69 each
Substitute SSSolutions $7.69 each
Substitute SSSolutions $7.69 each
Substitute SSSolutions $7.69 each

Substitute Quiktron $6.56 each
Substitute Vericom $0.29 each
Substitute Vericom $0.268 each
Substitute Vericom $0.268 each
Substitute Vericom $0.15 each
Substitute Siemens $117.00 each
Substitute OCC Fiber $0.86
Substitute OCC Fiber $0.86
Substitute Corning $0.243per ft.
Substitute Corning $0.296per ft.
Substitute Prysmian $0.33 each

Substitute Siemens $267.00 each




Panduit Rack - P/N CMR19x84

Panduit Patch Panel - P/N DPA48688TGY (Cat 6)

Panduit Patch Panel - P/N DPA24688TGY (Cat 6)

Panduit Patch Panel - P/N DPA485E88TGY (Cat SE)

Panduit Wire Management - P/N PRV8

Panduit Wire Management door - P/N PRD§

Panduit Quicknet 24 Port Angled Panels - P/N QAPP24BL

Panduit Quicknet Patch Panel Port - P/N QPPABL

Panduit Mini-Com CAT6 Coupler Module-Black - P/N CC688BL

Belden 4/18 1000ft. Non Plenum Electronic Wire - P/N 4C18FS-CMR-GY-R-BED
Belden 6/18 1000ft. Non Plenum Electronic Wire - P/N 6C18FS-CMR-GY-R-BED

$158.00 each
$469.00 each
$218.00 each
$316.00 each
$385.00 each
$169.00 each
$49.29 each
$3.40 each
$11.36 each
$150.00 per M Ft.
$218.00 per M Ft.

$185.00 each
$534.00 each
$247.00 each
$360.00 each
$439.00 each
$193.00 each
$56.00 each
$3.55 each
$13.70 each
$128.00 each
$190.00 each

$255.00 each
$734.00 each
$339.00 each
$492.00 each
$598.00 each
$264.00 each
$77.00 each
$4.81 each
$6.22 each
$150.00 per 1,000 Ft.
$220.00 per 1,000 Ft.

Substitute Vericom $125.00 each
Substitute Vericom $239.00 each
Substitute Vericom $119.85 each
Substitute Vericom $168.00 each
Substitute Vericom $30.50 each
Substitute Vericom $30.50 each

Substitute Vericom $1.29 each

TOTAL

Exceptions:

$4,161.01

$3,037.26

$3,140.03




