Competitive Bid WG16-05 Bid Tabulation
Provision of Uniforms

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
Leo's Uniforms McCain Uniforms NAFECO Bob Barker

Item # Description Style Bid Bond Yes Bid Bond Yes Bid Bond Yes Bid Bond Yes
1 Convertible Jacket Brookwood $94.95 SPIEWAK S3609 $84.00 No Bid No Bid
2 Raincoat Rev. HI-Visibility Style 48/125 $69.95 $111.30 No Bid 76011BO $55.00
3 Shirt, Men L/S Flying Cross FC-33W7800Z $36.95 Flechheimer UD12020-00 $34.00 No Bid No Bid
4 Shirt, Men’s Police L/S 5.11 Style 72365 $42.95 $42.15 No Bid No Bid
5 Shirt, Men’s Police S/S 5.11 Style 71168 $38.95 71167 $42.15 No Bid No Bid
6 Shirt, Women'’s L/S 5.11 Style 62366 No Bid 62365 $42.15 No Bid No Bid
7 Shirt, Woman S/S 5.11 Style 62368 No Bid 61167 $42.15 No Bid No Bid
8 Trousers, Men Fechheimer47280-23 No Bid $74.95 No Bid No Bid
9 Trousers, Woman Flying Cross/ Fechheimer 47280-W-23 No Bid $74.95 No Bid No Bid
10 Tie 55% Poly/45% Wool $4.59 Samel Broome Series 45 $5.50 Broome #45135-4, $5.00 No Bid
11 Serving Since N/Plate BlackintonA2450 $19.95 HI-GLO $20.75 $19.00 $10.25
Serving Since N/Plate Blackington B1694 $13.95 HI-GLO $14.95 B1693 $13.75 $10.25

12 Emblems Sheriff Patch samples provided $2.95 $3.50 $3.00 No Bid
Small Sheriff Patch samples provided $2.95 $2.50 $3.00 No Bid
Deputy Patch samples provided $2.95 $3.50 $3.00 No Bid
Correction Patch samples provided $2.95 $3.00 $3.00 No Bid

Court Security Patch samples provided $2.95 $3.00 $3.00 No Bid

13 Outer Weave Gun Belt #94 Safariland #94 $69.95 $66.50 94-24-4-50 $62.75 ZB56 $55.00
14 Inner Basket Weave Gun Belt #99 Safariland #99 $30.95 $33.00 99-1-19 $31.25 ZB55 $36.00
15 Trooper Hat Raincover Premier - 9000 Series $2.95 $3.50 P9000 $3.00 No Bid
16 Rank Insignia Blackinton Capt. Blackinton A1975 $11.50 Gold Plate $15.40 pair $14.00 No Bid
Blackinton Lieutenant Blackinton A1973 $10.25 Gold Plate $13.50 pair $12.50 No Bid
Blackinton Corporal Blackinton A8765A $11.50 Gold Plate $15.40 pair $14.00 No Bid
Blackinton Sergeant BlackintonA8765 $11.75 Gold Plate $15.40 pair $14.00 No Bid
Blackinton A982-3 Gold Oak Leaf Blackinton A982-3 $12.50 Gold Plate $16.50 pair $15.00 No Bid
Blackinton A2015 Gold Eagles Blackinton A2015 $12.50 Gold Plate $16.50 pair $15.00 No Bid
Blackinton A5697 Gold 3/4" Star Blackinton A5697 $12.95 Gold Plate $10.35 each $9.50 No Bid
Blackinton A3941 Gold 5/16" CHIEF Blackinton A3941 $21.59 Gold Plate $11.35 pair $10.50 No Bid
Blackinton CB020 Custom Insignia 3/8" Gold "BCSO" Blackinton #15 $21.79 Gold Plate $28.15 Style #15 pair $26.25 No Bid

17 Sheriff Straw Hat Stratton S-42 $54.95 $66.05 $56.50 $62.00
18 Hat Straps Stratton ST-3P-BK $6.95 $6.75 $6.00 $6.15
19 Gold Cords w/Acorns Stratton CD-GD $9.95 $7.00 $6.75 $6.67
20 Boots Magnum Hitec Boot Style Hi Tec 5283 $73.95 $67.70 No Bid $66.00
21 Shoes Women's Oxfords- Grabbers Rockport Style #G8732 $59.95 $33.00| Thorogood #534-6905] $111.50 No Bid
22 Shoes Bates #942 Bates 942 $96.95 $99.65 $92.50 $83.38
23 Boots Style 5.11 EVO 6" with Zipper Style 12313 $94.95 $105.00 No Bid No Bid
24 Boots Style Rocky 5150 6" Women Style 107812 No Bid $110.55 $104.00 $93.00
25 Men's Propper RIPSTOP Battle Dress (BDU) Trouser Propper F525250250 $27.50 $32.34 $29.50 No Bid




26 Men’s Proper Ripstop Lightweight Long Sleeve Tactical Dress S| Proper F531250250 $27.50 $32.34 $29.50 No Bid
27 Men's Propper Ripstop Lightweight Short Sleeve Tactical Dress Propper F531150250 $27.50 $30.99 $28.25 No Bid
28 Ripstop Boonie Hat Proper Propper# 550155001 $7.95 $7.95( Propper 55011330 $7.25 No Bid
29 Ripstop TDU Shirt — Long Sleeve — TDU Green & Khaki 5.11 Tactical #72054 $46.95 $42.15 No Bid No Bid

Ripstop TDU Shirt — Long Sleeve — TDU Green with 5.11 Tacticd 5.11 Tactical Chroma Flex #81030- Gold No Bid $61.65 No Bid No Bid

Ripstop TDU Shirt — Short Sleeve — TDU Green 5.11 Tactical #71339 $39.95 $42.15 No Bid No Bid

Ripstop TDU Shirt — Short Sleeve — TDU Green with 5.11 Tacti¢5.11 Tactical Chroma Flex #81030 — Gold No Bid $61.65 No Bid No Bid
30 Ripstop TDU Pants — TD Green 5.11 Tactical 74003 $42.95 $41.60 No Bid No Bid
31 Belt Bianchi 7200 $38.95 $40.00 BI-190984|  $40.00 No Bid
32 Belt Model #7950 Bianchi 7950 $45.95 $49.50 BI-22129 $47.00 No Bid
33 Belt Liner Model #7205 Bianchi 7205 $24.95 $23.10 BI-17710|  $22.25 No Bid
34 Gloves RFK-300 $29.50 $30.95 $29.00 No Bid
35 Jacket wifleece lining Port Authority-JP54 $28.95 $35.60 $34.75 $27.50
36 Full Length Bib Apron " Long" Navy Item 12W059 $24.95 Port Authority A700 $9.00 No Bid No Bid
37 Cook's Pants(Men’s) Red Kap PT60BN $19.95 $16.00 PT6OKH|  $19.50 $18.00

Cook's Pants(Women's) Red Kap PT61 BN $19.95 $16.00 PT61KH $19.50 $18.00
38 Lab Coats (Long)w/Long Sleeve Iltem 6TUD1 $24.95 Red Kap KP14NU $19.00 No Bid No Bid
39 Lab Coats (Long)w/Short Sleeve Landau Blue 6DTN3 $24.95 Red Kap KP14NV $22.50 No Bid No Bid
40 Magazine Holder Safariland #77-83-4HS $29.95 $34.80 $32.75 No Bid
41 Handcuff Holder Safariland #90-4HS $26.95 $26.50 $25.50 No Bid
42 Flashlight Holder Safariland #306 $19.95 $22.55 306-1-4| $21.50 No Bid
43 Holster (Right Hand) Glock .22 Safariland #6360-832-481 ALS Level llI $129.95 $133.00 $216.00 No Bid
44 Holster (Left Hand) Glock .22 Safariland #6360-832-482 ALS Level llI $129.95 $133.00 $216.00 No Bid
45 Holster (Right Hand) Glock .23 Safariland #6360-2832-481 $129.95 $133.00 $216.00 No Bid
46 Holster (Left Hand) Glock .23 Safariland #6360-2832-482 $129.95 $133.00 $216.00 No Bid
47 Belt Keepers #6406 Bianchi 6406 $2.95 Bianchi 8006 4 PK $7.95| BI-15635 4pack|  $10.00 No Bid
48 Belt Keepers #62-4HS Safariland 62-4HS $7.95 $8.15 $8.00 No Bid
49 Pepper Spray Holders Safariland 38-4-4HS $25.95 $26.50 $25.50 No Bid
50 Baton (ASP) ASP 26" F26B $89.95 ASP52611 $97.50| F26FB (52611) $84.00 No Bid
51 Cap - Flexfil Mid Profile Cap Flexfit Mid-Profile Cap Z5001 $8.95 Port Authority C865 $8.05 #5001 $7.00 $5.50
52 V-Neck Tunic Top 65% Poly 35% Cotton Landau Blue $16.95 Cornerstone CS501 $10.50 No Bid No Bid
53 Draw Strin Waist Scrub Pants w/side pockets Landau Blue $16.95 Cornerstone CS502 $12.00 No Bid No Bid
54 5.11 Tactical Polo Shirts — Blk, LE Grn, Tan, Red, Whi 5.11 Tactical Style #71049 $36.95 $36.05 No Bid No Bid

5.11 Tactical ChromaFlex Template Badge #81030 No Bid $19.50 No Bid No Bid
55 5.11 Tactical Polo Shirts — Women'’s Blk, Tan, Red, White 5.11 Tactical Style#61165 $36.95 $33.55 No Bid No Bid

5.11 Tactical ChromaFlex Template Badge #81030 No Bid $19.50 No Bid No Bid
56 5.11 Tactical Utility Polo Short Sleeve Shirt Style 41180 No Bid $23.15 No Bid No Bid

5.11 Tactical ChromaFlex Template Badge #81030 No Bid $19.50 No Bid No Bid
57 5.11 Tactical Utility Polo Women'’s Short Sleeve Style#61173 No Bid $21.15 No Bid No Bid

5.11 Tactical ChromaFlex Template Badge #81030 No Bid $19.50 No Bid No Bid
58 5.11 Tactical Packable Police Jacket (raid) No Bid 5.11 Tactical 48035 $28.60 No Bid No Bid

5.11 Tactical ChromaFlex Template Badge #81030 No Bid $19.50 No Bid No Bid
59 Women'’s Bates High Gloss Durashock oxford ltem#742 $109.95 $99.60 $91.50 $80.50
60 Bates 8” Women'’s Side Zip Delta Boot Style# 2748 $79.95 $108.70 $98.00 $92.00




61 5.11 Tactical Men's ATAC 8" Zipper Boot $99.95 12001 $80.75 No Bid No Bid
62 John Deere Steel Toe Wellington Work Boot Style #JD4302 $199.95 Georgia Boot G4693 $138.00 No Bid No Bid
63 John Deere Steel Toe Wellington Work Boot — Lace up Style #JD8193 $199.95 Georgia Boot GB00034 $110.00 No Bid No Bid
64 5.11 Tactical Leather Casual Belt 5.11 Leather Casual $29.95 59501 $36.20 No Bid No Bid
65 Rocky TMC Duty Shores 5001 Rocky 5001 TMC Duty $99.50 $112.00 $105.50 No Bid
66 Under Armour Tactical Stealth Beanie Under Armour Beanie $19.50 1219736 $18.95 1219736 $18.00 No Bid
67 5.11 TDU Pants Ripstop — Olive Green No Bid 74003 $41.60 No Bid No Bid
68 BDU Pocket Trouser — Multi Cam No Bid Blauer 8830C $74.00 No Bid No Bid
69 Short Sleeve Street Shirt - Brown Style# 8972 No Bid $40.00 No Bid No Bid
70 Long Sleeve Street Shirt — Brown Style# 8971 No Bid $45.00 No Bid No Bid
71 Armorskin Vest — Sheriff Brown Style# 8970 ELBECO V1 $99.95 $76.00 No Bid No Bid
72 Armorskin Suspension System — Black Style# 174 ELBECO VSS1 $24.95 $32.35 No Bid No Bid
73 Ripstop BDU Armorskin — Color: Silver Tan Style# 8471 No Bid $81.35 No Bid No Bid
74 Long Sleeve Ripstop Armorskin Base Shirt — Color: Silver Tan Style# 8471 FLBECO UVS114 $39.95 $49.95 No Bid No Bid
75 Long Sleeve Ripstop Armorskin Base Shirt - Color: Silver Tan Style# 8472 ELBECO UVS113 $44.95 $42.35 No Bid No Bid
76 Operational Trouser — Color:Silver Tan Style# 8835 No Bid $52.65 No Bid No Bid
EXCEPTIONS: No Yes No Yes

Bob Barker Company Alternate Bids
Item #2 Raincoat Reversible Hi-Visability - 5.11 Style 48125 Reversible - Alternate Bid Z6011BO - Tact Squad
Item #14 Inner Basket Weave Gun Belt Safariland #94 - Alternate Bid - Gould and Goodrich ZB56
Item #14 Inner Basket Weave Gun Belt Sarariland #99 - Atlernate Bid - Gould and Goodrich ZB55

McCain Uniforms
Item #2 Raincoat Reversible Hi-Visability - 5.11 Style 48125 Reversilibe - Alternate Bid Spiewak S3609

Item #3 Shirt, Mesn L/S Flying Cross FC-33W7800Z - Alternate Bid Fechheimer Urban Defender UD12020-00

Item #64 - John Deere Steel Toe Wellington Work Boot - Alternate Bid Georgia Boot #G4693
Item #65 - John Deere Steel Toe Welling Work Boot Lace Up - Alternate Bid Georgia Boot #GB00034




