Competitive Bid #WG15-37
Provision of Police Vehicle Accessories
Bid Tabulation

BIDDERS GT Distributors Dana Safety Supply Emergency Lighting
By Haynes
Bid Bond Yes Yes No
SMC #10VS C2 Recessed Panel Coated Poly W/Slotted
Ploy Window (Cage) or equal (est. qty. 14)
Model Setina PK0228TAH15 PK0228TAH15SCA Pro-Gard PSSP5704T15N
Amount Bid Each $709.90 $577.26 $595.00
SMC 2015 Tahoe 12vs Exp Metal (rear barrier) or equal (est. qty 14)
Model Setina PKO123TAH152 ND |PK0123TAH152ND Pro-Gard B5705T158
Amount Bid Each $345.90 $287.26 $322.50
SMC Window Barrier VS Steel Vertical or equal (est. gty 14)
Model Setina WK0514TAH15 WKO514TAH15 Pro-Gard WB57NPT15
Amount Bid Each $194.90 $165.04 $160.00
SMC PB400-15 Tahoe (Push Bumper) or equal (est. qty 14)
Model Setina BK0O534TAH15 BKDO534TAH15 Go Rhino 5165
Amount Bid Each $309.90 $256.15 $235.00
D & R 905-0130A (Console Feet) or equal (est. gty 14)
Model NO BID 905-0130A NO BID
Amount Bid Each 78.15
WEC PAR 46 Super LED Light 12 VVCD (spotlight bulb) or equal (est. gty 14)
Model WHELEN P465LC P465LC WHELEN P46FLC
Amount Bid Each $135.90 $129.00 $105.00
SMC Poly Panel and Hardware to divide Backseat or equal (est. gty 1)
Model Setina 2KOO35TAH15RP  |2KOO35TAH15RP Pro-Gard B5702T15
Amount Bid Each $408.90 $348.48 $322.50
WEC Blue TIR3 LED Surface MT Head w/clear Lens or equal (est. gty 30)
Model WHELEN RSB0O3ZCR RSBO3ZCR RSBO3ZCR
Amount Bid Each $48.90 $49.00 $35.00
WEC Vertex Hideaway LED-Blue or equal (est. gty 32)
Model WHELEN VTX609B VTX609B WHELEN VTX3609B
Amount Bid Each $63.90 $55.00 $55.00
WEC 6 LED Dominator All led’s to be blue or equal (est. gty 6)
Model WHELEN D6BBBBBB D6BBBBBB WHELEN D6BBBBBB
Amount Bid Each $284.90 $279.82 $275.00
WEC Dual Avenger — Blue/blue or equal (est. gty 2)
Model WHELEN AVN2BB AVN2BB WHELEN AVN2BB
Amount Bid Each $189.90 $195.00 $187.50
WEC 100/200W Scan-lock Self-contained Siren Switch or equal (est. gty 14)
Model WHELEN 2955LSA6 2955LSA6 WHELEN 2955LSA6
Amount Bid Each $349.00 $278.60 $350.00
WEC 100W Compact black siren speaker or equal (est. gty 18)
Model WHELEN SH315P SA315P & SAK56 WHELEN SA315P
Amount Bid Each $150.90 $145.00 $130.00
WEC 2015 Tahoe Strap Kit or equal (est. qty 14) Free if pur w/light bar
Model WHELEN STPKT93 MKEZ93 WHELEN STPKT93
Amount Bid Each $50.90 $32.00 $52.00
Liberty Lens retrofit Kit (light bar lens kits) or equal (est. gty 6)
Model WHELEN SLENTK1 SLENTK1 WHELEN SLENTK1
Amount Bid Each $145.90 $146.30 $135.00
WEC H/L & T/L plug-in Flasher or equal (est. gty 14)
Model WHELEN SSFPOS16 SSFPOSI6 Sound Off ETHTAHO-07




Amount Bid Each

$56.90

$47.00

$50.00

WEL Liberty I1 48” Lightbar IW8BBBB Fully Loaded (est. gty 14)

WHELEN IW8BBBB IW8BBBB WHELEN IW8BBBB
$1,498.90 $1,278.40 $1,475.00
D&R Console for 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe (est. gty 14)
Model HAVIS C-VS-2000-TAH-2  (901-0128A NO BID
Amount Bid Each $459.90 $255.00
D&R Console Plate & Feet Kit (est. qty 14)
Model HAVIS C-TMW-GMC-03 905-0130A NO BID
Amount Bid Each $115.90 $78.15
D&R Triple Outlet 12V Power Accessory (est. qty 14)
Model HAVIS C-LP-3 CA-0130 NO BID
Amount Bid Each $29.56 $28.60
D&R Armrest CA-0115 (est. gty 14)
Model HAVIS C-ARM-103 CA-0115 NO BID
Amount Bid Each $79.90 $44.95
D&R Console Face Plates for WEC 295 SLSAG (est. qty 14)
Model HAVIS C-EB40-W52-1P Included w/console NO BID
Amount Bid Each No Charge No Charge
D&R Console Face Plate Blanks (est. gty 14)
Model HAVIS FP-2 Included w/console NO BID
Amount Bid Each No Charge No Charge
D&R Console 14” SCR14RS (est. gty 14)
Model NO BID SCR14R5 NO BID

Amount Bid Each

$196.64

Exceptions: Emergency Lighting by Haynes did not submit a Bid Bond with their Bid or bid on all the items
The bid specifications stated that it was the intent of the County to award to one bidder.

GT Distributors did not bid on all the items listed in bid specifications




