Competitive Bid #WG15-14 - Bid Tabulation
Ready-Mixed Concrete
Delivered to All Sites within Baldwin County

Description Amount per
Of Item cu. yard Bidder
Class "A" $106.00 Gulf State Ready Mix
Class "B" $110.00 Gulf State Ready Mix
2500 PSI $98.00 Gulf State Ready Mix
3000 PSI $100.00 Gulf State Ready Mix
Type 1 Portland Cement (Bag) No Bid
Type 1 Portland Cement (Bulk) No Bid
Type Il Portland Cement (Bag) No Bid
Type Il Portland Cement (Bulk) No Bid

Exception: An additional fee of $75.00 shall be charged
for any deliveries of less than 5 cu yd of ready mix concrete

Supply Location: Loxley, Foley or Creola Plants
Description Amount per

Of Item cu. yard Bidder
Class "A" $120.00 Ready Mix USA
Class "B" $120.00 Ready Mix USA
2500 PSI $95.00 Ready Mix USA
3000 PSI $98.00 Ready Mix USA

Type 1 Portland Cement (Bag) No Bid

Type 1 Portland Cement (Bulk) No Bid

Type Il Portland Cement (Bag) No Bid

Type Il Portland Cement (Bulk) No Bid

Exception:

$150.00/LD Freight Charge for less than 5 cu yd; Environmental Fee of $10.00/LD

Supply Location: Baldwin County

Non-Chloride Accelerator
1%
2%
Chloride Accelerator
1%
2%
Retarder
After Hours Plant opening fee $500.00 per hour

Add per below

add $10.00/cy
add $18.00/cy

add $8.00/cy
add $10.00/cy
add $4.00cy




