BID TAB SUMMARY - RESURFACING GROUP 1 (12/16/16)

Indexed Asphalt Cost: Asphalt Services, Inc. Mobile Asphalt H. O. Weaver John G. Walton Ammons& Blackmon
Alternate 1 - Two Roads - All Labor and Material N/A TOTAL: S 835,203.60 JTOTAL: S 485,000.00 |TOTAL: S 558,569.04 |TOTAL: 587.787.40 TOTAL: NO BID

Alternate 2 -Two Roads - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix | S 391,217.24 |Lay Down: S  368,590.00 |Lay Down: NO BID Lay Down: NO BID Lay Down: NO BID Lay Down: S 151,460.20
TOTAL: S 759,807.24 |TOTAL: N/A TOTAL: N/A TOTAL: N/A TOTAL: S 542,677.44

Addendum 1 YES YES YES YES YES

Addendum 2 YES YES YES YES YES

Bid Bond Included YES YES YES YES YES

Contract Included YES YES YES YES YES

Alternate 1 {Labor and Materia&}l S

485,000.00 |Award to Mobile Asphalt

ENGINEER'S CERTIFICATE:

f

[, JOEY NUN A{LY, P

NSTRUCTION ENGINEER, HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE IS A TRUE AND CORRECT BID TABULATION FOR THE ABOVE REFERENCED PROJECT AND TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE .

L)/ G/ LG

e@Bnally, P.E.




Alternate 2 - Two Roads - All Labor and Materials, except for pay items noted by * (County will provide plant mix) Asphalt Services, Inc. Mobile Asphalt H. O. Weaver John G. Walton Ammons & Blackmon
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEMNO.  |DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
= 405A-000  |TACK COAT GALLON 3,000 |$ 5.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 3.30($ 9,900.00 | $ 3.39($ 10,170.00 | $ 3.44|$ 10,320.00 NO BID NO BID
g g Q 408A-052  |PLANING EXISTING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0" THICK) (PLANE 1.5") SQUARE YARD 58,000 |s$ 145 $ 84,100.00 | $ 0.01]$ 580.00 | $ 063]$ 36,540.00 | $ 064 % 37,120.00 NO BID NO BID
z34
0207016 %%2 424A-280 ZZZERRE';AITEE?ET/:E‘(?EJ;CLOR':’C\EEJEﬁiﬁi”:g:ig:ff LAYER, 1/2" MAXIMUM TON 4920 |s 87.40| S 430,008.00 | $ 57.80 | $ 284,376.00 | $ 63.33|$ 311,583.60 | $ 68.47 | $ 336,872.40 NO BID NO BID
EE% 600A-000  |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $  24,600.00($ 24,600.00 | $ 40,500.00 | $ 40,500.00 ] $ 8,875.09 | $ 8,875.09| s 14,949.45($ 14,949.45 NO BID NO BID
) s 701C-002  [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT) MILE 2 $ 2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00)$  400.00($ 800.00|$  43219($ 864.38|$  840.00|$ 1,680.00 NO BID NO BID
= 701C-003  [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT) MILE 6 $ 3,000.00 | $ 18,000.00| $  750.00 | $ 4,500.00|$ 81035 4,862.10|$ 89250 5,355.00 NO BID NO BID
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEMNO.  |DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
E % g 405A-000  |TACK COAT GALLON 2000 |$ 6.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 0.01|$ 20.00| $ 339($ 6,780.00 | $ 344 6,880.00 NO BID NO BID
o =
E g % 424B-648 ﬁ:}igﬁ:ﬂ?&ﬂg&?giéﬁ':AC&E;SEAULP:AES:!‘A[;;Fi ;AE;ETRC’)\’GVISTEN;’O lL;/S 2/;Y) TON 175 $ 87.50 | $ 15,312.50 | $ 67.00 | $ 11,725.00 | $ 11643 | $ 20,375.25] $ 66.12 | $ 11,571.00 NO BID NO BID
0203617 % E § 600A-000  |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $  17,500.00 | $ 17,500.00 | $ 16,913.50 | $ 16,913.50| S 9,964.71 | $ 9,964.71|s 10,719.95 [ $ 10,719.95 NO BID NO BID
= % c 701C-002  [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00|$  400.00 | $ 400.00|$  43219($ 43219|$  840.00|$ 840.00 NO BID NO BID
§ ,‘; g 701C-003  |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3 $ 2,000.00 | $ 6,000.00|$  750.00 | $ 2,25000)$  81035($ 2,431.05|$  89250($ 2,677.50 NO BID NO BID
ot 29 BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 2269 |$ 89.90 | $ 203,983.10] $ 49.50 | $ 112,315.50| $ 61.67 | $ 139,929.23] $ 64.74 | $ 146,895.06 NO BID NO BID
£85 BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 48 $ 25.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 720.00 | $ 120.03 | $ 5,761.44 | $ 39.73 | $ 1,907.04 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL $  835,203.60 |TOTAL: S 485,000.00 JTOTAL S 558,569.04 |TOTAL $ 587,787.40 |[TOTAL: NO BID
BID: $  835,203.60 |BID: S 485,000.00 |BID: $ 558,569.04 |BID: 587.787.40 |BID: NO BID




Alternate 2 - Two Roads - All Labor and Materials, except for pay items noted by * (County will provide plant mix) Asphalt Services, Inc. Mobile Asphalt H.O. Weaver John G. Walton Ammons & Blackmon

PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEMNO.  |DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
= 405A-000  |TACK COAT GALLON 3,000 |$ 6.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ - s $ - s $ - s $ 3.50 | $ 10,500.00
g E Q 408A-052  |PLANING EXISTING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0" THICK) (PLANE 1.5") SQUARE YARD 58,000 |s$ 145($ 84,100.00 | $ - s $ - s $ - s $ 0.80|$ 46,400.00

z34

cos | S3F | aanasor [SUrERPAVEBIUMINOUS CONCRETE WEATING SURFACE LAYE, 112 MANIMUN Ton s |s meo|s  amweo|s - s s - s s s S emols  maseoo
E E % 600A-000  |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $  25,000.00]($ 25,000.00 | $ - s $ - s $ - s $  7,750.00 | $ 7,750.00
) s 701C-002  [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT) MILE 2 $ 2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ - s $ - s $ - s $  1,050.00 | $ 2,100.00
= 701C-003  [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT) MILE 6 $ 3,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ - s $ - s $ - s $  1,050.00 | $ 6,300.00

PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEMNO.  |DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
E % § 405A-000  |TACK COAT GALLON 2000 |S 6.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ - |s $ $ - |$ $ 3.50 | $ 7,000.00

o =

S35 | e [urmmesmmon o o wosn e o | s mefs amemls s s s s s s ommls s
0203617 % E § 600A-000  |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 7,700.00 | $ 7,700.00 | $ - s $ - s $ - s $  7,750.00 | $ 7,750.00
= g c 701C-002  [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ - s $ - |8 $ - |8 $  1,050.00 | $ 1,050.00
é E g 701C-003  |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3 $ 2,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ - s $ - s $ - |8 $  1,050.00 | $ 3,150.00
ot 29 BC-723* BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 2269 |$ 30.00 | $ 68,070.00 | $ - s $ - |8 $ - s $ 6.80 | $ 15,429.20
£85 BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 48 $ 45.00 | $ 2,160.00 | $ - s $ - |$ $ - s $ 100.00 | $ 4,800.00
TOTAL: $  368,590.00 |TOTAL: S TOTAL: S TOTAL: S TOTAL $ 151,460.20
BID: $  368,590.00 |BID: NO BID BID: NO BID BID: NO BID BID: $ 151,460.20






