ALTERNATE 1 - Materials and Lay Down Costs

Bid #15-41

Baldwin County Resurfacing Projects 2016:

Resurfacing
BID TABULATION - Page 1

Group 2

County Rd 48 19001t East of AL HWY 181 to County Rd 33

o . . AMMONS & BLACKMON MOBILE ASPHALT COMPANY JOHN G. WALTON
Item No. Item Description Units Quantity CONSTRUGTION LLC LLC CONSTRUCTION COMPANY H.O. WEAVER & SONS INC.
Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount
BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER
BC-723 TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 1120.00 NO BID NO BID $79.50 $89,040.00 $66.89 $74,916.80 $81.50 $91,280.00
600A-000 |MCBILIZATION L.S. 1.00 NO BID NO BID $0.01 $0.01 $7,015.00 $7,015.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00
BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQ YD 8.85 NO BID NO BID $15.00 $132.75 $117.00 $1,035.45 $125.00 $1,106.25
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER
424B-636 |BINDER LAYER, 1" MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, TON 1968.00 NO BID NO BID $68.00 $133,824.00 $58.23 $114,596.64 $65.50 $128,904.00
ESAL RANGE A/B (RATE 220 LBS/SY)
405A-000 |TACK COAT GAL 810.00 NO BID NO BID $3.20 $2,692.00 $3.45 $2,794.50 $4.00 $3,240.00
ALTERNATIVE 1 TOTAL NO BID $225,588.76 $200,358.39 ; $242,030.25
Apparent Bid NO BID $225,588.76 $200,345.39 $242,030.25
Gunnison Rd from Red Barn Rd to County Rd 33
- i ; AMMONS & BLACKMON MOBILE ASPHALT COMPANY JOHN G. WALTON
Item No. Item Description Units Quantity CONSTRUCTION LLC LLC CONSTRUCTION COMPANY H.O. WEAVER & SONS INC.
Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount
BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER
BC-723 TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 960.00 NO BID NQO BID $70.00 $67,200.00 $66.89 $64,214.40 $73.00 $70,080.00
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION L.S. 1.00 NO BID NO BID $0.01 $0.01 $1,480.00 $1,480.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00
BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQ YD 20.00 NO BID NQO BID $15.00 $300.00 $86.00 $1,720.00 $125.00 $2,500.00
405A-000 |TACK COAT GAL 534.00 NO BID NO BID $3.20 $1,708.80 $3.45 $1,842.30 $4.00 $2,136.00
ALTERNATIVE 1 TOTAL NO BID $69,208.81 $69,256.70 $83,716.00
Apparent Bid NO BID $69,208.81 $69,256.70 $83,716.00
Lawrence Rd Ext from Gunnison Rd to Lawrence Rd'
. . . AMMONS & BLACKMON MOBILE ASPHALT COMPANY JOHN G. WALTON
Item No. Item Description Units Quantity CONSTRUCTION LLC LLC CONSTRUCTION COMPANY H.O. WEAVER & SONS INC.
Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount
BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER
BC-723 TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 500.00 NO BID NO BID $77.50 $38,750.00 $66.89 $33,445.00 $73.00 $36,500.00
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LS. 1.00 NO BID NO BID $0.01 $0.01 $1,480.00 $1,480.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00
BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQ YD 8.00 NO BID NO BID $15.00 $120.00 $130.00 $1,040.00 $125.00 $1,000.00
405A-000 |TACK COAT GAL 293.00 NO BID NO BID $3.20 $937.60 $3.45 $1,010.85 $4.00 $1,172.00
ALTERNATIVE 1 TOTAL NO BID $39,807.61 $36,975.85 $46,172.00
Apparent Bid NO BID $39,807.61 $36,975.85 $46,172.00

Lawrence Rd from Lawrence Rd Ext to County Rd 48

. ) ) AMMONS & BLACKMON MOBILE ASPHALT COMPANY JOHN G. WALTON —
ars o, Hgyy Descrplicn Onits Quanitity CONSTRUCTION LLC LLC CONSTRUCTION COMPANY | H-O-WEAVER & SONSINC.
Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount
BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER
= i BID NO BID 7 H 2 3 4 ]
BC-723 TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 1000.00 NO $70.50 $70,500.00 $66.89 $66,890.00 $73.00 $73,000.00
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION TON 1.00 NO BID NO BID $0.01 $0.01 $1,590.00 $1,590.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00
BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQ YD 24.00 NO BID NO BID $15.00 $360.00 $78.00 $1,872.00 $125.00 $3,000.00
405A-000 |TACK COAT GAL 587.00 NO BID NO BID $3.20 $1,878.40 $3.45 $2,025.15 $4.00 $2,348.00
ALTERNATIVE 1 TOTAL NO BID $72,738.41 $72,377.15 $87,348.00
Apparent Bid NO BID $72,738.41 $72,377.15 $87,348.00
Red Barn Rd from County Rd 33 to Gunnison Rd
£ = % " AMMONS & BLACKMON MOBILE ASPHALT COMPANY JOHN G. WALTON
ltem No. Item Description Units Quantity CONSTRUCTION LLC LLC CONSTRUCTION COMPANY H.O. WEAVER & SONS INC.
Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount
BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER
& ] NO BID N 4 7,525, E . : y | g
BC-723 TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 475.00 O BID $79.00 $37,5625.00 $66.89 $31,772.75 $73.00 $34,675.00
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION L.S. 1.00 NO BID NO BID $0.01 $0.01 $1,480.00 $1,480.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00
BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQ YD 0.00 NO BID NO BID $15.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $125.00 $0.00
405A-000 |TACK COAT GAL 264.00 NO BID NO BID $3.20 $844.80 $3.45 $910.80 $4.00 $1,056.00
ALTERNATIVE 1 TOTAL NO BID $38,369.81 $34,163.55 $42,731.00
Apparent Bid NO BID $38,369.81 $34,163.55 $42,731.00
Roscoe Rd from Foley Beach Express to Cotton Creek CR i
- : AMMONS & BLACKMON MOBILE ASPHALT COMPANY JOHN G. WALTON
Item No. Item Description Units Quantity CONSTRUCTION LLC LLC CONSTRUCTION COMPANY H.O. WEAVER & SONS INC.
Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount
BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER
5 20. NO BID NO ; 120. ; ; } i
BC-723 TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 1920.00 BID $73.50 $141,120.00 $71.09 $136,492.80 $73.00 $140,160.00
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION L.S. 1.00 NO BID NO BID $0.01 $0.01 $6,865.00 $6,865.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00
BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQ YD 4.00 NO BID NO BID $15.00 $60.00 $277.00 $1,108.00 $300.00 $1,200.00
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER
424B-636 [BINDER LAYER, 1" MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, TON 700.00 NO BID NO BID $79.50 $55,650.00 $60.80 $42,560.00 $77.00 $53,900.00
ESAL RANGE A/B (RATE 220 LBS/SY)
405A-000 |TACK COAT GAL 1127.00 NO BID NO BID $3.20 $3,606.40 $3.45 $3.888.15 $4.00 $4,508.00
ALTERNATIVE 1 TOTAL NO BID $200,436.41 $190,913.85 $207,768.00
Apparent Bid NO BID $200,436.41 $190,913.95 $207,768.00
Alternative 1 Grand Totals:| NO BID | $646,149.81 $604,032.59 | $709,765.25

Alternative 1 - Low Bid:

$604,032.59




Bid #15-41
Baldwin County Resurfacing Projects 2016: Group 2
Resurfacing
BID TABULATION - Page 2

ALTERNATE 2 - County Provides Asphalt and Contractor Provides All other Materials and Lay Down Costs

County Rd 48 1900ft East of AL HWY 181 to County Rd 33

famio Nern Desripfion nits Quanty | AMMONS&BLACKWON [ MOBILEASPHALTCOMPANY [ JOHNGWALTON T, o wepver s sons INC.
Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount
BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER
BC-723 TON { RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 1120.00 $7.48 $8,377.60 $15.50 $17,360.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION L.S. 1.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $0.01 $0.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQ YD 8.85 $80.00 $708.00 $15.00 $132.75 NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER
424B-636 |BINDER LAYER, 1" MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, TON 1968.00 §7.48 $14,720.64 $21,648.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ESAL RANGE A/B (RATE 220 LBS/SY) $11.00
405A-000 |TACK COAT GAL 810.00 $4.27 $3,458.70 $3.20 $2,592.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATIVE 2 CONTRACTOR TOTAL $29,014.94 $41,732.76 NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATIVE 2 WITH COUNTY ASPHALT | $52.80 & $50.95| $188,420.54 |$52.80 & $50.95| $201,138.36 NO BID NO BID
Apparent Bid $188,420.54 $201,138.36 NO BID NO BID
Gunnison Rd from Red Bam Rd to County Rd 33
ftom No. Mo Deseription Units Quantty | AMMONSABLACKMON | MOBLEASPHALTCOMPANY [~ JOHNG.WALTON | 5 weaver s sons c.
Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount
BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER
BC-723 TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 960.00 $7.48 $7,180.80 $15.00 $14,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LS. 1.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $0.01 $0.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQ YD 20.00 $80.00 $1,600.00 $15.00 $300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
405A-000 |TACK COAT GAL 534.00 $4.27 $2,280.18 $3.20 $1,708.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATIVE 2 CONTRACTOR TOTAL $12,810.98 $16,408.81 NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATIVE 2 WITH COUNTY ASPHALT $52.80 $63,498.98 $52.80 $67,096.81 NO BID NO BID
Apparent Bid $63,498.98 $67,096.81 NO BID NO BID
Lawrence Rd Ext from Gunnison Rd to Lawrence Rd
Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount
BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER
BC-723 TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 500.00 $10.89 $5,445.00 $22.50 $11,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION TON 1.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 §0.01 $0.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQ YD 8.00 $80.00 $640.00 $15.00 $120.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
405A-000 |TACK COAT GAL 293.00 $4.27 $1,251.11 $3.20 $937.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATIVE 2 CONTRACTOR TOTAL $9,086.11 $12,307.61 NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATIVE 2 WITH COUNTY ASPHALT $52.80 $35,486.11 $52.80 $38,707.61 NO BID NO BID
Apparent Bid $35,486.11 $38,707.61 NO BID NO BID
Lawrence Rd from Lawrence Rd Ext to County Rd 48
Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount
BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER
BC-723 TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 1000.00 $7.48 $7,480.00 $15.00 $15,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION L.S. 1.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $0.01 $0.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BC-200 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQ YD 24.00 $80.00 $1,920.00 $15.00 $360.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
405A-000 |TACK COAT GAL 587.00 $4.27 $2,506.49 $3.20 $1,878.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATIVE 2 CONTRACTOR TOTAL $13,656.49 $17,238.41 NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATIVE 2 WITH COUNTY ASPHALT $52.80 $66,456.49 $52.80 $70,038.41 NO BID NO BID
Apparent Bid $66,456.49 $70,038.41 NO BID NOQ BID

Red Barn Rd from County Rd 33 to Gunnison Rd

Item No. Item Description Units Quantity AygS:TSRig.:.‘IAO(;Kﬂ%N NOBLE ASPELA(I:‘T LEMPANY CON;‘?:ITC(';I:I:)VI\?]EE::ILANY H.O. WEAVER & SONS INC.
Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount
BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER

BC-723 TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 475.00 $10.89 $5,172.75 $22.50 $10,687.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION L.S. 1.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $0.01 $0.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQ YD 0.00 $80.00 $0.00 $15.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
405A-000 |TACK COAT GAL 264.00 $4.27 $1,127.28 $3.20 $844.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATIVE 2 CONTRACTOR TOTAL $8,050.03 $11,632,31 NO BID NO BID

ALTERNATIVE 2 WITH COUNTY ASPHALT $52.80 $33,130.03 $52.80 $36,612.31 NO BID NO BID

Apparent Bid $33,130.03 $36,612.31 NO BID NO BID

Roscoe Rd from Foley Beach Express to Cotton Creek CR

e : i AMMONS & BLACKMON MOBILE ASPHALT COMPANY JOHN G. WALTON
Item No. Item Description Units Quantity CONSTRUCTION LLC LLC CONSTRUCTION COMPANY H.O. WEAVER & SONS INC.
Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount Unit Price Bid Amount
BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER
BC-723 TON ( RATE 165 LBS/SY ) TON 1920.00 $7.48 $14,361.60 $14.15 $27,168.00 NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION L.S. 1.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $0.01 $0.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BC-900  |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQ YD 4.00 $80.00 $320.00 $15.00 $60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER
424B-636 |BINDER LAYER, 1" MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, TON 700.00 $7.48 $5,236.00 $17,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ESAL RANGE A/B (RATE 220 LBS/SY) $25.00
405A-000 |[TACK COAT GAL 1127.00 $4.27 $4,812.29 $3.20 $3,606.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATIVE 2 CONTRACTOR TOTAL $26,479.89 $48,334.41 NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATIVE 2 WITH COUNTY ASPHALT | $56.10 & $50.40| $169,471.89 |$56.10 & $54.00| $193,846.41 NO BID NO BID
Apparent Bid $169,471.89 $185,375.41 NO BID NO BID
[ Alternative 2 Grand Totals:| $556,464.04 | $598,968.91 NO BID | NO BID
| Alternative 2 - Low Bid:| $556,464.04 i
Addendum 1 Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bid Bond Included Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contract Included Yes Yes Yes Yes

ENGINEER'S CERTIFICATE:

1, J7 NUNNAFLY, P.E., CONSTR
.\ /

/

/Jefé§ Nurnally, P.E. )

Dates”

/TION ENGINEER, HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE IS A TRUE AND CORRECT BID TABULATION FOR THE ABOVE REFERENCED PROJECT AND TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE .
i) //,/ /5




